
Introduced by ________ _ 

ORDINANCE NO -------

AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY OF PASADENA AMENDING PASADENA 
MUNICIPAL CODE TITLE 14 AND ADOPTING TITLE 24 OF THE 
CALIFORNIA CODE OF REGULATIONS INCORPORATING THE 2016 
CALIFORNIA BUILDING CODE AND APPENDIX CHAPTERS C, D, H, I, AND 
J; THE 2016 CALIFORNIA RESIDENTIAL BUILDING CODE AND APPENDIX 
E, G, AND H; THE 2016 CALIFORNIA MECHANICAL CODE; THE 2016 
CALIFORNIA PLUMBING CODE; THE 2016 CALIFORNIA ELECTRICAL 
CODE; THE 2016 CALIFORNIA FIRE CODE; AND THE 2016 CALIFORNIA 
GREEN BUILDINGS STANDARDS CODE 

Whereas the C1ty of Pasadena 1s adoptmg the 2016 ed1t1ons of the Cahforma Bu1ld1ng 
Code, Res1dent1al Bu1ld1ng Code, F1re Code and Green Bu1ldmg Standards Code and 1s 
mak1ng certa1n amendments thereto, and 

Whereas State law requ1res that a c1ty must adopt spec1f1c f1nd1ngs as to the 
topographic, geological, and chmat1c cond1t1ons to JUStify the amendment to these 
codes, 

Now Therefore, the C1ty Counc1l of the C1ty of Pasadena f1nds as follows 

1 W1th respect to the amendments to the state code as set forth 1n Sect1ons 14 04 102, 
110, 115, 258, and 315 below, 

Justification: Topographic and Climatic Pasadena's h1lls1de areas have narrow and 
w1nd1ng access roads, wh1ch makes t1mely response by large f1re suppression vehicles 
d1ff1cult Add1t1onally, long penods of dry, hot weather, comb1ned w1th unpredictable 
seasonal w1nds (Santa Ana wmd cond1t1ons) result 1n Increased exposure to f1re nsk 
These amendments proh1b1t the use of wood as extenor wall and roof covenng matenal 
1n very h1gh, h1gh and moderate f1re hazard areas and requ1re other extenor wall f1mshes 
and roof1ng matenals to have a class A assembly Th1s Will reduce the potential for rapid 
spread of f1re throughout the c1ty dunng penods of strong seasonal w1nds 

2 W1th respect to the amendments to the state codes as set forth 1n Sect1on 14 04 400 
below, 

Justification Climatic: Because of the nsk of delays 1n f1re rescue response t1me due 
to traff1c congest1on and due to the h1gh number of sw1mm1ng pools w1th1n close 
prox1m1ty to small children because of local climate wh1ch makes pool ownership 
desirable, pool barners are necessary Additionally, the amendments correct an 
adm1n1strat1ve error 1n the State's adoption wh1ch Intended to prov1de pool barners The 
amendments are cons1stent w1th barner requirements prev1ously 1n force 1n the C1ty of 
Pasadena 

Ordinance F1nal- Doc# 0000142159C031 
FLR/drc 



----~---=---------,~--=--------- - -- - - ----

3 W1th respect to the amendments to the state codes as set forth 1n Sections 
1404120,130,140,145,147,150,155,160,170,175,180,205,210,215,216,220, 
225, 235, 260, 267, 275, 282, 285, 290, 295, and 305 below, 

Justification: Geologic. Pasadena 1s s1tuated pnmanly on the S1erra Madre fault near 
the base of the San Gabnel Mountarns Other faults near or rn the crty are the Eagle 
Rock fault (ongrnally termed the San Rafael fault), Verdugo Hrlls fault, and Elysran Park 
fault Sard faults are generally consrdered major Southern Cahforn1a earthquake faults 
wh1ch may expenence rupture at any t1me Revrew of damage resulting from the 
January 17, 1994 Northndge Earthquake revealed s1gnrfrcant damage to many bu1ldrngs 
throughout the Southern Cahforn1a reg1on The referenced amendments are necessary 
to rmplement Improved desrgn standards, to use current recogmzed standards and 
referenced recently published, and to reduce the nsk of personal InJury, loss of life and 
property damage wrthrn structures 

4 W1th respect to the amendments to the state code as set forth 1n Sectrons 14 04 165, 
185, 190, 217, 270, and 280 below, 

Justification: Local Climatic and Geological Conditions. The greater Los Angeles 
reg1on IS a densely populated area havrng bu1ld1ngs and structures constructed over and 
near a vast array of fault systems capable of produc1ng major earthquakes, 1nclud1ng 
but not hmrted to the recent 1994 Northndge Earthquake In add1t1on, the reg1on rs w1th1n 
a climate system capable of producrng major w1nds, f1re and ra1n related disasters, 
1ncludrng but not llmrted to those caused by the Santa Ana w1nds and El Nrno (or La 
N1na) subtroprcal-llke weather Thrs reg1on rs especrally susceptible to more act1ve 
term1te and wood attacking 1nsects and m1croorganrsms The proposed modrf1catron to 
prohrb1t the use of wood foundation systems as well as hmrt prescnptrve des1gn 
provrsrons 1n an effort to m1trgate potential problems or def1c1encres due to the 
proliferation of wood-destroying organ1sms and therefore need to be Incorporated 1nto 
the code to assure that new burldrngs and structures and addrtrons or alteratrons to 
ex1st1ng burld1ngs or structures are des1gned and constructed 1n accordance w1th the 
scope and objeCtives of the International Resrdentral Code 

5 W1th respect to the amendments to the state code as set forth rn Sectlons14 04 500, 
501, 502, 504, 506, 508, 510, 512, 514, 516, and 518 below, 

Justification: Local environmental/Climatic Conditions. The greater Los Angeles 
reg1on 1s a densely populated area hav1ng res1dent1al bu1ldmgs constructed w1thrn a 
reg1on where environmental resources are scarce due to vary1ng and occas1onal 
Immoderate temperatures and weather cond1t1ons The proposed mod1f1catron to 
requ1re hrgher eff1c1enc1es of energy usage and greater benef1c1al use of environmental 
matenal Will be ach1eved w1th the proposed expans1on of the Mandatory and Voluntary 
requirements and therefore need to be rncorporated 1nto the code to assure that new 
resrdentral and non-resrdentral burldrngs are desrgned and constructed rn accordance 
wrth the scope and objectrves of the Cahfornra Green Bu1ldrng Standards Code 

Ordinance Fmal- Doc# 0000142159C031 
FLR/drc 

2 



6 W1th respect to the amendments to the state f1re code as set forth 1n sect1on 
14 28 020 1tems 3, 4, 24, 31, 32, 33, 34 and 36 below, the proposed amendments are 
requ1red due to topographic cond1t1ons The rncreased use of decreased property line 
setback development and rncreased development dens1t1es Increase the commun1ty nsk 
from f1re or hazardous matenals spread and the number of persons potentially 
endangered The proposed amendments allow for e1ther 1ncreased rev1ew and 
m1t1gat1on, or decreased hazard to the commumty, or both 

7 W1th respect to the amendments to the state f1re code as set forth 1n sect1on 
14 28 020 1tems 13, 14, 20, 25, and 26 below, the proposed amendments are required 
due to topographic and climatic cond1t1ons Narrow and wmdmg access roads to 
h1lls1de areas, and hot, dry weather and seasonal w1nds result m Increased exposure to 
f1re nsk The Increased use of decreased property hne setback development and 
Increased development dens1t1es 1ncrease the commun1ty nsk from ftre spread and the 
number of persons potentially endangered The proposed amendments allow for e1ther 
rncreased rev1ew and m1ttgatton, or decreased hazard to the commumty through 
Increased use of automat1c f1re ext1ngu1sh1ng systems and/or the decreased use of 
combustible extenor matenals, or both 

8 Wtth respect to the amendments to the state ftre code as set forth 1n sect1on 
14 28 020 1tems 15, and 16 below, the proposed amendments are requ1red due to 
geologic cond1t1ons Pasadena 1s located w1th1n a se1sm1cally act1ve zone and 1s near 
several act1ve fault lines Res1dent1al domestic water supplies are generally not as 
se1sm1cally res1hent as f1re spnnkler systems For example, 1n the event a porcelatn 
f1xture broke 1n an earthquake, a f1re suppression system us1ng a comb1nat1on water 
supply could be compromised, whereas a f1re spnnkler system w1th a ded1cated supply 
could st1ll be funct1onal Thts amendment Increases the surv1vab1hty of f1re spnnkler 
systems The proposed amendments allow for e1ther Increased rev1ew and m1t1gat1on, 
decreased hazard to the commun1ty by allow1ng for hm1ted leakage or other water loss 
1n calculations and d1sallow1ng a more vulnerable type of system, or both 

9 W1th respect to the amendments to the state f1re code as set forth 1n sect1on 
14 28 020 1tems 12 and 19 below, the proposed amendments are requ1red due to 
topographic cond1t1ons The Increased use of decreased property l1ne setback 
development, Increased use of light we1ght construction, Increased 1ntermrngltng of 
hazardous occupancies w1th less hazardous occupancies that have been htstoncally 
separated, and Increased development dens1t1es Increase the commumty nsk from f1re 
spread and other hazardous cond1t1ons and the number of persons potentially 
endangered The proposed amendments allow for the Increased eff1cacy and safety of 
the response to emergencies by ensunng acceptable emergency commun1cat1ons and 
thereby 1mprov1ng the safety of both the commun1ty and emergency responders 

10 W1th respect to the amendments to the state f1re code as set forth 1n section 
14 28 020 1tem 38 below, the proposed amendments are requ1red due to topographic 
cond1t1ons The Increased use of decreased property line setback development, 
Increased use of hght we1ght construction, Increased 1nterm1nghng of hazardous 

Ordmance Fmal- Doc# 0000142159C031 
FLR/drc 

3 



occupancies w1th less hazardous occupanc1es that have been h1stoncally separated, 
and Increased development dens1t1es mcrease the community nsk from f1re spread and 
other hazardous cond1t1ons and the number of persons potentially endangered Th1s 
amendment Increases public and f1ref1ghter safety by mcreas1ng the likelihood that 
automatic f1re ext1ngu1sh1ng systems Will have suff1c1ent water flow capac1ty to conta1n or 
ext1ngu1sh s1gn1f1cant f1res before the f1re extends to adjacent areas or structures 

11 W1th respect to the amendments to the state f1re code as set forth 1n sect1on 
14 28 020 1tem 15 below, the proposed amendment 1s requ1red due to geologic 
cond1t1ons Due to the C1ty's s1gn1f1cant use of groundwater, f1re suppress1on systems 
expenence an Increased rate of m1neral depos1t1on due to dissolved m1nerals 1n the 
groundwater Th1s amendment m1t1gates the potential decrease 1n water flow caused by 
m~neral depos1t1on 

12 W1th respect to the amendment to the state f1re code as set forth 1n sect1on 
14 28 020 1tems 17, 18 and 21 below, the proposed amendments are reqUired due to 
topographic cond1t1ons The Increased use of decreased property line setback 
development and Increased development dens1t1es 1ncrease the commumty nsk from 
f1re spread and Increase the number of persons potentially endangered, and hm1ts the 
space available 1n wh1ch emergency responders may operate effectively Early and 
effective evacuat1on of bu1ld1ng occupants Increases the eff1cacy of f1re attack and 
decreases the nsk of f1re spread The proposed amendments allow for e1ther Increased 
rev1ew and m1t1gat1on, or decreased hazard to the commumty, or both 

13 W1th respect to the amendment to the state f1re code as set forth 1n section 
14 28 020 1tem 30 below, the proposed amendments are requ1red due to topographic 
cond1t1ons The Increased use of decreased property line setback development 
Increases the commun1ty nsk from f1re spread Smaller flammable and combustible 
liqUid tanks are allowed by code to be placed relatively close to bUildings and property 
lines The 1nstallat1on of overfill prevention decreases the likelihood that spills dunng the 
f1lhng process Will endanger structures on the same or adjacent propert1es 

14 W1th respect to the amendment to the state f1re code as set forth 1n sectton 
14 28 020 1tem 25 below, the proposed amendments are reqUired due to topographic 
conditions The Increased use of decreased property hne setback development 
Increases the commun1ty nsk from f1re spread Smaller flammable and combustible 
liqUid tanks are allowed by code to be placed relatively close to bu1ld1ngs and property 
lines Allow1ng the emergency vent1ng of flammable and combustible vapors w1th1n 
vaults greatly Increases the likelihood of vapor explosions w1th1n the vault Allow1ng the 
use of long-bolt manhole covers as a means of emergency vent1ng creates a hazard to 
anyone nearby the manhole should an emergency release occur w1thout warn1ng 
D1sallow1ng the pract1ces of 1n-vault vent1ng and the use of long-bolt manhole covers 
Increases the pubhc safety by requ1nng venting to occur at a safe locatton 

15 For sect1ons not spec1f1ed above, no express f1nd1ngs are reqUired under the 
requirements established by sect1ons 17958, 17958 5, and 17958 7 of the California 

Ordmance Fmal- Doc# 0000142159C031 
FLR/drc 

4 



Health and Safety Code as these amendments are adm1n1strat1ve 1n nature, merely 
prov1de clanf1cat1on of ex1st1ng Callforma Code requirement, or address matters outs1de 
the scope of the above sect1ons J 

Accordingly, the People of the C1ty of Pasadena ordain as follows 

SECTION 1. Th1s ordmance, due to 1ts length and corresponding pubhcat1on cost Will 
be published by t1tle and summary as permitted by Sect1on 508 of the Charter of the 
C1ty of Pasadena The approved summary of th1s ordinance 1s as follows 

"Summary 

Ordinance No The ord1nance adopts the 2016 Cahforma BUilding Code, the 
2016 Cahforma Res1dent1al Code, the 2016 Cahforma Mechanrcal Code, the 2016 
Cahforma Plumbing Code, the 2016 California Electncal Code, the 2016 California F1re 
Code and the 2016 Cahforn1a Green BUJid1ng Standards Code as requ1red by state law 
The ordinance also provides for some amendments to these codes to accommodate 
spec1al topographic, geological, and climatic cond1t1ons found 1n Pasadena cons1stent 
w1th state law Ordmance No __ shall take effect 30 days after 1ts pubhcat1on by t1tle 
and summary The full text of the ord1nance IS on f1le 1n the C1ty Clerk's Off1ce " 

SECTION 2. T1tle 14, Chapter 14 03 of the Pasadena Mun1c1pal Code 1s 
amended as follows 

14.03.010 • Adoption and filing 

Except as herem prov1ded by spec1f1c changes, the adm1mstrat1ve, orgamzat1onal and 
enforcement for the tech meal codes wh1ch regulate the s1te preparation and 
construction, alteration, mov1ng, demoht1on, repair, use and occupancy of bu1ld1ngs, 
structures and bu1ld1ng serv1ce equipment w1th1n the c1ty shall be 1n accordance w1th the 
prov1s1ons and 1n the manner prescnbed 1n adm1n1strat1ve prov1s1ons of the 2016 Ed1t1on 
of the Cahforma Bu1ldmg Code, as published by the Cahforn1a State Bu1ld1ng Standards 
Comm1ss1on 

14.03.020 • Section 101.1 of Chapter 1 Division II of the 2016 California 
Building Code amended Title. 

Th1s ordmance shall be known and c1ted as the Pasadena BUJid1ng Code for BUilding 
Construction Regulation, and w11l be referred to here1n as th1s Code 

14.03.030 • Chapter 1 Division II Section 103.1 of the 2016 California Building 
Code, creation of enforcement agency is amended as follows: 

Ord1nance Fmal- Doc# 0000142159C031 
FLR/drc 

5 



There has been established heretofore 1n th1s junsd1ct1on a code enforcement agency 
ent1tled, The Planmng and Commun1ty Development Department wh1ch employs a 
Bu1ld1ng Off1c1al who shall be authonzed to enforce the prov1s1ons of th1s code 

SECTION 3. T1tle 14, Chapter 14 04 of the Pasadena Mun1c1pal Code 1s amended as 
follows 

14.04.010 - Adoption and filing. 

California BU1Id1ng Codes adopted California Code of Regulation T1tle 24 part 1-12 The 
2016 Callforma BUilding Code Chapters 1-35 and Appendix Chapters C, D, H, I, and J, 
the 2016 California Res1dent1al Code Appendix Chapters E, H, J, and V, the 2016 
California Green Bu1ld1ng Standards Code, the 2016 Callforma Electncal Code, The 
2016 California Mechanical Code, the 2016 California Plumb1ng Code, and 2016 
California F1re Code all as published by the California Bu1ld1ng Standards Comm1ss1on 
and as amended by the State Department of Hous1ng And Commumty Development 
(HCD), the D1v1s1on of the State Architect/Access and Compliance (DSA/AC), and the 
State Off1ce of Statew1de Health, Planmng and Development (OSHPD), The Off1ce of 
the State F1re Marshal (SFM) all as published by the International Code Council One 
copy of all of the above publications 1s on f1le for public 1nspect1on and 1s hereby 
adopted w1th the same force and effect as though set out here1n 1n full 

8 By amend1ng Section 14 04 015 to read as follows 

14.04.015 - Section 105.2.1 is added to Chapter 1 Division II Section 105.2 of the 
2016 California Building Code to read as follows: 

A zon1ng perm1t may be requ1red for 1tems exempted from bu1ld1ng perm1t reqUirements 
under Chapter 1 D1v1s1on II Sect1on 1 05 2 Exempted work shall not VIolate any 
prov1s1ons of this code, Federal, State, Local laws, or regulations 

C By adding Section 14 04 020 to read as follows 

14.04.020- Section 105.5 of the 2016 California Building Code and Section R1 05.5 
of the 2016 California Residential Building Code is amended to read as follows: 

Expiration Beg1nmng January 1, 2017, every perm1t 1ssued by the Building Off1c1al 
under the prov1s1ons of th1s Code shall exp1re by llm1tat1on and become null and vo1d 1f 
all work by sa1d permit 1s not completed w1th1n the t1me llm1ts spec1f1ed below from the 
date of 1ssuance of the bUilding permit 

Construction Type 
S1ngle-Fam1ly or Duplex 
Multiple Family (3+ umts) 

Ordinance F1nal- Doc# 0000142159C031 
FLR/drc 

Project Completion Time 
24 months 
36 months 

6 



I Non-res1dent1al 36 months 

a Before such work can be recommenced, a perm1t extens1on, as spec1f1ed 
1n Subsection A, shall be f1rst obta1ned No perm1t shall be extended more 
than tw1ce 

b T1me hm1ts w1ll not be Increased by 1ssuance of subsequent bUJid1ng 
perm1ts for the same project 

c When a project 1s d1v1ded mto separate perm1ts by the applicant, the work 
on such perm1ts IS to be done concurrently, the t1me allowed to complete 
all work on each separate perm1t shall be established from the 1n1t1al 
perm1t Issuance date 

A Extensions and Fees. 

a Any perm1ttee hold1ng an act1ve perm1t may apply 1n wnt1ng for an 
extens1on of the t1me w1th1n wh1ch work under that permit may be 
cont1nued when, for good and satisfactory reasons, he or she IS unable to 
cont1nue work w1th1n the t1me reqUired by th1s sect1on due to 
Circumstances beyond the control of the perm1ttee The wntten request 
must demonstrate that 

1 Due to circumstances beyond the owner's or permittee's control, 
construction could not be commenced, cont1nued or completed 1n 
the authonzed t1me penod, 

11 If the construction has started, substantial progress has been 
made, 

111 The cond1t1on of the property presents no health or safety hazard, 
and, 

IV The contmued delay Will not create any unreasonable aesthetic 
1m pact to the neighborhood or substantial econom1c detnment to 
the ne1ghbonng property owners 

b The BUJidmg Off1c1al may extend the t1me for act1on by the perm1ttee for a 
penod not exceed1ng s1x calendar months Payment of the bUJid1ng perm1t 
extension fee shall be requ1red The extens1on fee shall be calculated as 
the greater of two percent (2%) of the est1mated total proJect valuation or 
one-thousand dollars 

c Bu1ld1ng perm1ts shall not be extended more than tw1ce, and each 
extens1on shall not exceed s1x months 

B Appeals. If the property owner feels aggneved by the determmat1on of the 
BUJidmg Off1c1al regarding the applicable t1me hm1t or by the den1al of an 
add1t1onal s1x-month extension, the property owner may appeal to the Code 
Compliance Heanng O'ff1cer w1th1n ten days of the Bu1ldmg Off1c1al's dec1s1on 
The appellant shall pay a heanng appeal fee at the t1me of f1hng an appeal 1n an 
amount as shall be established from tJme to t1me by resolution of the C1ty 
Council The Code Compliance Heanng Off1cer shall not1fy the appellant 1n 

Ord1nance F~nal- Doc# 0000142159C031 
FLR/drc 

7 



wnt1ng of the date of the heanng on the appeal, and such not1ce shall be sent at 
least ten days before the date of the heanng, wh1ch shall be held no later than 
th1rty days after the f1hng of the appeal 

D By add1ng Sect1on 14 04 022 to read as follows 

14.04.022 Posting of Construction Signs. 

Except for s~ngle-fam1ly construction 1nvolv1ng only m1nor 1ntenor remodel, m1nor 
bUilding perm1ts, w1ndow change outs, re-roofs or other mmor bu1ld1ng perm1ts, 
one s1gn, VISible from the street, must be posted llstmg project address, perm1t 
number, work descnpt1on, name of Construction Company, contact name of 
Construction Company and phone number and/or 1f owner-bUilder contact name 
and phone number of owner The s1gn shall also hst the C1ty's allowable 
construction hours and days pursuant to Pasadena Mun1c1pal Code Sect1on 
9 36 070, and clearly 1dent1fy the perm1t exp1rat1on date Sa1d s1gn shall be wh1te 1n 
color as background and a m1mmum s1ze of 24" 1n he1ght by 36" m w1dth w1th 1" 
h1gh leg1ble black lettenng Post1ng of the requ1red s1gn 1s the respons1b1llty of the 
permittee, and such s1gn shall be posted and ma1nta1ned at the construct1on s1te 
where 1t can be read by the public Th1s not1ce must be posted pnor to the start of 
construction and displaced contmuously unt1l all perm1tted work 1s Inspected and 
approved by C1ty of Pasadena Bulld1ng & Safety DIVISIOn S1gn to be venf1ed by 
the C1ty upon the f1rst 1nspect1on S1gns shall be replaced 1f damaged, torn, faded, 
or 1f the reqUired 1nformat1on IS 1lleg1ble, as determined by the Bu1ld1ng Off1c1al 

E By addmg Sect1on 14 04 024 to read as follows 

14.04.024 Construction Site Fencing. 

Whenever a bu1ldmg perm1t 1s Issued to construct, add to or alter a bU1ld1ng or s1te, 
the bUJid1ng off1c1al may reqUire temporary pen meter fenc1ng to be Installed and to 
be ma1nta1ned 1n good cond1t1on 

The mstallat1on of temporary fenc1ng shall be reqUired for the followmg projects 

1 Projects mvolve grad1ng, trenching or excavation act1v1t1es, 
2 The construction area IS v1s1ble from the public nght-of-way w1th the exception of 

roof replacement, w1ndow change-outs w1th no fram1ng work 
3 There 1s outs1de storage of bU1Id1ng matenals, equipment, construction matenals 

or equ1pment stored at the front of the property 
4 The property 1s vacant dunng the durat1on of the construction 
5 As determined by the Bu1ldmg Off1c1al 

The BUIIdmg Off1c1al shall reqUire the s1te to be temporanly fenced and screened 
on all s1des for the durat1on of the construction project The height of the fence 
shall be seventy-two Inches (72) h1gh w1th gates to access the s1te The 
screen1ng matenal shall be t1ghtly secured to the fencing, free of holes and 

Ordmance Fmal- Doc# 0000142159C031 
FLR/drc 

8 



w1thout advert1s1ng The penmeter fenc1ng may be removed when there are no 
remaining extenor construction act1v1t1es VISible from the pubhc nght-of-way and 
there 1s no longer v1s1ble outs1de storage of bUilding matenals, eqUipment or 
fixtures or as determined by the 8UJid1ng Off1c1al An address s1gn shall be 
Installed and be v1s1ble from public nght of way at all pen meter pomts to 1nclude 
the street name and number of the s1te us1ng m1mmum s1x-1nch h1gh letters and 
numbers, and shall be posted at the top of the pen meter fence or at least f1ve 
feet from the ground A "No Trespassing" s1gn, conforming to the reqUirements 
of Cahforma Penal Code, Sect1on 602, shall be Installed at all penmeter access 
po1nts, posted at the top of the pen meter fence or at least f1ve feet from the 
ground 

F By amending Sect1on 14 04 030 to read as follows 

14.04.030 Violations. 

All sect1ons 1n the 2016 codes referenced 1n Sect1on 14 04 010 herem pertamtng to 
v1olat1ons are amended 1n the1r ent1rety to read as follows 

It shall be unlawful for any person, f1rm or corporation to erect, construct, enlarge, alter, 
repa1r, move, 1m prove, remove, convert, or demolish, equ1p, use, occupy, or ma1nta1n 
any bUJid1ng or structure 1n the C1ty, or cause same to be done, contrary to or 1n v1olat1on 
of any of the prov1s1ons of th1s chapter Any person, f1rm, or corporation v1olat1ng any of 
the prov1s1ons of th1s Ordinance, shall be deemed gUJity of a misdemeanor, and each 
such person shall be deemed gu1lty of a separate offense for each and every day or 
port1on thereof dunng wh1ch any v1olat1on of any of the prov1s1ons of th1s Ordinance 1s 
comm1tted, continued, or perm1tted, and upon conv1ct1on of any such vrolatron such 
persons shall be pun1shed by a f1ne of not more than one thousand dollars ($1 ,000) or 
double the perm1t fee whichever 1s greater or by 1mpnsonment for not more than one ( 1) 
year, or by both such ftne and 1mpnsonment 

In add1t1on to the above penalty prov1s1ons, v1olat1on of any of the prov1s1ons of th1s 
chapter may be subject to the adm1n1strat1ve proceedings set forth 1n Chapter 1 25 of 
th1s code 

G By amend1ng Sect1on 14 04 040 to read as follows 

14.04.040 Board of appeals. 

All sect1ons 1n the respective 2016 codes perta1nrng to the Board of Appeals are hereby 
amended tn the1r ent1rety to read as follows 

In order to hear and dectde appeals or orders and determtne the sUitability of alternate 
matenals and methods of construction and to prov1de for reasonable 1nterpretat1ons of 
the prov1s1ons of these Codes, there shall be and there IS hereby created a Board of 
Appeals, composed of the Mayor and the Crty Council 

Ord1nance Fmal- Doc# 0000142159C031 
FLR/drc 

9 



The c1ty clerk shall be the secretary to the Board The Board may adopt reasonable 
rules and regulations for conducting 1ts 1nvest1gat1ons and shall render all 1ts dec1s1ons 
and frndrngs on contested matters, 1n wnt1ng to the bu1ld1ng off1c1al, w1th a duplicate copy 
thereof to any appellant or contestant affected by any such dec1s1on of f1nd1ngs, and 
may recommend to the C1ty Council such new legislation, 1f any, as IS consistent 
therewith 

The C1ty Council may prescnbe by resolution, to employ at the cost and expense of the 
C1ty, such quahf1ed rnd1v1duals as the Board, rn 1ts d1scret1on, may deem reasonably 
necessary 1n order to ass1st 1t 1n 1ts mvest1gat1ons and 1n mak1ng 1ts fmd1ngs and 
deCISIOnS 

H By amend1ng Section 14 04 050 to read as follows 

14.04.050 Fees. 

The council shall by resolut1on adopt a schedule of fees for the perm1ts 1ssued pursuant 
to the 2016 codes referenced 1n Sect1on 14 04 010 and as amended here1n 

I By amend1ng Section 14 04 080 to read as follows 

14.04.080 Moved building. 

Sect1on 409 of Part 10 of the 2016 California Bu1ld1ng Code 1s amended by add1ng the 
follow1ng 

Before a perm1t 1s 1ssued, the bu1ld1ng-mover shall furmsh and f1le w1th the C1ty Clerk, a 
good and suff1c1ent bond 1n the pnnc1pal sum of $5,000 00 1n favor of the C1ty of 
Pasadena for the benefit of any person, f1rm or corporation who may be damaged 
directly by the mov1ng of sa1d bu1ld1ng or structure, provided that any person, f1rm or 
corporation engaged 1n the bus1ness of mov1ng bu1ldmgs may f1le w1th the C1ty Clerk a 
surety bond 1n the sum of $10,000 00 1ndemn1fy1ng the C1ty for the purposes, and 1n that 
event such person, f1rm or corporation need not f1le the $5,000 00 bond here1n above 
requ1red for any srngle mov1ng operat1on 

J By mak1ng amendments to the 2016 Cahforn1a Bu1ld1ng Code by amend1ng 
sect1ons, 14 04102, 14 04 110, 14 04 115, 14 04120, 14 04 130, 14 04140, 
14 04 145, 14 04147, 14 04 150, 14 04 160, 14 04 165, 14 04170, 14 04 175, 
14 04 180, 14 04 185, 14 04 190, 14 04 205, 14 04 210, 14 04 215, 14 04 216, 
14 04 217, 14 04 220, 14 04 225, 14 04 235, 14 04 250, 14 04 258, 14 04 260, 
14 04 265, 14 04 267, 14 04 270, 14 04 275, 14 04 280, 14 04 282, 14 04 285, 
14 04 290, 14 04 295, 14 04 315, 14 04 400, 14 04 500, 14 04 502, 14 05 500, 
14 04 502, 14 40 504, 14 04 506, 14 40 516, 14 40 526, deleting sect1ons 

Ordmance Ftnal- Doc# 0000142159C031 
FLR/drc 

10 



14 04155, 14 04 205, 14 40 305, 14 40 501,14 40 508, 14 40 512,14 40 514, 
14 40518, 14 40 522, and 14 40 524, and add1ng sect1on 14 04 257 as follows 

14.04.100 - Changes and additions to the adopted 2016 codes. 

Pursuant to the Health and Safety Code Sect1ons 17358 5 and 17958 7, the C1ty 
establishes the follow1ng local mod1f1cat1ons The requ1s1te f1ndmgs 1f applicable for such 
requirements are set forth 1n the ord1nance fact sheet accompanymg th1s ordmance 

14.04.102- Section 701A.1 of the 2016 California Building Code is amended to 
read as follows 

Scope Th1s chapter applies to bu1ld1ng matenals, systems and /or assemblies used m 
the extenor des1gn and construction of new bu1ldmgs, add1t1ons and alterations located 
w1th1n a Wildland-Urban Interface F1re Area as defmed 1n Sect1on 702A 

14.04.11 0 - Section 1505.1 of the 2016 California Building Code is amended to 
read as follows: 

General Roof assemblies shall be d1v1ded 1nto the classes def1ned below Class A, and 
8 roof assemblies and roof covenngs requ1red to be listed by th1s sect1on shall be 
tested m accordance w1th ASTM E1 08 or UL 790 In add1t1on, fire-retardant-treated 
wood roof covenngs shall be tested 1n accordance w1th ASTM 0 2898 The m1mmum 
roof covenngs Installed on bu1ldmgs shall comply w1th Table 1505 1 based on the type 
of construction of the bu1ld1ng All roof assemblies and roof covenngs shall be of not 
less than Class 8 No wood roof covenng matenal shall be Installed on any structure 
located 1n the very h1gh, h1gh and moderate f1re hazard zones as 1dentlf1ed by the 
Pasadena Ftre Department 

Exception: Skylights and sloped glaz1ng that comply w1th Chapter 24 or Sect1on 2610 
In the moderate f1re hazard zone, the f1re code off1c1al may, upon a show1ng of good 
cause and necess1ty, approved the use of f1re-res1sttve wood as part of class A listed 
assemblies, and may requ1re add1t1onal m1ttgat1on as warranted, for the repa1r or 
maintenance of ex1st1ng structures 

14.04.115- Section 1505.6 of the 2016 California Building Code is amended to 
read as follows: 

Fire-retardant-treated wood shtngles and shakes Ftre-retardant-treated wood shtngles 
and shakes shall not be Installed m the very h1gh, h1gh and moderate frre zones Fire­
retardant-treated wood shakes and sh1ngles are wood shakes and shingles complymg 
wtth U8C Standard 15-3 or 15-4 wh1ch are Impregnated by the full-cell vacuum­
pressure process w1th fire-retardant chemtcals, and whtch have been quahfted by U8C 
Standard 15-2 for use on Class A, or 8 roofs 

Ordrnance Frnal- Doc# 0000142159C031 
FLR/drc 

11 



Fire-retardant-treated wood shakes and shingles shall comply w1th ICC-ES EG107 and 
w1th the weathenng requirements conta1ned 1n Health and Safety Code Sect1on 
13132 7(J) Each bundle shall bear labels from an ICC accredited quality control agency 
1dent1fy1ng the1r roof-covenng class1f1catJon and 1nd1catmg the1r compliance w1th ICC-ES 
EGI07 and w1th the weathenng reqUirements contained 1n Health and Safety Code 
Sect1on 13132 7(J) 

Health and Safety Code Sect1on 13132 7(J) No wood roof covenng matenals shall be 
sold or applied 1n th1s state unless both of the follow1ng cond1t1ons are met 

( 1) The matenals have been approved and listed by the State F1re Marshal as 
complymg w1th the requirements of th1s sect1on 

(2) The matenals have passed at least f1ve years of the 1 0-year natural weathenng test 
The 1 0-year natural weathenng test requ1red by th1s subd1v1s1on shall be conducted 1n 
accordance w1th standard 15-2 of the 1994 ed1t1on of the Umform BUJid1ng Code at a 
test1ng facility recogn1zed by the State F1re Marshal 

Exception: In the moderate f1re hazard zone, the f1re code official may, upon a showmg 
of good cause and necess1ty, approved the use of f1re-res1stJve wood as part of class A 
listed assemblies, and may requ1re add1t1onal m1t1gat1on as warranted, for the repa1r or 
mamtenance of ex1stmg structures 

14.04.120- Section 1507 of the 2016 California Building Code is amended by 
adding a section 1507.1.1 entitled roof sheathing to read as follows: 

When f1n1sh roof1ng matenal 1s removed to the ex1st1ng open space sheathing, a 
m1mmum of 3/8-mch th1ck plywood sheathing shall be Installed The new sheathing shall 
comply w1th the requirements of the Cahforma BUJid1ng Code The sheathing shall be 
Installed such that the edges align over rafters and 1nd1v1dual spaced sheathing boards 
The sheathing shall be attached to the ex1st1ng spaced sheathing w1th 6d common na1ls 
at 6 1nches (147mm) on center at supported edges and 6d common na1ls at 12 1nches 
(294mm) on center at 1ntermed1ate supports 

14.04.130 - Section1613.5.3 is added to Chapter 16 of the 2016 Edition of the 
California Building Code to read as follows: 

1613 53 ASCE 7, 12 2 3 1, Exception 3 Mod1fy ASCE 7 Sect1on 12 2 3 1 

Exception 3 to read as follows 

3 Detached one and two fam1ly dwellings up to two stones 1n height of light frame 
construction 

14.04.140 - Section 1613.5.4 is added to Chapter 16 of the 2016 California Building 
Code to read as follows: 

Ordrnance Frnal- Doc# 0000142159C031 
FLR/drc 

12 



1613 54 ASCE 7, 12 11 2 2 3 Modrfy ASCE 7 Sectron 12 11 2 2 3 to read as follows 

12 11 2 2 3 Wood Draphragms In wood draphragms, the contrnuous tres shall be 1n 
addrtron to the draphragm sheathrng Anchorage shall not be accomplished by use of 
toe naris or naris subject to wrthdrawal nor shall wood ledgers or framrng be used 1n 
cross-grarn bendrng or cross-gram tensron The draphragm sheathrng shall not be 
consrdered effectrve as provrdrng tres or struts requrred by thrs sectron 

For structures assrgned to Sersmrc Desrgn Category D, E or F, wood draphragms 
supportrng concrete or masonry walls shall comply wrth the followrng 

1 The spacrng of contmuous tres shall not exceed 40 feet Added chords of 
draphragms may be used to form subdraphragms to transmrt the anchorage forces to 
the marn contrnuous crosstres 

2 The maxrmum draphragm shear used to determrne the depth of the 
subdraphragm shall not exceed 75% of the maxrmum draphragm shear 

14.04.145- Section 1704.6 of the 2016 California Building Code is amended to 
read as follows: 

Section 1704.6 Structural Observations. Where requrred by the provrsrons of Sectron 
1704 6 1 or 1704 6 2, the owner or the owner's authonzed agent shall employ a 
regrstered desrgn professrons as a structural observer to perform structural 
observatrons Structural observation does not Include or wa1ve the responsrb1hty for the 
rnspectrons rn Sect1on 11 0 or the specral 1nspect1ons rn Sectron 1705 or other sectron of 
thrs code The structural observer shall be one of the followrng rndrvrduals 

1 The regrstered desrgn professronal responsrble for the structural desrgn, or 
2 A regrstered desrgn professronal desrgnated by the regrstered des1gn professronal 

responsrble for the structural desrgn 

Pnor to the commencement of observatrons, the structural observer shall submit to the 
burldrng offrcral a wntten statement rdentrfyrng the frequency and extent of structural 
observatrons 

The owner or owner's authonzed agent shall coordrnate and call a preconstruct1on 
meetrng between the structural observer, contractors, affected subcontractors and 
specral Inspectors The structural observer shall pres1de over the meet1ng The purpose 
of the meetrng shall be to 1dentrfy the major structural elements and connections that 
affect the vert1cal and lateral load res1strng systems of the structure and to rev1ew 
scheduling of the requ1red observations A record of the meetrng shall be Included 1n the 
report submitted to the Burld1ng Offrcral 

Ordinance F1nal- Doc# 0000142159C031 
FLR/drc 

13 



Observed def1c1enc1es shall be reported 1n wnt1ng to the owner or owner's authonzed 
agent, spec1al Inspector, contractor and the BUJid1ng Off1c1al Upon the form prescnbed 
by the Bu1ld1ng Off1c1al, the structural observer shall subm1t to the Bu1ld1ng Off1c1al a 
wntten statement at each s1gn1f1cant construction stage stat1ng that the s1te v1s1ts have 
been made and 1dent1fy1ng any reported def1c1enc1es wh1ch, to the best of the structural 
observer's knowledge, have not been resolved A f1nal report by the structural observer 
wh1ch states that all observed def1c1enc1es have been resolved 1s reqUJred before 
acceptance of the work by the Bu1ld1ng Off1c1al 

14.04.147- Section 1704.61 of the 2016 California Building Code is amended to 
read as follows. 

1704 6 1 Structural observations for se1sm1c resistance Structural observations shall 
be prov1ded for those structures ass1gned to Se1sm1c Des1gn Category D, E or F, 
where one or more of the following cond1t1ons ex1st 

1 The structure 1s class1f1ed as R1sk Category Ill or IV 1n accordance w1th Table 
1604 5 

2 The he1ght of the structure 1s greater than 75 feet (22860 mm) above the base 

3 The structure, 1s class1f1ed as R1sk Category I or ll1n accordance w1th Table 
1604 5, and lateral des1gn 1s requ1red for the structure or port1on thereof 

Exception: One-story wood framed Group R-3 and Group U Occupanc1es less than 
2,000 square feet 1n area, prov1ded the adJacent grade 1s not steeper than 1 un1t 
vert1cal 1n 10 un1ts honzontal ( 1 Oo/o sloped), ass1gned to Sersm1c Des1gn Category D 

4 When so des1gnated by the reg1stered des1gn professional responsible for the 
structural des1gn 

5 When such observation IS spec1f1cally reqUJred by the building off1c1al 

14.04.150- Section 1705.3 of the 2016 Edition of the California Building Code is 
amended to read as follows 

1705.3 Concrete Construction. Spec1al 1nspect1ons and tests of concrete construction 
shall be performed 1n accordance w1th th1s sect1on and Table 1705 3 

Exceptions: Spec1al1nspect1on and tests shall not be reqUired for 

1 Isolated spread concrete footmgs of bUJid1ngs three stones or less above grade 
plane that are fully supported on earth or rock, where the structural des1gn of the 
foot1ng IS based on a spec1f1ed compressive strength, f'c, no greater than 2,500 
pounds per square mch (ps1) (17 2 Mpa) regardless of the compressive strength 
spec1f1ed 1n the construction documents or used 1n the footmg construction 

Ordinance Fmal- Doc# 0000142159C031 
FLR/drc 

14 



2 Continuous concrete footings supporting walls of bu1ld1ngs three stones or less 
above grade plane that are fully supported on earth or rock where 

2 1 The foot1ngs support walls of light-frame construction, 
2 2 The foot1ngs are destgned 1n accordance w1th Table 1805 4 2, or 
2 3 The structural des1gn of the foot1ng 1s based on a spec1f1ed compressive 
strength, f'c, no greater than 2,500 pounds per square 1nch (ps1) (17 2 Mpa), 
regardless of the compress1ve strength spec1f1ed 1n the construction documents or 
used 1n the foot1ng construction 

3 Nonstructural concrete slabs supported d1rectly on the ground, 1ncludmg 
prestressed slabs on grade, where the effect1ve prestress 1n the concrete 1s less 
than 150 ps1 (1 03 Mpa) 

4 Concrete foundation walls constructed 1n accordance w1th Table 1807 1 6 2 

14.04.160- Exception 3 of Section 1705.12 of the 2016 California Building Code is 
amended to read as follows: 

1705.12 Special inspections for seismic resistance. Spec1al mspect1ons for se1sm1c 
resistance shall be requ1red as spec1f1ed 1n Sect1ons 1705 12 1 through 1705 12 9, 
unless exempted by the except1ons of Sect1on 1704 2 

Exception: The spec1al 1nspect1ons spec1f1ed 1n Sections 1705 12 1 through 1705 12 9 
are not requ1red for structures des1gned and constructed 1n accordance w1th one of the 
following 

1 The structure cons1sts of hght-frame construction, the des1gn spectral response 
acceleration at short penods, Sos, as determined 1n Sect1on 1613 3 4, does not 
exceed 0 5, and the bu1ld1ng he1ght of the structure does not exceed 35 feet ( 10 668 
mm) 

2 The se1sm1c force-res1st1ng system of the structure cons1sts of reinforced 
masonry or reinforced concrete, the des1gn spectral response acceleration at short 
penods, Sos, as determined 1n Sect1on 1613 3 4, does not exceed 0 5, and the 
bu1ldmg he1ght of the structure does not exceed 25 feet (7620 mm) 

3 The structure 1s a detached one- or two-fam1ly dwelling not exceedmg two stones 
above grade plane, 1s not ass1gned to Se1sm1c Des1gn Category D, E or F and does 
not have any of the following honzontal or vert1cal 1rregulantres 1n accordance w1th 
Sect1on 12 3 of ASCE 7 

3 1 Tors1onal or extreme tors1onal1rregulanty 
3 2 Nonparallel systems 1rregulanty 
3 3 Stiffness-soft story or stiffness-extreme soft story 1rregulanty 
3 4 D1scont1nu1ty 1n lateral strength-weak story 1rregulanty 

Ordinance Fmal- Doc# 0000142159C031 
FLR/drc 

15 



14.04.165- Section 1807.1.4 of the 2016 California Building Code is amended to 
read as follows: 

1807.1.4 Permanent wood foundation systems. Permanent wood foundation systems 
shall be des1gned and Installed 1n accordance w1th AF&PA PWF Lumber and plywood 
shall be treated 1n accordance w1th AWPA U1 (Commodity Spec1f1cat1on A, Use 
Category 48 and Sect1on 5 2) and shall be 1dent1f1ed 1n accordance w1th Sect1on 
2303 1 8 1 Permanent wood foundation systems shall not be used for structures 
ass1gned to Se1sm1c Des1gn Category D, E or F 

14.04.170 - Section 1807.1.6 of the 2016 California Building Code is amended to 
read as follows: 

1807.1.6 Prescriptive design of concrete and masonry foundation walls. Concrete 
and masonry foundation walls that are laterally supported at the top and bottom shall be 
permitted to be des1gned and constructed 1n accordance w1th th1s section Prescnpt1ve 
des1gn of foundation walls shall not be used for structures ass1gned to Se1sm1c Des1gn 
Category D, E or F I 

14.04.175- Section 1809.3 of the 2016 California Building Code is amended to 
read as follows: 

1809.3 Stepped footings. The top surface of foot1ngs shall be level The bottom 
surface of foot1ngs shall be permitted to have a slope not exceeding one umt vert1cal 1n 

1 0 umts honzontal ( 1 0-percent slope) Footmgs shall be stepped where 1t 1s necessary 
to change the elevat1on of the top surface of the foot1ng or where the surface of the 
ground slopes more than one un1t vert1cal1n 10 un1ts honzontal (10-percent slope) 

For structures ass1gned to Se1sm1c Des1gn Category D, E or F, the stepping requirement 
shall also apply to the top surface of grade beams supporting walls Foot1ngs shall be 
remforced w1th four 1/2-tnch d1ameter (12 7 mm) deformed retnforc1ng bars Two bars 
shall be place at the top and bottom of the foot1ngs as shown 1n F1gure 1809 3 

Ordinance Fmal- Doc# 0000142159C031 
FLR/drc 

- 16 



ST.EP.PED FOUNDA T'IONS 

FIGURE 1809 3 
STEPPED FOOTING 

Bllll·s 

14.04.180- Section 1809.7 and Table 1809.7 of the 2016 California Building Code 
is amended to read as follows: 

1809.7 Prescriptive footings for light-frame construction. Where a spec1f1c des1gn 1s 
not provided, concrete or masonry-umt footrngs support1ng walls of hght-frame 
construction shall be perm1tted to be des1gned 1n accordance w1th Table 1809 7 
Prescnpt1ve foot1ngs 1n Table 1809 7 shall not exceed one story above grade plane for 
structures ass1gned to Se1sm1c Des1gn Category D, E or F 

TABLE 1809 7 
PRESCRIPTIVE FOOTINGS SUPPORTING WALLS OF 
LIGHT-FRAME CONSTRUCTION a, b, c, d, e 

NUMBER OF 
FLOORS 
SUPPORTED WIDTH OF THICKNESS OF 
BY THE FOOTING FOOTING 
FOOTING f (Inches) (Inches) 
1 12 6 
2 15 6 
3 18 8 

For Sl 1 1nch = 25 4 mm, 1 foot = 304 8 mm 
a) Depth of footings shall be 1n accordance wtth Sectton 1809 4 
b) The ground under the floor shall be permitted to be excavated to the elevatton of 

the top of the footing 
c) Not Adopted 
d) See Sect1on 1908 for add1t1onal reqwrements for concrete foot1ngs of structures 

ass1gned to Se1sm1c Des1gn Category C, D, E or F 

Ordinance Fmal- Doc# 0000142159C031 
FLR/drc 

17 



e) For thrckness of foundatron walls, see Sectron 1807 1 6 
f) Foot~ngs shall be permrtted to support a roof addrtron to the strpulated number of 

floors Footrngs supportrng roof only shall be as reqUired for supporting one floor 

14.04.185 - Section 1809.12 of the 2016 California Building Code is amended to 
read as follows: 

1809.12 Timber footings. Trmber footrngs shall be permrtted for burldrngs of Type V 
construction and as otherwrse approved by the bUilding offrcral Such footings shall be 
treated rn accordance wrth AWPA U1 (Commodity Specrfrcatron A, Use Category 48) 
Treated t1mbers are not requrred where placed ent1rely below permanent water level, or 
where used as capprng for wood pries that project above the water level over 
submerged or marsh lands The compressrve stresses perpendicular to grarn rn 
untreated t1mber foot1ng supported upon treated pries shall not exceed 70 percent of the 
allowable stresses for the specres and grade of trmber as specrfred rn the 
ANSI/AWCNDS Trmberfootrngs shall not be used 1n structures ass1gned to Se1sm1c 
Desrgn Category D, E or F 

14.04.190- Section 1810.3.2.4 of the 2016 California Building Code is amended to 
read as follows: 

1810.3.2.4 Timber. Trmber deep foundatron elements shall be desrgned as pries or 
poles rn accordance wrth ANSIIAWC NOS Round trmber elements shall conform to 
ASTM D 25 Sawn trmber elements shall conform to DOC PS-20 Trmber shall not be 
used rn structures assrgned to Se1smrc Desrgn Category D, E or F 

14.04.210- Section 1905.1.7 of the 2016 California Building Code is amended to 
read as follows: 

1905.1.7 ACI 318, Sectron 14 1 4 Delete ACI 318, Section 14 1 4, and replace wrth the 
followrng 

14 1 4- Plarn concrete tn structures assrgned to Se1smrc Desrgn Category C, D, E 
or F 

14 1 4 1 - Structures assrgned to Sersmrc Desrgn Category C, D, E or F shall not 
have elements of structural platn concrete, except as follows 

Concrete used for frll wrth a mrnrmum cement content of two (2) sacks of Portland 
cement or cementrous matenal per cubrc yard 

(b) Isolated footrngs of plarn concrete supportrng pedestals or columns are 
permitted, provrded the projectron of the footrng beyond the face of the 
supported member does not exceed the foot1ng thrckness 

(c) Pla1n concrete footmgs supporting walls are permitted provided the foot1ngs 
have at least two continuous longrtud1nal remforcrng bars Bars shall not be 

Ordinance F1nal- Doc# 0000142159C031 
FLR/drc 

18 



smaller than No 4 and shall have a total area of not less than 0 002 t1mes the 
gross cross-sect1onal area of the foot1ng A m1mmum of one bar shall be 
provided at the top and bottom of the foot1ng Cont1nu1ty of reinforcement shall 
be provided at corners and 1ntersect1ons 

Exceptions: 

Detached one- and two-fam1ly dwellmgs three stones or less m he1ght and 
constructed w1th stud-beanng walls, are permitted to have plam concrete foot1ngs 
w1th at least two contmuous long1tudmal re1nforc1ng bars not smaller than No 4 are 
permitted to have a total area of less than 0 002 t1mes the gross cross-sect1onal area 
of the foot1ng 

14.04.215- Section 1905.1 is amended and Sections 19.05.1.9 thru 19.5.1.11 are 
added to Chapter 19 of the 2016 California Building Code to read as follows: 

1905.1 General. The text of ACI 318 shall be mod1f1ed as md1cated 1n Sect1ons 1905 1 1 
through 1905 1 11 

1905.1.9 ACI 318, Sect1on 18 7 5 Mod1fy ACI 318, Sect1on 18 7 5, by add1ng Sect1on 
18 7 5 7 and 18 7 5 8 as follows 

18.7.5.7 Where the calculated pomt of contraflexure 1s not w1th1n the m1ddle half 
of the member clear he1ght, prov1de transverse reinforcement as spec1f1ed m ACI 318 
Sections 18 7 5 1, Items (a) through (c), over the full he1ght of the member 

18.7.5.8- At any sect1on where the des1gn strength, <pPn, of the column IS less 
than the sum of the shears Ve computed m accordance w1th ACI 318 Sections 18 7 6 1 
and 18 6 5u 1 for all the beams fram1ng 1nto the column above the level under 
cons1derat1on, transverse remforcement as spec1f1ed 1n ACI 318 Sections 18 7 5 1 
through 18 7 5 3 shall be prov1ded For beams frammg 1nto oppos1te s1des of the 
column, the moment components are permitted to be assumed to be of oppos1te s1gn 
For the determination of the des1gn strength, <pPn, of the column, these moments are 
perm1tted to be assumed to result from the deformation of the frame 1n any one pnnc1pal 
aXIS 

1905.1.10 ACI 318, Sect1on 18 10 4 Mod1fy ACI 318, Sect1on 18 10 4, by add1ng 
Sect1on 18 1 0 4 6 as follows 

18.10.4.6- Walls and port1ons of walls w1th Pu > 0 35P0 shall not be considered 
to contnbute to the calculated shear strength of the structure for res1stmg earthquake­
Induced forces Such walls shall conform to the requirements of ACI 318 Sect1on 18 14 

1905.1.11 ACI 318, Sect1on 18 12 6 Mod1fy ACI318, by add1ng Section 18 12 6 2 as 
follows 

Ordmance Fmal- Doc# 0000142159C031 
" FLR/drc 

19 



18.12.6.2 Collector and boundary elements 1n topp1ng slabs placed over precast 
floor and roof elements shall not be less than 3 1nches (76 mm) or 6 db m thickness, 
where db 1s the d1ameter of the largest reinforcement 1n the topp1ng slab 

14.04.216 - Section 2304.10.1 of the 2016 California Building Code is amended to 
read as follows: 

2304 10 1 Fastener requirements Connections for wood members shall be des1gned m 
accordance w1th the appropnate methodology 1n Sect1on 2301 2 The number and s1ze 
of fasteners connect1ng wood members shall not be less than that set forth 1n Table 
2304 10 1 Staple fasteners m Table 2304 10 1 shall not be used to res1st or transfer 
se1sm1c forces m structures ass1gned to Se1sm1c Des1gn Category D, E or F 

Exception: Staples may be used to res1st or transfer se1sm1c forces when the allowable 
shear values are substantiated by cyclic testmg and approved by the bUilding off1c1al 

14.04.217 - Section 2304.12.5 of the 2016 California Building Code is amended to 
read as follows: 

2304 12 5 Wood used 1n reta1mng walls and cnbs Wood Installed 1n reta1nmg or cnb 
walls shall be preservative treated 1n accordance w1th AWPA U1 for so1l and fresh water 
use Wood shall not be used 1n reta1mng or cnb walls for structures ass1gned to Se1sm1c 
Des1gn Category D, E or F 

14.04.220 - Section 2305.4 is added to Chapter 23 of the 2016 California Building 
Code to read as follows: 

2305 4 Quality of Na1ls In se1sm1c des1gn category D, E or F, mechamcally dnven na1ls 
used 1n wood structural panel shear walls shall meet the same d1mens1ons as that 
requ1red for hand-dnven na1ls, mcludmg d1ameter, m1mmum length and mm1mum head 
d1ameter No clipped head or box na1ls perm1tted 1n new construction The allowable 
des1gn value for clipped head na1ls 1n ex1st1ng construction may be taken at no more 
than the na1l-head-area rat1o of that of the same s1ze hand-dnven na1ls 

14.04.225- Section 2305.5 is added to Chapter 23 of the 2016 California Building 
Code to read as follows: 

2305 5 Hold-down connectors In se1sm1c des1gn category D, E or F, Hold-down 
connectors shall be des1gned to res1st shear wall overturmng moments usmg approved 
cyclic load values or 75 percent of the allowable earthquake load values that do not 
cons1der cyclic load1ng of the product Connector bolts 1nto wood fram1ng requ1re steel 
plate washers on the post on the oppos1te s1de of the anchorage dev1ce Plate s1ze shall 
be a m1mmum of 0 229 1nch by 3 1nches by 3 1nches (5 82 mm by 76 mm by 76 mm) 1n 
s1ze Hold-downs shall be re-tightened JUSt pnor to covenng the wall fram1ng 

14.04.235 - Section 2308.6.5, Figure 2308.6.5.1, and Figure 2308.6.5.2 of the 2016 
California Building Code are amended to read as follows: 

Ordmance Fmal- Doc# 0000142159C031 
FLR/drc 

20 



2308 6 5 Alternative brac1ng An alternate braced wall (ABW) or a portal frame w1th 
hold-downs (PFH) descnbed 1n th1s sect1on IS permitted to substitute for a 48-mch ( 1219 
mm) braced wall panel of Method DWB, WSP, SFB, PBS, PCP or HPS For Method 
GB, each 96-lnch (2438 mm) sect1on (applied to one face) or 48-mch (1219 mm) sect1on 
(applied to both faces) or port1on thereof requ1red by Table 2308 6 1 1s perm1tted to be 
replaced by one panel constructed 1n accordance w1th Method ABW or PFH. 

2308 6 5 1 Alternate braced wall (ABW) An ABW shall be constructed 1n accordance 
w1th th1s sect1on and F1gure 2308 6 5 1 In one-story bUJid1ngs, each panel shall have a 
length of not less than 2 feet 8 Inches (813 mm) and a he1ght of not more than 10 feet 
(3048 mm) Each panel shall be sheathed on one face w1th 3/8-mch (3 2 mm) m1mmum­
th1ckness wood structural panel sheathing na1led w1th 8d common or galvanized box 
na1ls 1n accordance w1th Table 2304 10 1 and blocked at wood structural panel edges 
For structures ass1gned to Se1sm1c Des1gn Category D or E, each panel shall be 
sheathed on one face w1th 15/32-mch-mlmmum-thlckness (11 9 mm) wood structural 
panel sheathing na1led w1th 8d common na1ls spaced 3 1nches on panel edges, 3 Inches 
at 1ntermed1ate supports Two anchor bolts Installed 1n accordance w1th Sect1on 
2308 3 1 shall be provided 1n each panel Anchor bolts shall be placed at each panel 
outs1de quarter pomts Each panel end stud shall have a hold-down dev1ce fastened to 
the foundation, capable of prov1d1ng an approved uplift capac1ty of not less than 1 ,800 
pounds (8006 N) The hold-down dev1ce shall be Installed 1n accordance w1th the 
manufacturer's recommendations The ABW shall be supported directly on a foundation 
or on floor fram1ng supported directly on a foundat1on that IS contmuous across the 
ent1re length of the braced wall line Th1s foundation shall be reinforced w1th not less 
than one No 4 bar top and bottom Where the continuous foundation 1s requ1red to have 
a depth greater than 12 mches (305 mm), a m1mmum 12-mch by 12-mch (305 mm by 
305 mm) contmuous foot1ng 1s permitted at door opemngs 1n the braced wall hne Th1s 
contmuous footmg shall be remforced w1th not less than one No 4 bar top and bottom 
Th1s reinforcement shall be lapped 24 1nches (61 0 mm) w1th the reinforcement requ1red 
1n the contmuous foundation located d1rectly under the braced wall line 

Where the ABW 1s Installed at the f1rst story of two-story bUJidmgs, the wood structural 
panel sheathing shall be prov1ded on both faces, three anchor bolts shall be placed at 
one-quarter pomts and t1e-down dev1ce uplift capac1ty shall be not less than 3,000 
pounds (13 344 N) 

2308 6 5 2 Portal frame w1th hold-downs (PFH) A PFH shall be constructed 1n 

accordance w1th th1s section and F1gure 230~ 6 5 2 The adjacent door or w1ndow 
opemng shall have a full-length header 

In one-story bUJidmgs, each panel shall have a length of not less than 16 Inches (406 
mm) and a he1ght of not more than 10 feet (3048 mm) Each panel shall be sheathed on 
one face w1th a s1ngle layer of 3/8-lnch (9 5 mm) m1mmum-th1ckness wood structural 
panel sheathing na1led w1th 8d common or galvamzed box na1ls 1n accordance w1th 
F1gure 2308 6 5 2 For structures ass1gned to Se1sm1c Des1gn Category D or E, each 
panel shall be sheathed on one face w1th 15/32-lnch-mlmmum-thlckness (11 9 mm) 

Ordinance F1nal- Doc# 0000142159C031 
FLR/drc 

21 



wood structural panel sheathing na1led w1th 8d common na1ls spaced 3 1nches on panel 
edges, 3 1nches at 1ntermed1ate supports and 1n accordance w1th F1gure 2308 6 5 2 The 
wood structural panel sheathing shall extend up over the solid sawn or glued-laminated 
header and shall be na1led 1n accordance w1th F1gure 2308 6 5 2 A bu1lt-up header 
cons1st1ng of at least two 2-lnch by 12-1nch (51 mm by 305 mm) boards, fastened 1n 
accordance w1th Item 24 of Table 2304 1 0 1 shall be permitted to be used A spacer, 1f 
used, shall be placed on the s1de of the bu1lt-up beam oppos1te the wood structural 
panel sheathing The header shall extend between the 1ns1de faces of the f1rst full-length 
outer studs of each panel The clear span of the header between the 1nner studs of 
each panel shall be not less than 6 feet (1829 mm) and not more than 18 feet (5486 
mm) 1n length A strap w1th an uplift capac1ty of not less than 1,000 pounds (4,400 N) 
shall fasten the header to the 1nner studs oppos1te the sheathing One anchor bolt not 
less than 5/8 Inch (15 9 mm) diameter and Installed 1n accordance w1th Sect1on 
2308 3 1 shall be prov1ded 1n the center of each s1ll plate The studs at each end of the 
panel shall have a hold-down dev1ce fastened to the foundation w1th an uplift capac1ty of 
not less than 3,500 pounds (15 570 N) 

Where a panel 1s located on one s1de of the opemng, the header shall extend between 
the 1ns1de face of the f1rst full-length stud of the panel and the beanng studs at the other 
end of the opemng A strap w1th an uplift capac1ty of not less than 1 ,000 pounds ( 4400 
N) shall fasten the header to the beanng studs The beanng studs shall also have a 
hold-down dev1ce fastened to the foundation w1th an uplift capac1ty of not less than 
1 ,000 pounds ( 4400 N) The hold-down dev1ces shall be an embedded strap type, 
Installed 1n accordance w1th the manufacturer's recommendations The PFH panels 
shall be supported directly on a foundation that 1s cont1nuous across the ent1re length of 
the braced wall line Th1s foundation shall be reinforced w1th not less than one No 4 bar 
top and bottom Where the continuous foundation 1s requ1red to have a depth greater 
than 12 1nches (305 mm), a m1n1mum 12-~nch by 12-lnch (305 mm by 305 mm) 
continuous foot1ng 1s perm1tted at door opemngs 1n the braced wall line Th1s cont1nuous 
foot1ng shall be reinforced w1th not less than one No 4 bar top and bottom Th1s 
reinforcement shall be lapped not less than 24 1nches (61 0 mm) w1th the reinforcement 
requ1red 1n the continuous foundation located directly under the braced wall hne 

Where a PFH 1s Installed at the f1rst story of two-story bUJid1ngs, each panel shall have a 
length of not less than 24 Inches (61 0 mm) 

*Note For f1gure 2308 6 51 and 2308 6 52, structures ass1gned to Se1sm1c Category D 
or E, sheathed on one face w1th 15/32 1nch-m1mmum thickness wood structural panel 
sheathing na1led w1th 8d common na1ls spaced 6 1nches on panel edges, 12 Inches at 
1ntermed1ate supports 

14.04.250 - Section 2308.6.9 of the 2016 California Building Code is amended to 
read as fol~ows: 

2308 6 9 Attachment of sheathing Fastemng of braced wall panel sheathing shall not 
be less than that prescnbed 1n Table 2308 6 1 or 2304 10 1 Wall sheathing shall not be 
attached to fram1ng members by adhes1ves Staple fasteners 1n Table 2304 9 1 shall 

Ordmance Final- Doc# 0000142159C031 
FLR/drc 

22 



not be used to res1st or transfer se1sm1c forces 1n structure~ ass1gned to Se1sm1c Des1gn 
Category D, E or F 

Exception: Staples may be used to res1st or transfer se1sm1c forces when the allowable 
shear values are substantiated by cyclic test1ng and approved by the bu1ld1ng off1c1al 

All braced wall panels shall extend to the roof sheathing and shall be attached to 
parallel roof rafters or block1ng above w1th fram1ng clips (18 gauge m1mmum) spaced at 
max1mum 24 1nches (6096 mm) on center w1th four 8d na1ls per leg (total e1ght 8d na1ls 
per clip) Braced wall panels shall be laterally braced at each top corner and at 
max1mum 24 1nches (6096 mm) Intervals along the top plate of d1scont1nuous vert1cal 
fram1ng 

14.04.257- Section 3109.4.4.2.1 is added to the 2016 California Building Code to 
read as follows: 

Fences requ1red In add1t1on to the requirements 1n the California Bu1ld1ng Code, a 
barner 1n compliance w1th sect1on 3109 4 4 3 of the CBC 1s requ1red to Isolate the pool 
or any other bod1es of water over 18 1nches deep from ne1ghbonng properties and 
pubhc ways 

Exception: When the sw1mm1ng pool or any other bod1es of water over 18 Inches deep 
1s fully enclosed around 1ts penmeter by an enclosure comply1ng to Callforma Bu1ld1ng 
Code Section 3109 4 4 3 

14.04.258 - Section 8-408 of the 2016 California Historical Building Code is 
amended by adding the following: 

4 The use of wood on the extenor s1de of extenor walls shall be proh1b1ted 1n the 
Extreme, h1gh and moderate f1re hazard seventy zones as 1dent1f1ed by the 
Pasadena F1re Department 

Exception: In the moderate f1re hazard seventy zone, the f1re code off1c1al may, upon a 
show1ng of good cause and necess1ty, approved the use of f1re-res1st1ve wood as part of 
class A listed assemblies, and may requ1re add1t1onal m1t1gat1on as warranted, for the 
repa1r or maintenance of ex1st1ng structures 

14.04.260 - Section R301.1.3.2 of the 2016 California Residential Code is amended 
to read as follows: 

R301 1 3 2 Woodframe structures The bu1ld1ng off1c1al shall requ1re construction 
documents to be approved and stamped by a Callforma licensed architect or eng1neer 
for all dwellings of woodframe construction more than two stones and basement 1n 
height located 1n Se1sm1c Des1gn Category A, B or C Notw1thstand1ng other sect1ons the 
law, the law estabhsh1ng these prov1s1ons 1s found 1n Bus1ness and Professions Code 
Section 5537 and 6737 1 

Ordrnance Frnal- Doc# 0000142159C031 
FLR!drc 

23 



The bu1ld1ng off1c1al shall requ1re construction documents to be approved and stamped 
by a Callforma licensed architect or eng1neer for all dwell1ngs of woodframe construction 
more than one story 1n height located 1n Se1sm1c Des1gn Category DO, D1, D2 or E 

14.04.265 - Section R301.1.4 is added to Chapter 3 of the 2016 California 
Residential Code to read as follows: 

R301 1 4 Se1sm1c des1gn prov1s1ons for bUildings constructed on or 1nto slopes steeper 
than one un1t vert1cal 1n three umts honzontal (33 3 percent slope) The des1gn and 
construction of new bu1ld1ngs and add1t1ons to ex1st1ng bUildings when constructed on or 
1nto slopes steeper than one umt vert1cal 1n three un1ts honzontal (33 3 percent slope) 
shall comply w1th Section 1613 9 of the California Building Code 

14.04.267 - Section R301.2.2.3.8 is added to Chapter 3 of the 2016 California 
Residential Code to read as follows: 

R301 2 2 3 8 Anchorage of Mechanical, Electncal, or Plumbing Components and 
EqUipment Mechanical, electncal, or plumbing components and equ1pment shall be 
anchored to the structure Anchorage of the components and equipment shall be 
des1gned to res1st loads 1n accordance w1th the Callforma Bu1ld1ng Code and ASCE 7, 
except where the component IS pos1t1vely attached to the structure and flexible 
connect1ons are prov1ded between the component and associated ductwork, p1p1ng, and 
condUit, and e1ther 

1 The component we1ghs 400 lb ( 1, 780 N) or less and has a center of mass 
located 4ft (1 22m) or less above the support1ng structure, or 

2 The component we1ghs 20 lb (89N) or less or, 1n the case of a d1stnbuted system, 
5 lb/ft (73 N/m) or less 

Section 14.04.270- Section R401.1 of the 2016 California Residential Code is 
amended to read as follows: 

R401 1 Application The prov1s1ons of th1s chapter shall control the des1gn and 
construction of the foundation and foundation spaces for bUildings In add1t1on to the 
prov1s1ons of th1s chapter, the des1gn and construction of foundations 1n flood hazard 
areas as established by Table R301 2(1) shall meet the prov1s1ons of Sect1on R322 
Wood foundations shall be des1gned and Installed 1n accordance w1th AWC PWF 

Exception: The prov1s1ons of th1s chapter shall be perm1tted to be used for wood 
foundations only 1n the following s1tuat1ons 

1 In bu11d1ngs that have no more than two floors and a roof 

2 When 1ntenor basement and foundation walls are constructed at Intervals not 
exceed1ng 50 feet (15 240 mm) 

Ordmance F1nal- Doc# 0000142159C031 
FLR/drc 

24 



Wood foundations 1n Se1sm1c Des1gn Category Do, D1 or D2 shall not be permitted 

Exception: In non-occup1ed, s1ngle-story, detached storage sheds and s1m1lar uses 
other than carport or garage, provided the gross floor area does not exceed 200 square 
feet, the plate he1ght does not exceed 12 feet 1n he1ght above the grade plane at any 
po1nt, and the max1mum roof proJection does not exceed 24 1nches 

14.04.275 - Sections R403.1.2, R403.1.3.6, R403.1.5 of the 2016 California 
Residential Code are amended to read as follows: 

R403 1 2 Cont1nuous foot1ng 1n Se1sm1c Des1gn Categones Do, D1 and D2 Extenor walls 
of bu1ld1ngs located 1n Se1sm1c Des1gn Categones Do, D1 and D2 shall be supported by 
continuous solid or fully grouted masonry or concrete foot1ngs All requ1red 1ntenor 
braced wall panels 1n bu1ld1ngs located 1n Se1sm1c Des1gn Categones Do, D1 and D2 
shall be supported on continuous foundations 

R403 1 3 6 Isolated concrete foot1ngs In detached one- and two-fam1ly dwellings that 
are three stones or less 1n he1ght and constructed w1th stud beanng walls, Isolated plain 
concrete foot1ngs support1ng columns or pedestals are perm1tted 

R403 1 5 Slope The top surface of foot1ngs shall be level The bottom surface of 
foot1ngs shall not have a slope exceeding one umt vert1cal1n 10 umts honzontal (1 a­
percent slope) Foot1ngs shall be stepped where 1t 1s necessary to change the elevat1on 
of the top surface of the foot1ngs or where the slope of the bottom surface of the 
foot1ngs w1ll exceed one un1t vert1cal1n 10 umts honzontal (1 0-percent slope) 

For structures located 1n Se1sm1c Des1gn Categones Do, D1 or D2, stepped foot1ngs shall 
be reinforced w1th four No 4 rebar Two bars shall be place at the top and bottom of the 
footings as shown 1n F1gure R403 1 5 

MIN. 2-~4 REBAR croP &: ILOIT-Qn) 

.r-B01!0M f1ATE (I'YP.) 
i 

STEPPED lFOUI\rrnATlON'S 

FIGURE R403 1 5 
STEPPED FOOTING 

Ordinance F1nal- Doc# 0000142159C031 
FLR!drc 

25 



14.04.280- Section R404.2 of the 2016 California Residential Code is amended to 
read as follows: 

R404 2 Wood foundation walls Wood foundation walls shall be constructed 1n 

accordance w1th the prov1s1ons of Sect1ons R404 2 1 through R404 2 6 and w1th the 
details shown 1n F1gures R403 1 (2) and R403 2(3) Wood foundation walls shall not be 
used for structures located 1n Se1sm1c Des1gn Category Do, D1 or D2 

14.04.282 - Section R50 1.1 of the 2016 California Residential Code is amended to 
read as follows 

R501 1 Apphcat1on The prov1s1ons of th1s chapter shall control the des1gn and 
construction of the floors for bUJidmgs, 1ncludmg the floors of att1c spaces used to house 
mechamcal or plumbing fixtures and equipment Mechamcal or plumbing f1xtures and 
equ1pment shall be attached (or anchored) to the structure 1n accordance w1th Sect1on 
R301 2 2 3 8 

14.04.285- Lines 35 thru 36 of Table R602.3(1) of the 2016 California Residential 
Code are amended to read as follows: 

Staples shall not be used on other wall sheathing as fasteners 1n table R602 3(1 ), 

14.04.290- Footnote b of Table R602.3(2) of the 2016 California Residential Code 
is amended to read as follows: 

b Staples shall have a m1mmum crown w1dth of 7/16-mch on diameter as noted Use of 
staples 1n roof, floor, subfloor, and braced wall panels shall be proh1b1ted 1n Se1sm1c 
Des1gn Category Do, D1, or D2 

14.04.295 - Figure R602.1 0.6.2 of the 2016 California Residential Code is amended 
to read as follows: 

M1mmum 15/32" th1ck wood structural panel sheathmg on one face shall be requ1red 
Galvamzed box na1ls shall not be used Portal frame w1th hold downs at detached 
garage door opemngs shall be double portal frame (two braced wall panels) type at both 
ends S1ngle portal frame shall not be used M1mmum w1dth of portal frame shall be 24 
mches w1th 15/32" th1ck wood structural panel sheathing fastened to the frame 

14.04.315- Section R902.1.1.1 is added to the 2016 California Residential code to 
read as follows: 

All roofmg matenal 1n the very-h1gh and moderate f1re hazard seventy zone must be 
class A No wood roof covenng matenal shall be Installed on any structure located 1n the 
very h1gh, h1gh and moderate f1re hazard zones as 1dent1f1ed by the Pasadena F1re 
Department All other roof covenng matenals 1n other zones shall be class A or 8 

Ord1nance F1nal- Doc# 0000142159C031 
FLR/drc 

26 



Exception: In the moderate f1re hazard zone, the f1re code off1c1al may, upon a show1ng 
of good cause and necess1ty, approve the use of f1re-res1st1ve wood as part of Class A 
listed assemblies, and may reqUire add1t1onal m1t1gat1on as warranted, for the repa1r or 
maintenance of ex1st1ng structure 

14.04.400- Section AV100.3.1 is added to the 2016 California Residential Code to read as 
follows: 

Enclosure (fence) requ1red In add1t1on to the reqUirements 1n the Callforma Res1dent1al 
Code, a barner/enclosure 1s requ1red to Isolate the pool or any other bod1es of water 
over 18 Inches deep from ne1ghbonng properties and public ways 

Exception: When the sw1mm1ng pool or any other bod1es of water over 18 rnches deep 
1s fully enclosed around 1ts pen meter by an enclosure per sect1on AV1 00 3 of the 
Callforma Res1dent1al Code 

California Green Building Standards Code 

14.04.500 - Section 101.3 of the 2016 California Green Buildings Standards Code 
is amended to read as follows: 

Sect1on 101 3 Scope The prov1s1ons of th1s code shall apply to the planmng, des1gn, 
operat1on, construction, use and occupancy of every newly constructed bu1ld1ng or 
structure, add1t1ons or alterations to ex1st1ng bu1ld1ngs, unless otherw1se 1nd1cated 1n th1s 
code, throughout the State of Callforma 

It 1s not the 1ntent that th1s code substitute or be 1dent1f1ed as meet1ng the cert1f1cat1on 
reqUirements of any green bu1ld1ng program 

14.04.502 - Section 301.3 of the 2016 California Green Building Standards Code is 
amended to read as follows: 

Nonres1dent1al add1t1ons and alterations The prov1s1ons of 1nd1v1dual sect1ons of 

Chapter 5 apply to newly constructed bu1ld1ngs, bulldrng add1t1ons and/or bulldrng 
alterations (for occupancies w1thrn the authonty of Callforma Bu1ldrng Standards 

Comm1ss1on) Code sect1ons relevant to add1t1ons and alterations shall only apply to 
the port1ons of the bUIIdrng be1ng added or altered w1th1n the scope of the permitted 

work A code sect1on Will be designated by a banner to 1nd1cate where the code 

sect1on only applies to newly constructed bu1ld1ngs {N} or to add1t1ons and alterations 

{A} When the code sect1on applies to both, no banner Will be used 

14.04.504- Section 307 is added to the 2016 California Green Building Standards 
Code is to read as follows: 

307 1 BUIIdrngs requ1red to comply w1th T1er 1 Include the followrng 

27 
Ordinance Fmal- Doc# 0000142159C031 
FLR/drc 



1 mun1c1pal bu1ld1ngs of 5,000 square feet or more of new construction 

2 non-res1dent1al bu1ld1ngs w1th 25,000 square feet or more of new construction 

3 tenant Improvements of 25,000 square feet or more 

4 m1xed use and mult1-fam1ly res1dent1al bu1ld1ngs four stones m height or more 

307 2 Bu1ld1ngs required to comply w1th T1er 2 Include the following 

1 new mun1c1pal bu1ld1ngs 

2 mun1c1pal renovations of 15,000 square feet or more 

3 commercial type bU1Id1ngs of over 50,000 square feet or more 

Note Where there are practical d1ff1cult1es Involved m complying w1th the threshold 
levels of a t1er, the enforcing agency may grant mod1f1cat1ons for md1v1dual cases The 
enforcing agency shall f1rst f1nd that a special Individual reason makes the stnct letter of 
the t1er 1mpract1cal and that mod1f1cat1on 1s 1n conformance w1th the 1ntent and purpose 
of the measure The details of any act1on granting mod1f1cat1on shall be recorded and 
entered 1n the files of the enforcing agency 

14.04.506- Section 4.106.5.1 through 4.106.5.4 are added to the 2016 California 
Green Building Standards Code as follows: 

4 106 5 1 Cool Roof For new bu1ld1ngs and add1t1ons or alterations to ex1st1ng roof 
framing, roofing matenals must comply w1th sections 4 106 5 2 - 4 106 4 and table 
4106 5 

4 106 5 2 Cool Roof for Reduction of Heat Island Effect Roofing matenal shall 
comply w1th the followmg 

4 106 5 3 Solar Reflectance Roofmg matenal shall have a m1n1mum 3-year aged 
solar reflectance equal to or greater than the values spec1f1ed In Table 4 106 5 

4 106 5 4 Thermal Emittance Roofing matenals shall have a Cool Roof Rat1ng 
Council (CRRC) m1t1al or aged thermal emittance equal to or greater than those 
spec1f1ed 1n Table 4 106 5 

Solar reflectance values shall be based on the aged reflectance value of the roofing 
product or the equation m Section A4 106 5 1 1f the CRRC certified aged solar 
reflectance are not available Cert1f1ed thermal emittance used m the Solar 
Reflectance Index Calculation Worksheet (SRI-WS) developed by the Energy 
CommiSSion may be either the 1n1t1al value or the aged value listed by the CRRC 

Ordmance Ftnal- Doc# 0000142159C031 
FLR/drc 

28 



Exceptions: 

1 Roof repair, 

2 Roof replacement when the roof area be1ng replaced 1s equal to or less than 
50o/o of the total roof area, or 

3 BUJid1ng-mtegrated photovolta1c (BIPV) 

TABLE 4 106 5 

ROOF SLOPE 

S2 12 
>2 12 

MINIMUM 3-YEAR AGED SOLAR 
REFLECTANCE 

0 65 
023 

h"HERMAL EMITTANCE 

0 75 
0 75 

14.04.510- Sections 4.202-4.202.1.1 are added to the 2016 edition of the 
California Green Buildings Standards Code to read as follows. 

Sect1on 4 202 Renewable Energy Sect1ons 4 202 1 and 4 202 1 1 shall apply to 
res1dent1al, mult1fam1ly, m1xed use bUJidmgs 

4 202 1 Space fore Future Electncal Solar System Installation [N] Comply w1th 
Sect1on 110 10 of the Cahforma Energy Code 4 202 1 1 Future access for Electncal 
Solar System [N] For new bu1ld1ngs or when an ex1strng serv1ce 1s relocated to new 
construction area, a mm1mum of one mch electncal conduit shall be prov1ded from the 
electncal serv1ce equ1pment to an accessible locat1on of the att1c or other locat1on 
su1table for future connection to a solar system The condUit shall be labeled as future 
access for electncal solar system The electncal panel shall be s1zed to accommodate 
the mstallat1on of future electncal solar system 

Exception: BUJidmgs not reqUired to prov1de a solar zone per Sect1on 110 1 0 of the 
Cahforma Energy Code 

14.04.516 - Section A4.1 06.5.3 of the 2016 California Green Building s Standards 
Code is deleted and Tables A4.1 06.5.1 (1) through A4.1 06.5.1 (4) of the 2016 
California Green Buildings Standards Code are amended to read as follows. 

A4 106 5 3 Solar Reflectance 1ndex alternative Solar Reflectance 1ndex (SRI) equal to 
or greater than the values 

TABLE A4 1 06 5 1 ( 1) 
TIER 1-LOW RISE RESIDENTIAL 

MINIMUM 3-YEAR AGED 
ROOF SLOPE SOLAR 

REFLECTANCE 

Ordinance Fmal- Doc# 0000142159C031 
FLR!drc 

29 

IJ"HERMAL 
EMITTANCE 



MINIMUM 3-YEAR AGED 
ROOF SLOPE SOLAR 

REFLECTANCE 
S2 12 0 68 
>212 0 28 

TABLE A4 106 5 1 (2) 
TIER 2-LOW-RISE RESIDENTIAL 

MINIMUM 3-YEAR AGED 
ROOF SLOPE SOLAR 

REFLECTANCE 
S2 12 
>212 

TABLE A4 106 5 1(3) 
TIER 1 - HIGH-RISE RESIDENTIAL 
BUILDINGS, HOTELS, AND MOTELS 

0 70 
0 34 

MINIMUM 3-YEAR AGED 
ROOF SLOPE SOLAR 

REFLECTANCE 
S2 12 
>212 

TABLEA4106 51(4) 
TIER 2- HIGH-RISE RESIDENTIAL 
BUILDINGS, HOTELS, AND MOTELS 

0 68 
00 28 

MINIMUM 3-YEAR AGED 
ROOF SLOPE SOLAR 

REFLECTANCE 
S2 12 0 70 
>2 12 0 34 

ITHERMAL 
EMITTANCE 

0 85 
0 85 

lfHERMAL 
EMITTANCE 

0 85 
0 85 

ifHERMAL 
EMITTANCE 

0 85 
0 85 

THERMAL 
EMITTANCE 

0 85 

14.04.526 - Section A5.1 06.11.2.3 of the 2016 California Green Building Standards 
Cods is deleted and Tables A5.1 06.11.2.2 {BSC} and A5.1 06.11.2.3 of the 2016 
edition of the California Green Butlding Standards Code are amended to read as 
follows. 

TABLE AS 106 11 2 2 [BSC] 
TIER 1 

Ordtnance Ftnal- Doc# 0000142159C031 
FLR/drc 

30 



MINIMUM 3-YEAR AGED 
ROOF SLOPE SOLAR rrHERMAL EMITTANCE SRI 

REFLECTANCE 
<212 0 68 0 85 
>212 0 28 0 85 

TABLE A5106 11 2 3 

MINIMUM 3-YEAR AGED 
!TIER 2 ROOF SLOPE SOLAR !THERMAL EMITTANCE SRI 

REFLECTANCE 
<212 0 70 0 85 
>212 0 34 0 85 

SECTION 4. T1tle 14, Chapter 14 28 of the Pasadena Mun1c1pal Code IS amended as 
follows 

A By amend1ng sect1on 14 28 01 0 to read as follows 

14.28 .. 010- Callforma F1re Code adopted 

Except as otherw1se prov1ded for m the chapter by spec1f1c prov1s1on, the m1mmum 
standards, prov1s1ons, and requirements for the safe construction and maintenance of 
property, fac1llt1es, cond1t1ons, matenals, equipment, f1re prevention and alarms 
systems, and the general superv1s1on thereof for the purpose of combating and control 
of f1re and f1re hazard and abatement same w1thm the corporate llm1ts of the C1ty shall 
be m accordance w1th the prov1s1ons and 1n the manner prescnbed by the Califorma 
F1re Code, 2016 ed1t1on (California F1re Code) 1n 1ts ent1rety, as published by the 
International Code Council and mclud1ng Appendix Chapter 4 and Appendices B 
through 10, and IN, all as complied, adopted, and subsequently amended by the 
International Code Council, Callforma State F1re Marshal's Off1ce, Callforma Bu1ld1ng 
Standards Comm1ss1on, or C1ty of Pasadena One copy of the above publication 1s on 
f1le for public mspect1on and they are adopted and mcorporated herem as 1f fully set 
forth m th1s chapter 

B By amend1ng the Callforma F1re Code by amending sect1on 14 28 020 1n 1ts ent1rety to read 
as follows 

14.28.020 - Changes and additions to the adopted code. 

1. Sect1on 101 1 of Chapter 1 of the 2016 Cahforma F1re Code 1s amended to read as 
follows These regulations shall be known as the F1re Code of the C1ty of Pasadena, 
herem referred to as "th1s code " 

2. Sect1on 104 of Chapter 1 of the 2016 Cahforma F1re Code 1s amended by add1ng 
Sect1on 104 12, entitled "Cost Recovery," to read as follows 

Ordrnance Frnal- Doc# 0000142159C031 
FLR/drc 

31 



Where an emergency s1tuat1on 1s caused or exacerbated by a Willful act, a negligent act, 
or a v1olat1on of the F1re Code, Bu1ldmg Code, or any other applicable law, ord1nance or 
regulation, the cost of m1t1gat1ng and secunng any emergency that 1s w1th1n the 
responstblhty of the F1re Ch1ef 1s a charge aga1nst the person who caused the 
emergency or who caused the circumstances leadmg to the creatton of the emergency 
Damages and expenses Incurred by any public agency prov1d1ng mutual atd shall 
constitute a debt of such person and shall be collectible by the Frre Chref for proper 
d1stnbut1on 1n the same manner as m the case of an obligation under contract 
expressed or 1mphed Expenses as stated above shall mclude, but not be llm1ted to, 
equrpment and personnel comm1tted and any payments requrred by the public agency 
to outs1de bus1ness f1rms requested by the public agency to m1t1gate or secure the 
emergency, monrtor remed1at1on, and clean up 

3. The exception 1n Sect1on 105 6 27 of Chapter 1 of the 2016 California F1re Code rs 
amended to read as follows 

Exception: A permtt IS not requtred for 1ndtv1dual containers wtth a 20-gallon (45 5 L) 
water capac1ty or less, or 40 gallons (75 7 L) cumulatively, serv1ng occupancies tn 
Group R-3 

4 . Sect1on 105 of Chapter 1 of the 2016 Cahforn1a F1re Code 1s amended by chang1ng 
Sect1on 1 05 7 4, entitled "Cryogenrc Flurds," to read as follows A construction permit 1s 
requ1red for 1nstallat1on, alteration or closure of cryogenrc flu1d storage systems where 
the system capac1ty exceeds the amounts listed 1n Table 105 6 10 Maintenance 
performed 1n accordance w1th th1s code 1s not considered an alteration and does not 
requ1re a perm1t 

5. Sect1on 108 of Chapter 1 of the 2016 Calrforn1a F1re Code 1s deleted 1n 1ts ent1rety 

6. Sect1on 109 3 of Chapter 1 of the 2016 Cahfornra F1re Code IS amended to read as 
follows 

V1olat1on penalties Persons who VIolate any prov1s1on of thts code or shall fall to comply 
w1th any of the requ1rements thereof or who shall erect, Install, alter, repa1r or do work 1n 
v1olat1on of the approved construction documents or d1rect1ve of the f1re code off1c1al, or 
of a perm1t or cert1f1cate used under prov1s1ons of th1s code, shall be gu1lty of a 
misdemeanor and subject to the penalttes spec1f1ed 1n Chapter 1 24 of the Pasadena 
Munrcrpal Code 

7. Sect1on 111 4 of Chapter 1 of the 2016 Cahfornra F1re Code IS amended to read as 
follows 

Any person who contrnues any work after havmg been served wrth a stop work order, 
except such work as that person IS d1rected to perform to remove a v1olat1on or unsafe 
cond1t1on, shall be gUilty of a misdemeanor and subject to the penalties spec1f1ed 1n 
Chapter 1 24 of the Pasadena Munrc1pal Code 

Ordinance F~nal- Doc# 0000142159C031 
FLR!drc 

32 



I • 
I 

8. Sect1on 510 of the 2016 Cahforma F1re Code 1s amended by add1ng Sect1on 510 1 1, 
ent1tled "D1srupt1on of Rad1o Commumcat1ons," to read as follows 

The 1ntent1onal 1nstallat1on or use of matenals, dev1ces or other bu1ldmg des1gn features 
wh1ch disrupt or otherwise decreases the effectiveness of rad1o commun1cat1ons shall 
be proh1b1ted 

9. Sect1on 510 3 of the 2016 Cahforma F1re code, ent1tled "Emergency responder rad1o 
coverage 1n ex1st1ng bu1ld1ngs," 1s amended by chang1ng Item 2 and addmg Items 3 
through 6 to read as follows 

Ex1st1ng occupancies shall comply w1th sect1on 510 1 where one of the follow1ng 
cond1t1ons ex1sts 

1 Wherever ex1st1ng w1red commun1cat1on system cannot be repa1red or 1s bemg 
replaced, or where not approved 1n accordance w1th Sect1on 510 1, Exception 1 

2 Whenever the f1re code off1c1al determmes that compliance 1s requ1red for the 
protection of the health and safety of the pubhc or emergency responders 

3 Whenever add1t1ons result 1n an add1t1onal level above or below grade, or a total 
1ncrease of more than 1 000 square feet (92 9 m2

) or an mcrease of more than f1fty 
percent (50o/o) 1n the total floor area mcludmg mezzanines and add1t1onal stones, 
whichever rs less, regardless of ownership Add1t1ons shall be cumulat1ve w1th each 
apphcat1on for bUJid1ng perm1t from January 1, 2008, 

4 Whenever the value of alterations exceed f1fty percent (50o/o) of the replacement 
value of the structure, excluding the value of property and contents Alteration values 
shall be cumulat1ve w1th each application for a bUJid1ng perm1t from January 1, 2008 
Expenditures for mamtenance and repa1rs such as 1ntenor and extenor pa1ntmg, 
carpetmg, 1ntenor w1ndow covenngs, drapes, movable part1t1ons, surface re-roof1ng 
or plumbing, mechamcal and electncal repa1rs shall not be considered when 
calculatmg the percentage of alterations, 

5 Whenever there 1s an occupancy class1f1cat1on change to a more hazardous use, 
as determined by the f1re code off1c1al, or, 

6 Whenever any ex1stmg Group R DIVISIOn 1 occupancy 1s subdiVIded to 
condomm1um or any non-res1dent1al occupancy 1s converted, 1n part or whole, to a 
res1dent1al occupancy 

10. Chapter 6 of the 2016 Cahforma F1re Code 1s amended by add1ng sect1on 610 
ent1tled "Photovolta1c Systems", to read as follows 

Ordmance F1nal- Doc# 0000142159C031 
FLR/drc 

33 



The f1re code off1c1al may adopt such f1re and life safety requirements as are necessary 
for the safe mstallat1on and operat1on of photovolta1c systems Unless and unt1l spec1f1c 
requirements are adopted, the current vers1on of the California Department of Forestry 
and F1re Protection, Off1ce of the State F1re Marshal's "Solar Photovolta1c Installation 
Guidance" 1s adopted 

11. Sect1on 903 of the 2016 Callforma F1re Code 1s amended by add1ng Sect1on 
903 1 2, ent1tled "M1mmum F1re Suppression Protect1on for New Construction," to read 
as follows 

All new construction shall be prov1ded w1th an approved automatic f1re suppression 
system throughout the bu1ld1ng, Without regard to the cntena listed 1n sect1on 903 2 et 
seq 

Exception: The follow1ng types of construction may be exempt from th1s sect1on when 
approved by the f1re code offic1al 

1 Garages, carports and s1m1lar structures prov1ded no port1on of the structure IS 

located more than 150 feet (45720 mm) from approved f1re department access, 

2 Ut1llty sheds, gazebos, and s1m1lar structures of less than 120 square feet (11 15 
m2

) prov1ded no port1on of the structure 1s located more than 150 feet ( 45720 mm) 
from approved f1re department access, 

3 Fences and open trellises, and, 

4 Other s1m1lar structures as deemed appropnate by the f1re code off1c1al 

12. Sect1on 903 of the 2016 California F1re Code 1s amended by add1ng Sect1on 903 1 3, 
ent1tled "Ex1stmg Occupancies," to read as follows 

Ex1stmg occupancies, w1th the exception of R-3 1 and R-4 occupancies, shall comply 
w1th sect1on 903 1 2 where one of the following cond1t1ons ex1sts 

1 Whenever add1t1ons result 1n an add1t1onal level above or below grade, or a total 
mcrease of more than 1000 square feet (92 9 m2

) or an 1ncrease of more than f1fty 
percent (50o/o) 1n the total floor area mcludmg mezzamnes and add1t1onal stones, 
whichever 1s less, regardless of ownership Add1t1ons shall be cumulative w1th each 
application for bu1ld1ng permit from January 1, 2008 R-3 occupancies shall not be 
requ1red to comply w1th th1s cond1t1on solely due to the add1t1on of an addrt1onallevel, 
unless one of the cntena for an mcrease of total floor area 1s also exceeded, 

2 Whenever the value of alterations exceed f1fty percent (50o/o) of the replacement 
value of the structure, exclud1ng the value of property and contents, as determined 
by the BU1Id1ng Off1c1al Alterat1on values shall be cumulative w1th each application 
for a bu1ldmg perm1t from January 1, 2008 Expenditures for mamtenance and 

Ordmance Ftnal- Doc# 0000142159C031 
FLR!drc 

34 



repa1rs such as mtenor and extenor pamtmg, carpet1ng, mtenor Window covenngs, 
drapes, movable partJt1ons, surface re-roof1ng or plumbing, mechamcal and electncal 
repa1rs shall not be considered when calculating the percentage of alterations, 

3 Whenever there 1s an occupancy class1f1cat1on change to a more hazardous use, 
as determined by the f1re code off1c1al, or, 

4 Whenever any ex1st1ng Group R D1v1s1on 1 occupancy 1s subd1v1ded to 
condom1mum or any non-res1dent1al occupancy IS converted, 1n part or whole, to a 
res1dent1al occupancy 

13. Sect1on 903 of the 2016 California F1re Code 1s amended by add1ng Sect1on 903 1 4, 
entitled "Part1al Automatic F1re Suppression Systems Proh1b1ted," to read as follows 

Whenever an automatic f1re suppression system 1s Installed for any port1on of any 
bUJid1ng or structure, an automatic f1re suppression system shall be Installed for the 
ent1re bUJidmg or structure 

F1ndmg Topographic and cllmat1c-Narrow and wmdmg access roads to h1lls1de areas, 
and hot, dry weather and seasonal w1nds result 1n Increased exposure to f1re nsk 
Add1t1onally, the Increased use of decreased property line setback development 
Increases the commumty nsk from f1re spread The Callforma F1re Code recognizes the 
benefits of f1re spnnklers 1n requmng mstallat1on 1n new structures Part1al f1re spnnklers 
protect only llm1ted areas of the structure and prov1de less protection than complete 
systems Th1s amendment cont1nues the ex1st1ng proh1b1t1on of part1al f1re sprrnkler 
systems 1n order to decrease the rrsk of conflagration w1th1n the commun1ty 

14. Sect1on 903 of the 2016 Callfornra F1re Code 1s amended by add1ng a sentence at 
the end of Sect1on 903 3 5, entitled "Water supplies", to read as follows 

Hydraulic calculations shall Include a 1 Oo/o reduction from the source 

15. Sect1on 903 of the 2016 Callfornra F1re Code 1s amended by add1ng a sentence at 
the end of Sect1on 903 3 5 1 2, entitled "Res1dent1al combmat1on serv1ces", to read as 
follows 

Combmat1on serv1ces are not allowed for NFPA 13R systems 

F1nd1ng Geolog1c- Pasadena 1s located w1th1n a se1sm1cally act1ve zone and IS near 
several act1ve fault lines Residential domestic water supplies are generally not as 
se1sm1cally res1llent as f1re spnnkler systems For example, 1n the event a porcelain 
f1xture broke 1n an earthquake, a f1re suppression system us1ng a comb1nat1on water 
supply could be compromised, whereas a f1re sprrnkler system w1th a ded1cated supply 
could st1ll be functional Th1s amendment Increases the surv1vab1llty of f1re sprrnkler 
systems 

Ordmance Frnal- Doc# 0000142159C031 
FLR!drc 

35 



16. Sect1on 907 of the 2016 California Ftre Code IS amended by chang1ng the f1rst 
paragraph of Sect1on 907 2, ent1tled "When requ1red-new bU1Id1ngs and structures," to 
read as follows 

For new construction of 10,000 square feet (929 m2
) or more, an approved automatic 

f1re alarm system shall be Installed 1n compliance w1th th1s code and NFPA 72 At a 
mm1mum, smoke detectors, or other listed and approved detect1on dev1ces, shall be 
mstalled 1n all electncal, mechanical, storage, conference or s1m1lar rooms L1sted and 
approved alarm not1f1cat1on appliances prov1d1ng both aud1ble and v1sual not1f1cat1on 
shall be Installed throughout the bU1Id1ng m compliance w1th th1s code and NFPA 72 

17. Sect1on 907 of the 2016 California F1re Code 1s amended by chang1ng Section 
907 3, ent1tled "Ex1st1ng Occupancies," to read as follows 

Ex1stmg occupancies shall comply w1th sect1on 907 1 5 where one of the followmg 
cond1t1ons ex1sts 

1 Whenever add1t1ons result 1n an additional level above or below grade, or a total 
Increase of more than 1 000 square feet (92 9 m2

) or an mcrease of more than f1fty 
percent (50'%) 1n the total floor area 1nclud1ng mezzanines and add1t1onal stones, 
whichever IS less, regardless of ownership Add1t1ons shall be cumulative w1th each 
application for bU1Id1ng permit from January 1, 2008, 

2 Whenever the value of alterations exceed f1fty percent (50°/o) of the replacement 
value of the structure, excludmg the value of property and contents, as determined 
by the BUIIdmg Off1c1al Alteration values shall be cumulative w1th each application 
for a bu1ldmg perm1t from January 1, 2008 Expenditures for maintenance and 
repa1rs such as 1ntenor and extenor pa1nt1ng, carpeting, 1ntenor w1ndow covenngs, 
drapes, movable part1t1ons, surface re-roof1ng or plumbing, mechanical and electncal 
repa1rs shall not be considered when calculatmg the percentage of alterations, 

3 Whenever there 1s an occupancy class1f1cat1on change to a more hazardous use, 
as determmed by the f1re code off1c1al, or, 

4 Whenever any ex1stmg Group R DIVISIOn 1 occupancy 1s subd1v1ded to 
condomm1um or any non-res1dent1al occupancy 1s converted, 1n part or whole, to a 
res1dent1al occupancy 

5 Where reqUired by Chapter 46 

18. Sect1on 908 of the 2016 Cahforma F1re Code IS amended by addmg sect1on 908 7, 
ent1tled "Requirements", to read as follows 

All emergency alarm control panels shall be UL 2017 or UL 864 L1sted All sensors 
shall be UL 2075 L1sted All Detect1on and Alarm systems shall be powered and 
supervised as requ1red for f1re alarm systems NFPA 72 Secondary power supplies 

Ord1nance F1nal- Doc# 0000142159C031 
FLR!drc 

36 



shall be calculated for 24-hours equ1pment standby t1me plus emergency standby 
durat1on calculated for the longest modeled release rate or 5-mlnutes, whichever IS the 
longest durat1on V1sual alarms shall be blue 

19. Sect1on 1008 1 10 of the 2016 Callforma F1re Code 1s amended by deleting the 
exception 

20. Sect1on 2403 2 of the 2016 Cahforn1a F1re Code 1s amended to read as follows 

Tents and membrane structures hav1ng an area rn excess of 1 00 square feet (9 5 m2
) 

shall not be erected, operated or ma1nta1ned for any purpose Without f1rst obta1n1ng a 
perm1t and approval from the frre code official 

Exceptions: 

1 Tents used exclusively for recreational camp1ng purposes 

21. Sect1on 2701 of the 2016 Cahforma F1re Code 1s amended by add1ng Sect1on 
2701 6 1 1, ent1tled "Temporary Fac1hty Closure," to read as follows 

Unless otherwise spec1f1ed, a temporary fac1hty closure shall last not more than 180 
calendar days The f1re code off1c1al may authonze one 180 calendar day extens1on 

22. Sect1on 2703 of the 2016 Cahforn1a F1re Code 1s amended by add1ng Sectron 
2703 2 9 3, entitled "M1mmum Test1ng," to read as follows 

At a m1mmum, all tanks, pnmary storage, secondary containment, momtonng systems, 
release prevention and m1t1gat1on systems, and other safety equipment or systems for 
the storage, use or handling of any hazardous matenal shall be tested for proper 
funct1on as descnbed by manufacturer's or des1gn spec1f1cat1on, whichever 1s more 
stnngent, pnor to the 1ntroduct1on of a hazardous matenal 

23. The f1rst paragraph of Section 3404 2 7 4 of the 2016 Cahforn1a F1re Code IS 
amended to read as follows 

Stationary, above-ground tanks shall be equ1pped w1th add1t1onal ventrng that Will relieve 
excess1ve Internal pressure caused by exposure to f1res Emergency vent1ng dev1ces 
shall be listed and approved Emergency vents for Class I, II and lilA hqu1ds shall not 
discharge 1ns1de bu1ld1ngs Th1s requirement shall also apply to each compartment of a 
compartmentalized tank, the 1nterst1t1al space (annulus) of a secondary containment­
type tank and the enclosed space of tanks of closed-top d1ke construction Add1t1onally, 
th1s requirement shall apply to spaces or enclosed volumes, such as those Intended for 
1nsulat1on, membranes or weather sh1elds that can contain hqu1d because of a leak from 
the pnmary vessel and can 1nh1b1t vent1ng dunng f1re exposure The 1nsulat1on, 
membrane or weather sh1eld shall not Interfere w1th emergency vent1ng The vent1ng 
shall be Installed and marntamed 1n accordance w1th Sect1on 22 7 of NFPA 30 

Ordmance F1nal- Doc# 0000142159C031 
FLR/drc 

37 



24. Sect1on 3404 2 7 5 8 of the 2016 California F1re Code 1s amended, by deletmg the 
except1on 

Fmd1ng Topographic- The mcreased use of decreased property line setback 
development 1ncreases the commumty nsk from f1re spread Smaller flammable and 
combustible llqUJd tanks are allowed by code to be placed relatively close to bu1ldmgs 
and property lines The mstallat1on of overfill prevent1on decreases the likelihood that 
sp1lls dunng the f1lllng process w111 endanger structures on the same or adjacent 
properties 

25. Sect1on 3404 2 8 14 of the 2016 California F1re Code 1s amended to read as follows 
Emergency vents shall be vapor t1ght and shall not be allowed to d1scharge 1ns1de the 
vault Long-bolt manhole covers shall not be allowed for th1s purpose 

26. Sect1on 3404 2 9 6 1 of the 2016 Callforma F1re Code 1s amended to read as 
follows Storage of Class I and II hqu1ds 1n above-ground storage tanks outs1de of 
bu1ld1ngs 1s prohlbtted wtthtn the Ctty of Pasadena 

27. Sect1on 3406 2 4 4 of the 2016 California F1re Code 1s amended to read as follows 
The storage of Class I and II llqu1ds 1n above-ground storage tanks outs1de of bUJid1ngs 
IS proh1b1ted w1th1n the C1ty of Pasadena 

28. Sect1on 3506 2 of the 2016 Callforma Ftre Code 1s amended to read as follows 
Storage of flammable cryogen1c flUids 1n stationary contamers outs1de of bu1ld1ngs 1s 
proh1b1ted w1th1n the C1ty of Pasadena 

29. Sect1on 3801 3 of the 2016 California F1re Code 1s amended to read as follows 
Where a s1ngle container IS more than 20 gallons (75 7 L) 1n water capactty, or the 
aggregate capac1ty of contatners 1s more than 40 gallons (151 L) 1n water capac1ty, or 
the aggregate water capac1ty of LP-gas containers 1s more than 40 gallons (151, L), the 
Installer shall submit construction documents for such 1nstallat1on 

30. Sect1on 3801 of the 2016 Callforma F1re Code 1s amended by add1ng Sect1on 
3801 4, ent1tled "M1n1mum Test1ng," to read as follows 

At a m1mmum, all tanks, pnmary storage, secondary containment, momtonng systems, 
release prevention and m1t1gat1on systems, and other safety equipment or systems for 
the storage, use or handling of any hazardous matenal shall be tested for proper 
funct1on as descnbed by manufacturer's or des1gn spec1f1cat1on, whichever 1s more 
stnngent, pnor to the 1ntroduct1on of a hazardous matenal 

31. Sect1on 3804 2 of the 2016 Cahforma F1re Code 1s amended to read as follows 

W1th1n the C1ty of Pasadena, the aggregate capac1ty of any one 1nstallat1on shall not 
exceed a water capac1ty of 2,000 gallons (7570 L) 

Ordinance Fmal- Doc# 0000142159C031 
FLR/drc 

38 



32. Sect1on 4603 6 9 7 of the 2016 Cahforma F1re Code 1s amended by changmg the 
f1rst paragraph to read as follows 

An approved emergency vo1ce/alarm commun1cat1on system shall be prov1ded 1n every 
ex1st1ng h1gh-nse bUJidmg wh1ch exceeds 75 feet (22860 mm) m he1ght measured 1n the 
manner set forth 1n Sect1on 403 of the Cahforn1a BU1Id1ng Code Such system shall 
prov1de commumcat1on from a locat1on available to and designated by the f1re code 
off1c1al to not less than all public areas 

33. Section 4901 of the 2016 California F1re Code 1s amended by add1ng Sect1on 
4901 1 1, entitled "Referenced standard," to read as follows 
The International Wildland-Urban Interface Code, 2009 ed1t1on, 1s adopted as a 
referenced standard for the enforcement of th1s chapter and other related sect1ons of 
the F1re Code Where conflicts occur between the prov1s1ons of adopted codes and the 
referenced standard, the prov1s1ons of adopted codes shall apply 

I 
34. Sect1on 4905 2 1 of the 2016 Cahforma F1re Code 1s amended by add1ng Sect1on 
4910 1 1 1, ent1tled "Wood Roof Covenng Proh1b1ted," to read as follows 

No wood roof covenng matenal shall be mstalled on any structure located 1n the 
Extreme Hazard, H1gh Hazard, or Moderate Hazard F1re Seventy Zones as 1dent1f1ed by 
the Pasadena F1re Department 

35. Sect1on 4906 2 of the 2016 California F1re Code 1s amended by chang1ng Item 2 to 
read as follows 

Land designated as Moderate, H1gh and Very-H1gh F1re Hazard Seventy Zone by c1t1es 
and other local agenc1es 

36. Appendix A of the 2016 Cahforma F1re Code 1s deleted m 1ts entirety 

37. Exception 1 1n Sect1on 8105 2 of Appendix B of the 2016 Callforma F1re Code 1s 
amended to read as follows 

1 A reduction m requ1red f1re-flow of up to 50 percent, as approved, 1s allowed when 
the bu1ld1ng IS prov1ded w1th an approved automatic spnnkler system mstalled 1n 
accordance w1th Section 903 3 1 1 or 903 3 1 2 The resultmg f1re-flow shall not be 
less than 1 ,500 gall,ons per hour (5678 L/mm) for the prescnbed duration as 
spec1f1ed 1n Table 8105 1 Table 8105 2 1s amended by replacmg"25%" w1th "50%" 
wherever "25%" appears 1n the Table 

38 Sect1on 0103 6 of AppendiX D of the 2016 California F1re Code IS amended to read 
as follows 

Ordinance F1nal- Doc# 0000142159C031 
FLR/drc 

39 



Where required by the f1re code off1c1al, f1re apparatus access roads shall be marked 
w1th permanent NO PARKING-FIRE LANE s1gns complying w1th the current 
spec1f1cat1ons ma1nta1ned by the Pasadena Department of Public Works 

39. Appendices J through M of the 2016 California F1re Code are deleted 1n the1r 
entirety 

C By amend1ng Sect1on 14 28 040 to read as follows 

14.28.040 - Board of Appeals 

All sect1ons m the respective 2016 codes perta1n1ng to the board of appeals are hereby 
amended 1n the1r ent1rety to read as follows · 

In order to hear and dec1de appeals or orders and determine the SUitability of alternative 
matenal and methods of construction and to prov1de for reasonable 1nterpretat1on of the 
prov1s1ons of these codes, there shall and there 1s hereby created a board of appeals 
composed of the mayor and the c1ty council The c1ty clerk shall be the secretary to the 
board The board may adopt reasonable rules and regulations for conducting the 
1nvest1gat1ons and shall render all 1ts dec1s1ons and f1nd1ngs on contested matters 1n 
wnt1ng to the bu1ldmg f1re code off1c1al w1th a duplicate copy thereof to any appellant or 
contestant affected by any such dec1s1on or f1nd1ngs, and may recommend to the c1ty 
council such new leg1slat1on, 1f any, as IS consistent therewith 

The c1ty council may prescnbe by resolution to employ at the cost and expense of the 
c1ty such qualified 1nd1v1duals as the board, 1n 1ts d1scret1on, may reasonable necessary 
1n order to ass1st 1t 1n 1ts 1nvest1gat1on and 1n mak1ng 1ts f1ndmgs and dec1s1ons 

SECTION 5. Th1s ord1nance shall take effect 30 days after 1ts publication 

S1gned and approved th1s __ day of ____ , 2016 

Ordmance F1nal- Doc# 0000142159C031 
FLR/drc 

Terry Tornek 
Mayor of the C1ty of Pasadena 

40 



I HEREBY CERTIFY that the forego1ng ordinance was adopted by the C1ty Council of 
the C1ty of Pasadena at 1ts meet1ng held th1s _day of , 2016, by the following 
vote 

Ayes 

Noes 

Absent 

Absta1n 

Date Published 

Fr: nk L Rhemrev 
Ass1stant C1ty Attorney 

Ordmance F1nal- Doc# 0000142159C031 
FLR!drc 

41 

Mark Jomsky, CMC 
C1ty Clerk 


