

TRANSFORMER SPECIFICATION LD-14-03 BIDS

Item	Bidder	Young & Co (Howard Industries)	Wesco (ABB)	Shihlin USA	Banes (CG Power Systems)	One Source (Central Maloney)	One Source (Cooper)	One Source (GE/Protec)
ITEM I:	Bid Price:	\$ 572,618.42	\$ 525,815.87	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 605,667.22	No Bid	No Bid
	Evaluated Bid Price:	\$ 919,468.94	\$ 866,744.70	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 971,437.43	No Bid	No Bid
ITEM II:	Bid Price:	\$ 606,811.38	No Bid	\$ 583,580.55	No Bid	\$ 607,997.64	No Bid	No Bid
	Evaluated Bid Price:	\$ 1,214,955.93	No Bid	\$ 1,213,250.28	No Bid	\$ 1,262,646.17	No Bid	No Bid
ITEM III:	Bid Price:	\$ 255,171.18	No Bid	\$ 254,536.80	No Bid	\$ 289,558.16	No Bid	No Bid
	Evaluated Bid Price:	\$ 583,505.49	No Bid	\$ 552,327.33	No Bid	\$ 713,744.88	No Bid	No Bid
ITEM IV:	Bid Price:	\$ 1,684,838.20	\$ 1,423,864.05	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Evaluated Bid Price:	\$ 2,434,648.38	\$ 2,183,034.31	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
ITEM V:	Bid Price:	\$ 123,802.20	\$ 138,223.88	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 129,377.55	No Bid	No Bid
	Evaluated Bid Price:	\$ 205,481.95	\$ 219,907.37	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 208,720.88	No Bid	No Bid
ITEM VI:	Bid Price:	\$ 64,134.51	\$ 91,489.92	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 81,109.08	\$ 79,526.40	\$ 62,143.08
	Evaluated Bid Price:	\$ 149,946.62	\$ 168,837.46	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 166,989.53	\$ 165,766.12	\$ 141,275.69
ITEM VII:	Bid Price:	\$ 104,292.28	\$ 205,281.26	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 122,837.55	\$ 95,886.74	\$ 91,347.45
	Evaluated Bid Price:	\$ 228,802.99	\$ 316,334.30	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 259,666.20	\$ 230,650.08	\$ 213,151.85
ITEM VIII:	Bid Price:	\$ 59,512.92	\$ 109,240.96	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 70,307.18	No Bid	No Bid
	Evaluated Bid Price:	\$ 147,681.37	\$ 160,009.51	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 129,354.97	No Bid	No Bid
ITEM IX:	Bid Price:	\$ 1,276,275.55	\$ 1,338,747.05	\$ 1,575,595.00	\$ 1,494,406.35	\$ 1,564,111.85	\$ 1,407,609.65	\$ 1,348,177.40
	Evaluated Bid Price:	\$ 2,201,039.24	\$ 2,277,156.84	\$ 2,513,829.54	\$ 2,607,853.02	\$ 2,609,167.66	\$ 2,268,487.29	\$ 2,097,570.09
ITEM X:	Bid Price:	\$ 121,436.80	\$ 136,168.09	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 108,898.80	No Bid	\$ 125,104.75
	Evaluated Bid Price:	\$ 210,634.14	\$ 229,026.82	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 206,915.38	No Bid	\$ 213,939.67
ITEM XI:	Bid Price:	\$ 30,558.15	\$ 35,173.50	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 31,898.85	No Bid	\$ 32,193.15
	Evaluated Bid Price:	\$ 57,201.97	\$ 60,658.95	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 60,313.34	No Bid	\$ 57,332.57

NOTE: One Source (Central Maloney) did not meet transformer size specifications and deemed Non-Responsive for Item VIII.  
 Item VIII awarded to next low bidder, Young & Co (Howard Industries).