
ORDINANCE NO. 

AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY OF PASADENA ADOPTING THE CALIFORNIA CODE 
OF REGULATIONS TITLE 24 INCORPORATING THE 2007 CALIFORNIA BUILDING 
CODE CHAPTERS 1-35 AND APPENDIX CHAPTERS I ,  C, I, J; THE 2007 
CALIFORNIA ELECTRICAL CODE; THE 2007 CALIFORNIA MECHANICAL CODE; 
THE 2007 CALIFORNIA PLUMBING CODE, AND THE 2007 CALIFORNIA FIRE CODE 
ALL AS PUBLISHED BY THE CALIFORNIA BUILDING STANDARDS COMMISSION. 

The people of the City of Pasadena ordain as follows: 

SECTION 1. This ordinance, due to its length and the corresponding costs of 
publication, will be published by title and summary as permitted by Section 508 of the 
Charter. The approved summary of this ordinance reads as follows: 

"SUMMARY 

The ordinance adopts the 2007 edition of the California Building Code, the 2007 
Edition of the California Fire Code, and related codes as required by state law. The 
ordinance also provides for some necessary amendments to the California Building 
Code to accommodate special topographic, geologic, and climatic conditions found in 
Pasadena, consistent with state law. 

Ordinance No. shall take effect upon its publication by title and 
summary." 

SECTION 2. Sections 14.03.050, 14.03.060, 14.04.025, Chapter 14.36 in its 
entirety of Title 14 of said code are hereby repealed. 

SECTION 3. Chapter 14.03 ADMINISTRATIVE CODE is hereby amended as 
follows: 

Section 14.03.010 is amended to read as follows: 

14.03.010 Adoption and filing. 

Except as herein provided by specific changes, the administrative, organizational 
and enforcement for the technical codes which regulate the site preparation and 
construction, alteration, moving, demolition, repair, use and occupancy of 
buildings, structures and building service equipment within the city shall be in 
accordance with the provisions and in the manner prescribed in administrative 



provisions of the 2007 Edition of the California Building Code, as published by the 
California State Building Standards Commission. 

Section 14.03.020 is amended to read as follows: 

14.03.020 Section 101.1 of Appendix Chapter 1 amended Title. 

Section 101.1 is amended to read: 

This ordinance shall be known and cited as the Pasadena Building Code for 
Building Construction Regulation, and will be referred to herein as this Code. 

Section 14.03.030 is amended to read as follows: 

14.03.030 Appendix 1 Section 103.1 of the California Building Code 
amended. 

Appendix 1 Section 103.1, Creation of Enforcement Agency, is amended to read: 

Appendix 1 Section 103.1, There has been established heretofore in this 
jurisdiction a code enforcement agency entitled, The Planning and Development 
Department which employs a Building Official who shall be authorized to enforce 
the provisions of this code. 

SECTION 4. Cha~ter 14.04 BUILDING CODE AND RELATED CODES are 
hereby amended as follows: 

Section 14.04.01 0 is amended to read as follows: 

14.04.010 Adoption and filing. 

California Building Codes adopted. The 2007 California Building Code Chapters 
1-35 and Appendix Chapters 1, C, I, and J; the 2007 California Electrical Code; 
The 2007 California Mechanical Code; the 2007 California Plumbing Code, and 
2007 California Fire Code all as published by the California Building Standards 
Commission and as amended by the State Department of Housing And 
Community Development (HCD), the Division of the State ArchitectlAccess and 
Compliance (DSAIAC), and the State Office of Statewide Health, Planning and 
Development (OSHPB); The 1997 Uniform Housing Code; The 1997 Uniform 
Code for the Abatement of Dangerous Buildings; all as published by the 
International Conference of Building Officials. One copy of all of the above 
publications is on file for public inspection and is hereby adopted with the same 
force and affect as though set out herein in full. 



Section 14.04.015 is amended to read as follows: 

14.04.015 Section 105.2.1 is added to Appendix 1 Section 105.2 of the 
California Building Code to read as follows: 

A zoning permit may be required for items exempted from building permit 
requirements under Appendix 1 Section 105.2. Exempted work shall not violate 
any provisions of this code, Federal, State, Local laws, or regulations. 

Section 14.04.020 is amended to read as follows: 

14.04.020 Changes and additions to the adopted codes. 

Pursuant to the Health and Safety Code Sections 17358.5 and 17958.7, the City 
establishes the following local modifications. The requisite findings if applicable 
for such requirements are set forth in the ordinance fact sheet accompanying this 
ordinance. 

1. Section 1401.1 of the California Building Code is amended to read as 
follows: 

Scope. The provisions of this chapter shall establish the minimum requirements 
for exterior walls; exterior wall coverings; exterior wall openings; exterior windows 
doors; architectural trim; balconies and similar projections; and bay and oriel 
windows. No wood covering material shall be installed on any structure located in 
the very high, high and moderate fire hazard zones as identified by the Pasadena 
Fire Department. See urban Wildland Interface Code. 

Exception: In the moderate fire hazard zone, the fire code official may, 
upon a showing of good cause and necessity, approved the use of fire-resistive 
wood as part of class A listed assemblies, and may require additional mitigation 
as warranted, for the repair or maintenance of existing structures. 

2. Section 1505.1 of the California Building Code is amended to read as 
follows: 

General. Roof assemblies shall be divided into the classes defined below. Class 
A, B and C roof assemblies and roof coverings required to be listed by this 
section shall be tested in accordance with ASTM E 108 or UL 790. In addition, 
fire-retardant-treated wood roof coverings shall be tested in accordance with 
ASTM D 2898. The minimum roof coverings installed on buildings shall comply 
with Table 1505.1 based on the type of construction of the building. All roof 
assemblies and roof coverings shall be of not less than Class B. No wood roof 
covering material shall be installed on any structure located in the very high, high 
and moderate fire hazard zones as identified by the Pasadena Fire Department. 
See Urban Wildland Interface Code. 



3. Section 1505.6 of the California Building Code is amended to read as 
follows: 

Fire-retardant-treated wood shingles and shakes. Fire-retardant-treated wood 
shingles and shakes shall not be installed in the very high, high and moderate fire 
zones. Fire-retardant-treated wood shakes and shingles are wood shakes and 
shingles complying with UBC Standard 15-3 or 15-4 which are impregnated by 
the full-cell vacuum-pressure process with fire-retardant chemicals, and which 
have been qualified by UBC Standard 15-2 for use on Class A, B or C roofs. 

Fire-retardant-treated wood shakes and shingles shall comply with ICC-ES 
EG107 and with the weathering requirements contained in Health and Safety 
Code Section 13132.7(j). Each bundle shall bear labels from an ICC accredited 
quality control agency identifying their roof-covering classification and indicating 
their compliance with ICC-ES EG107 and with the weathering requirements 
contained in Health and Safety Code Section 131 32.7(j). 

Health and Safety Code Section 13132.7(j). No wood roof covering materials 
shall be sold or applied in this state unless both of the following conditions are 
met: 
(1) The materials have been approved and listed by the State Fire Marshal as 
complying with the requirements of this section. 

( 2 )  The materials have passed at least five years of the 10-year natural 
weathering test. The 10-year natural weathering test required by this subdivision 
shall be conducted in accordance with standard 15-2 of the 1994 edition of the 
Uniform Building Code at a testing facility recognized by the State Fire Marshal. 

4. Section 1510 of the California Building Code is amended by adding a 
section 1510.7 entitled roof sheathing to read as follows: 

When finish roofing material is removed to the existing space sheathing, a 
minimum of 318-inch thick plywood sheathing shall be installed. The new 
sheathing shall comply with the requirements of the California Building Code. The 
sheathing shall be installed such that the edges align over rafters and individual 
spaced sheathing boards. The sheathing shall be attached to the existing spaced 
sheathing with 6d common nails at 6 inches (147mm) on center at supported 
edges and 6d common nails at 12 inches (294mm) on center at intermediate 
supports. 

5. Section 1613.6.1 of the California Building code is amended to read as 
follows: 1613.6.1 Assumption of flexible diaphragm. Add the following 
text at the end of Section 12.3.1.1 of ASCE 7: 

Diaphragms constructed of wood structural panels or untopped steel decking shall 
also be permitted to be idealized as flexible, provided all of the following 
conditions are met: 

Toppings of concrete or similar materials are not placed over wood structural 
panel diaphragms except for nonstructural toppings no greater than 1 % inches 
(38 mm) thick. 



Each line of vertical elements of the lateral-force-resisting system complies with 
the allowable story drift of Table 12.12-1. 

Vertical elements of the lateral-force-resisting system are light-framed walls 
sheathed with wood structural panels rated for shear resistance or steel sheets. 

Portions of wood structural panel diaphragms that cantilever beyond the vertical 
elements of the lateral-force-resisting system are designed in accordance with 
Section 2305.2.5 of the California Building Code. 

Exception: In lieu of Section 2305.2.5, flexible diaphragm assumption is 
permitted to be used for buildings up to two stories in height provided cantilevered 
diaphragms supporting lateral-force-resisting elements from above does not 
exceed 15 percent of the distance between lines of lateral-force-resisting elements 
from which the diaphragm cantilevers nor one-fourth the diaphragm width 
perpendicular to the overhang. 

6. Section 1613.7 is added to Chapter 16 of the 2007 California Building 
Code to read as follows: 

1613.7 Suspended Ceilings. Minimum design and installation standards for 
suspended ceilings shall be determined in accordance with the requirements of 
Chapter 25 of this Code and this subsection. 

161 3.7.1 Scope. This part contains special requirements for suspended ceilings 
and lighting systems. Provisions of Section 13.5.6 of ASCE 7 shall apply except 
as modified herein. 

1613.7.2 General. The suspended ceilings and lighting systems shall be limited to 
6 feet (1828 mm) below the structural deck unless the lateral bracing is designed 
by a licensed engineer or architect. 

1613.7.3 Design and Installation Requirements. 

1613.7.3.1 Bracing at Discontinuity. Positive bracing to the structure shall be 
provided at changes in the ceiling plane elevation or at discontinuities in the 
ceiling grid system. 

1613.7.3.2 Support for Appendages. Cable trays, electrical conduits and piping 
shall be independently supported and independently braced from the structure. 

1613.7.3.3 Sprinkler Heads. All sprinkler heads (drops) except fire-resistance- 
rated floorlceiling or rooflceiling assemblies, shall be designed to allow for free 
movement of the sprinkler pipes with oversize rings, sleeves or adaptors through 
the ceiling tile, in accordance with Section 13.5.6.2.2 (e) of ASCE 7 . 
Sprinkler heads penetrating fire-resistance-rated floorlceiling or rooflceiling 
assemblies shall comply with Section 712 of this Code. 

1613.7.3.4 Perimeter Members. A minimum wall angle size of at least a two inch 
(51 mm) horizontal leg shall be used at perimeter walls and interior full height 


















































