
 

 

 
 
 
 

 

 
MEMORANDUM - City of Pasadena 

 

 
 

DATE:  December 23, 2019 

 

TO:  Talyn Mirzakhanian, Planning Manager  

 

FROM: John Bellas, Environmental Coordinator  

 

RE:  Affordable Housing Concession Permit #11869 (253 S. Los Robles Avenue): 

CEQA Consideration of Revised Project   

 

 
Background 
 
Affordable Housing Concession Permit #11869, as originally proposed, was an application to 
construct a 6-story, 92-unit, multi-family residential project (referred to hereafter as the Original 
Project) consisting of two attached building volumes (referred to hereafter as the northerly and 
southerly volumes), located at 253 South Los Robles Avenue (west side of Los Robles between 
Cordova Street and Del Mar Boulevard). City staff determined the Original Project to be 
categorically exempt from the California Environmental Quality Act (CEQA) pursuant to State 
CEQA Guidelines Section 15332 In-Fill Development Projects (Class 32), based on a Class 32 
Categorical Exemption Report (ESA, August 2018) and supporting technical studies, including a 
Transportation Impact Analysis (Pasadena Department of Transportation, February 2018), 
Noise Technical Report (ESA, July 2018), Air Quality Technical Report (ESA, August 2018), and 
Historical Resources Assessment (ESA, July 2019).  Supplemental noise and General Plan 
consistency analyses were also conducted for the project by ESA and documented in technical 
memorandum dated July 10, 2019.   
 
The Project, as proposed, was approved by the Hearing Officer and, subsequently, the Board of 
Zoning Appeals (BZA).  The BZA approval was called for review by the City Council.  
Subsequent to the City Council’s initial consideration of the project at a public hearing on July 
22, 2019, the applicant has revised the Project in consideration of the Council’s concerns 
(Revised Project).  See the “Summary of Changes to the Project” section below for details.   
 
This memorandum considers whether the proposed Revised Project is eligible for a Class 32 
categorical exemption from CEQA.   
 
Summary of Changes to the Project 



 

 
The proposed revisions to the Project include the following: 

 Reduction in the overall building height from 80 feet to 75 feet (a five-foot reduction) 

 Reduction in the southerly building volume from six stories to five stories 

 Addition of a roof garden/open space amenity atop the southerly building volume 

 Reduction in the number of multi-family units from 92 to 90 (a reduction of two market rate 
units) 

 Reduction in total floor area from 94,165 square feet to 91,217 square feet (a reduction of 
2,948 square feet), resulting in a reduction of the project’s floor-area ratio (FAR) from 2.65 to 
2.57 

 
Class 32 Infill Development Criteria Analysis 
 
State CEQA Guidelines Section 15332 identifies the following criteria for a Class 32 Infill 
Development Categorical Exemption (CE): 

 
a. The project is consistent with the applicable general plan designation and all applicable 

general plan policies as well as with applicable zoning designation and regulations. 
 

b. The proposed development occurs within city limits on a project site of no more than five 
acres substantially surrounded by urban uses. 
 

c. The project site has no value as habitat for endangered, rare or threatened species. 
 

d. Approval of the project would not result in any significant effects relating to traffic, noise, air 
quality, or water quality. 
 

e. The site can be adequately served by all required utilities and public services. 
 

The proposed revisions to the Project have no bearing on criteria a, b, c, or e, and the analyses 

of these criteria in the Project’s CEQA Class 32 Categorical Exemption Report (ESA, August 

2018) and supplemental General Plan Noise Element and Land Use Element consistency 

analysis (ESA, July 2019) remain fully applicable.  The subsections below evaluate criterion d, 

specifically whether the proposed revisions would change the Project in a manner that would 

result in significant effects relating to traffic, noise, air quality, or water quality. 

 
Traffic 
 
The proposed revisions to the Project would reduce the number of multi-family residential units 
from 92 to 90, which would result in a slight reduction (approximately three percent) in the 
Project’s trip generation.  The proposed project revisions would not affect the mix or diversity of 
uses in the project vicinity and would not affect the project’s residents’ access to alternative 
forms of transportation.  Thus, the Revised Project would not change the project’s vehicle miles 
traveled (VMT) per capita or vehicle trips (VT) per capita in a manner that would exceed the 
City’s thresholds, which was confirmed through an update of the project’s Travel Demand 
Forecasting (TDF) modeling (see Table 1 and Appendix A for modeling results). Similarly, as 
the Revised Project is on the same site as the Original Project and proposes the same type and 
nearly the same intensity of uses (approximately two percent less intense), the Revised Project 
would not affect the analyses of Proximity and Quality of Bicycle Network, Proximity and Quality 



 

of Transit Network, or Pedestrian Accessibility in a manner that would increase the project’s 
incremental change above the City’s significance thresholds for those metrics (see Table 1 and 
Appendix A for updated modeling results).  Therefore, like the Original Project, the Revised 
Project would not result in a significant impact relating to traffic.   
 

Table 1. Transportation Performance Metrics Summary—Revised Project 

Transportation Performance Metrics 
Significant Impact 

Cap (Existing) 
Incremental Change 
(Existing + Project 

Significant Impact? 

VMT Per Capita >22.6 11.0 No 

VT Per Capita >2.8 2.1 No 

Proximity and Quality of Bicycle Network <31.7% 31.7 No 

Proximity and Quality of Transit Network <66.6% 66.7 No 

Pedestrian Accessibility <3.88 3.88 No 

Source: Travel Demand Forecasting (TDF) Model output, as included in Appendix A 

 
 
Noise 
 
The proposed Project would generate noise during both construction and operation.  As 
described in the Class 32 Categorical Exemption Report, during construction noise would be 
generated through the use of heavy-duty construction equipment and through vehicle trips 
generated from construction workers traveling to and from the Project Site.  Construction of the 
Revised Project would involve the same construction practices as the Original Project, albeit for 
a slightly (three percent) smaller total building volume.  Daily construction activities (e.g., 
grading, excavation, concrete pouring) and the equipment fleet are expected to be the same as 
under the Original Project.  Likewise, the amount of daily vehicle trips generated by construction 
workers would not increase, as the workforce for construction of the Revised Project is expected 
to be the same as for the Original Project. Thus, construction noise levels would be substantially 
similar to and no greater than those considered in the Class 32 Categorical Exemption Report 
and impacts would remain less than significant.  
 
As described in the Class 32 Categorical Exemption Report and the supplemental noise 
analysis (ESA, July 2019), project operations would generate an increase in ambient noise from 
roadway traffic and stationary noise sources (e.g., mechanical and electrical equipment).  As 
discussed above, the Revised Project would result in a slight reduction in the Project’s trip 
generation due to the reduction in residential units.  Thus, roadway traffic noise levels would be 
slightly less than those considered in the Class 32 Categorical Exemption Report.  Likewise, the 
Revised Project would not increase onsite noise.  Mechanical equipment would remain 
screened and subject to the restrictions in the City’s Noise Restrictions Ordinance.  Human 
activity would also remain subject to the Noise Restrictions Ordinance, including Section 
9.36.050.A of the Pasadena Municipal Code (PMC), which prohibits the generation of noise that 
exceeds the ambient noise level at the property line by more than five decibels.  Therefore, 
operation noise levels would be substantially similar to and no greater than those considered in 
the Class 32 Categorical Exemption Report and the supplemental noise analysis.  Impacts 
would remain less than significant.   
 
Similar to noise levels, since the intensity of daily construction activities and daily operational 
activities would not change, vibrations generated by construction and operation of the Revised 
Project would be substantially similar to and no greater than those considered in the Class 32 
Categorical Exemption report and impacts would remain less than significant.   
 



 

Air Quality 
 
As described in the Class 32 Categorical Exemption Report, the Project has the potential to 
cause air quality impacts associated with construction activities, mobile sources, building 
energy demand, and other aspects of Project construction and operations that have the 
potential to generate criteria air pollutant emissions. Construction of the Revised Project would 
involve the same construction practices as the Original Project, albeit for a slightly (three 
percent) smaller total building volume.  Daily construction activities (e.g., grading, excavation, 
concrete pouring) and the equipment fleet are expected to be the same as under the Original 
Project.  Likewise, the amount of daily vehicle trips generated by construction workers would not 
increase, as the workforce for construction of the Revised Project is expected to be the same as 
for the Original Project. Therefore, the Revised Project’s construction air quality impacts are the 
same in type and magnitude as those of the Original Project, which are described in the Class 
32 Categorical Exemption Report and well below the South Coast Air Quality Management 
District’s thresholds of significance.   
 
As described in the Class 32 Categorical Exemption Report, air pollutant emissions associated 
with Project operations would be generated by the consumption of natural gas and by the 
operation of on-road vehicles. The proposed Project revisions would slightly decrease natural 
gas consumption, proportional to the reduction of units from 92 to 90.  As previously discussed, 
also as a result of this reduction in units, the Revised Project would generate slightly less 
vehicle trips than the Original Project.  Thus, mobile source air pollutant emissions would be 
slightly less than those evaluated in the Class 32 Categorical Exemption Report. Like the 
Original Project, the air pollutant emissions of the Revised Project would be well below the 
South Coast Air Quality Management District’s thresholds of significance and, thus, air quality 
impacts of the Revised Project would be less than significant.  
 

Water Quality 

 
The Revised Project would be required to comply with the same water quality regulations as the 
Original Project.  These regulations include construction phase requirements, including the 
preparation of a Stormwater Pollution Prevention Plan (SWPPP), and operation phase 
requirements, including the preparation of a Low Impact Development (LID) plan.  With the 
required compliance with water quality regulations, the Revised Project would not result in any 
significant effects relating to water quality.   
 
Exceptions to the Use of Categorical Exemptions 
 
State CEQA Guidelines Section 15300.2 identifies the following six exceptions to the use of 
categorical exemptions: 
 
a. Location. Classes 3, 4, 5, 6, and 11 are qualified by consideration of where the project is to 

be located – a project that is ordinarily insignificant in its impact on the environment may in a 
particularly sensitive environment be significant. Therefore, these classes are considered to 
apply all instances, except where the project may impact on an environmental resource of 
hazardous or critical concern where designated, precisely mapped, and officially adopted 
pursuant to law by federal, state, or local agencies. 
 

b. Cumulative Impact. All exemptions for these classes are inapplicable when the cumulative 
impact of successive projects of the same type in the same place, over time is significant. 



 

c. Significant Effect. A categorical exemption shall not be used for an activity where there is a 
reasonable possibility that the activity will have a significant effect on the environment due to 
unusual circumstances. 
 

d. Scenic Highways. A categorical exemption shall not be used for a project which may result 
in damage to scenic resources, including but not limited to, trees, historic buildings, rock 
outcroppings, or similar resources, within a highway officially designated as a state scenic 
highway. This does not apply to improvements which are required as mitigation by an 
adopted negative declaration or certified EIR. 
 

e. Hazardous Waste Sites. A categorical exemption shall not be used for a project located on a 
site which is included on any list compiled pursuant to Section 65962.5 of the Government 
Code. 
 

f. Historical Resources. A categorical exemption shall not be used for a project which may 
cause a substantial adverse change in the significance of a historical resource. 

 

The proposed revisions to the project have no bearing on exceptions a-e, and the analyses of 

these exceptions in the Project’s CEQA Class 32 Categorical Exemption Report (ESA, August 

2018) remain fully applicable.  The following subsection evaluates exception f, specifically 

whether the proposed revisions would change the Project in a manner that would cause a 

substantial adverse change in the significance of a historical resource: 

 
Historical Resources 
 
A Historical Resources Assessment and CEQA Impacts Analysis (Historical Resources Report) 
was prepared by ESA (July 2019) to identify any historical resources on the Project site or in the 
vicinity that could be impacted by the Project.  Based on this analysis, no historical resources 
exist on the Project site.  However, historical resources were identified in the vicinity of the site, 
including four with a view (direct or indirect) of the site: 200 S. Euclid (Masonic Temple), 324 S. 
Euclid (Delia Allen House), 272 Los Robles (Earnest Smith House [by Greene and Greene]), 
and 300 S. Los Robles (Throop Memorial Universalist Church).  The Historical Resources 
Report concluded that, “The scale and massing of the proposed Project is compatible with the 
current built environment and would not substantially change the overall character of the 
existing setting. The proposed Project would not materially impair the eligibility of any historical 
resources in the project vicinity, and thus would have no adverse impact on historical 
resources.” The proposed Revised Project would reduce the overall height of the proposed 
building and remove one story from the proposed southerly building volume. Since the proposed 
revisions would reduce the proposed building’s scale and massing, the Revised Project would 
also have no adverse impact on any historical resources in the project vicinity. 
 
Conclusion 
 
Based on the analysis in this memorandum, in conjunction with the evaluations in the Project’s 
Class 32 Categorical Exemption Report (August 2018), supporting technical studies, and 
supplemental analyses technical memorandum (July 2019), the Revised Project would be 
eligible for a categorical exemption from CEQA as an in-fill development project pursuant to 
State CEQA Guidelines Section 15332 (Class 32).    
 



 

End of memo.  
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