Introduced by: _

ORDINANCE NO

o AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY OF PASADENA AMENDING PASADENA_
 MUNICIPAL CODE TITLE 14 AND ADOPTING TITLE 24 OF THE -
' CALIFORNIA CODE OF REGULATIONS INCORPORATING THE 2016
. .CALIFORNIA BUILDING CODE AND APPENDIX CHAPTERS C, D, H, [; AND
J; THE 2016 CALIFORNIA RESIDENTIAL BUILDING CODE AND APPENDIX
E, G, AND H; THE 2016 CALIFORNIA MECHANICAL CODE; THE 2016
'CALIFORNIA PLUMBING CODE; THE 2016 CALIFORNIA ELECTRICAL
' CODE; THE 2016 CALIFORNIA FIRE CODE; AND THE 2016 CALIFORNIA
GREEN BUILDINGS STANDARDS CODE LR e

Whereas the C|ty of Pasadena is adoptmg the 2016 edltlons of the Callforma Burldlng
Code, Residential Building. Code Fire Code and Green Burldmg Standards Code and is
‘ makmg certain amendments thereto, and S . « 2

Whereas State law requires that a city must adopt specific fi ndi'ng"'s'a's othe.
topographic, geologlcal and climatic- COI’IdItIOI"IS to- jUStlfy the amendment to these
codes; . . .

Now, Therefore the City Council:of the City :of» Pasadena finds as follows: .

1 W|th respect to the amendments to the state code as set forth |n Sect|ons 14 04 102
110, 115 258 and 315 below o

Justlflcatlon Topographic and: Cllmatlc Pasadena S h|||S|de ‘areas have narrow and
winding access roads, which makes t|me|y response by Iarge fire suppression vehicles
difficult. Addltlonally, long: penods of dry, hot weather, combined with unpredlctable

- seasonal winds (Santa-Ana wind condltlons) result in increased exposure to fire risk. -
These amendments prohibit-the use of wood as extenor wall-and: roof covering materlal
in very high, high and'moderate fire hazard areas and: require other exterior wall finishes
and roofing materialsto have a class A assembly. This will reduce the potential for rapld
spread of ﬂre throughout the crty dunng perlods of strong seasonaI wmds '

2. Wlth respect to the amendments to the state codes as set forth in Sectlon 14 04. 400
below, ' »

Justlflcatlon Cl|mat|c Because of: the nsk of delays in flre rescue response tlme due

to traffic congestion and due to the high number of swimming pools within close
proximity'to small children because of local climate which makes pool ownershlp P
desirable, pool barriers are necessary. Additionally, the amendments correct an' - _
administrative errorin the State's adoption which intended to provide pool barriers. The

1
0000142278C031



amendments are consistent with barrier requirements previously: in force in the City. of
Pas’adena

3. With respect to the amendments to the state codes as set forth in Sections .
14.04.120, 130, 140, 145, 147, 150, 155, 160, 170, 175, 180, 205, 210, 215 216 220,
225, 235, 260 267 275 282 285, 290, 295 and 305 below

Justlflcation Geologic Pasadena is situated prlmarily on the Sierra Madre fault near
the base of the San Gabriel Mountains. Other faults.near. or in the C|ty are the Eagle
Rock fault (originaily termed the San Rafael fault), Verdugo Hills fault, and ElySIan Park .
- fault. Said faults are generally. consrdered major Southern California earthquake faults
which may experience rupture at any time. Review of damage resulting from the
January 17, 1994 Northridge Earthquake revealed significant damage to many buildings
throughout the Southern California region. The referenced amendments are necessary

" to implement improved design standards, to use current recognized standards and _
referenced recently published, and to reduce the risk of personal injury; loss of life and
property damage within structures |

4. With respect to the amendments to the state code as set forth in Sections 14. 04 165,
185, 190, 217, 270, and 280 below

Justification: Local Climatic and Geological Conditions. The greater Los Angeles
region is a densely popuiated area having buildings and structures constructed over and
neara vast array of fault systems capable of producing major earthquakes mcludmg '
but not limited to the recent 1994 Northridge Earthquake. In addition, the region is within
a climate system capable-of producing major winds, fire and rain related disasters,
including but not limited to those caused by the Santa Ana winds and El Nino (or La -
Nina) subtropical-like weather This region is especially susceptible to more active :
~ termite and-wood attacking insécts and microorganisms. The proposed. modification to -
prohibit the use of wood. foundation systems as well as limit prescriptive design

~ -provisions in an effort to mitigate potential problems or. deficiencies due to the
proliferation of wood- -destroying organisms and therefore need to be mcorporated into -
‘the code to assure that new buildings and structures and additions or alterations to -
exrsting buildings or structures are designed and constructed in accordance wrth the
scope and objectives of the Internatlonal Resrdential Code. -

5. With respect to the amendments to the state code as set forth in Sections14 04 500
501 502, 504 506 508, 510, 512 514, 516 and 518 below, : s

Justlflcatlon Local enwronmentallClimatlc Cond|t|ons The greater Los Angeies
region is a densely populated area having resndential buildings constructed within a -
- region where environmental resources are scarce due to varying and occasional -

' 2
- 0000142278C031



immoderate temperatures and weather conditions. The proposed modificationto - ..
require higher efficiencies of energy usage and greater beneficial use of environmental
material will be achieved with the proposed expansion of the Mandatory and Voluntary

- requirements and therefore need to be incorporated into the code to assure that new
residential and non- -residential. burldrngs are designed-and constructed in accordance
‘with the scope and objectives of the California'Green Building Standards Code. -

6. With respect to the amendments to the state fire code as set forth in section: - -
14.28.020 items 3, 4, 24, 31, 32, 33, 34 and 36 below, the proposed amendments are
required due to topographic conditions. The increased use of decreased property line:
setback development and increased development densities increase the community risk
from fire or hazardous materials spread and the number of persons potentially -
endangered. The proposed amendments allow for either |ncreased revrew and
mltlgatlon or decreased hazard to the commumty, or both - :

7. Wrth respect to the amendments to the state flre code as set forth in: sectlon : -
14.28.020 items 13, 14, 20, 25, and 26 below the proposed amendments are requrred
due to topographrc and climatic conditions. Narrow and ‘winding access roads to
hillside areas, and hot, dry weather and- seasonal winds result-in increased exposure to
fire risk. The'increased use of decreased property line setback development and-.
increased development densities increase the communlty risk from fire spread and the
number of persons potentially endangered. The proposed amendments ‘aliow for either
increased review and mitigation, or decreased hazard to the community through

~ increased use of automatic fire extlngurshmg systems and/or the decreased use of -
combdstlble exterior. materlals or both

8. With respect to the amendments to the state fire code as set forth in sectlon

~ 14.28.020 items 15, and 16 below, the proposed amendments are required due to
geologic conditions. Pasadenais located within a seismically active zone and is near
several active fault lines. Residential domestic water supplies are generally not as
selsmlcally resilient as fire sprinkler systems. For example inthe event a porcelain:
fixture broke in an earthquake -a fire suppression system using a combination water - -
~.supply could be compromised, whereas a fire sprlnkler system with a dedicated supply-
could still be functional. This amendment increases the survrvablhty of fire spnnkler
systems. The proposed amendments aIIow for either increased review and mitigation,
: decreased hazard to the communlty by, allowrng for Ilmlted Ieakage or other water Ioss
in calculatlons and dlsallowmg a more vulnerable type of system or both '

9. With respect to the amendments to the state fire code as set forth in sectlon"
14.28.020 items 12-and 19 below, the proposed amendments’ are required due to
topographic condltlons The increased use of decreased property line setback -

development, increased use of light weight construction,’ increased intermingling of
' 3
0000142278C031



hazardous occupancies with less hazardous occupancies that have been historically
separated, and increased development densities increase the community risk-from fire -
spread and other hazardous conditions and the number of persons potentially
endangered . The proposed amendments allowfor the increased efficacy and safety of
the response to emergencies by ensuring acceptable emergency communications and .
thereby improving the safety of both the\.community and emergency responders. . . -

10. With respect to the amendments to the state fire code as set forth in section = -
14.28.020 item 38 below, the proposed amendments are required due to topographic
conditions. The increased use of decreased property line setback development, '
increased use of light weight construction, mcreased intermingling of hazardous
occupancies with less hazardous occupancies that have been historically separated,; -

and increased development densities i increase the communlty risk from fire spread and
other hazardous conditions and the number of persons potentially endangered. This-
amendment increases public and firefighter safety by increasing the likelihood that

* automatic fire extinguishing systems will have sufficient water flow capacity to contain or
extinguish significant fires before the fire- extends to adjacent areas or structures.

11. With respect to the amendments to the state fire code as set forth: in section

- 14.28.020 item 15 below, the proposed amendment is required due to geologic
conditions.:Due to the City's significant use of groundwater, fire suppression systems
experience an increased rate of mineral deposition due to dissolved minerals in the
groundwater. This amendment mltlgates the potential decrease in water flow caused by
mineral deposition.

12. With respect to the amendment to the state fire code as set forth in section

-14.28.020 items 17, 18 and 21 below, the proposed amendments are required due to
topographic conditions. The increased use of decreased property line setback
development and increased development densities increase the community risk from
fire spread and increase the number of persons potentially endangered, and limits the
space available in which emergency responders may operate effectively. Early and
effective evacuation of building occupants increases the efficacy of fire attack and
decreases the risk of fire spread. The proposed amendments allow for either lncreased .
review and mitigation, or decreased hazard to the community, or both

13. With respect to the amendment to the state fire code as set forth in sectlon
~ 14.28.020 item 30 below the proposed amendments are required due to topographic

| ~ conditions. The increased use of decreased property line setback development

increases the community. risk from fire spread. Smaller flammable and combustible
liquid tanks are allowed by code to be placed relatively. close to buildings and property
lines. The installation of overfill prevention decreases the likelihood that spills during the
filling process will endanger structures.on the same or adjacent properties.

: 4
0000142278C031



14. With respect to the amendment to the state fire code as set forth in section
14.28.020 item 25 below, the proposed amendments are required due to topographlc
conditions. The increased use of decreased property line setback development
. increases the communlty risk from fire spread. Smalier flammable and combustible -
liquid tanks are allowed by code to be’ placed relatlvely close to burldlngs and property
~ lines. AIIowmg the emergency venting of ﬂammable and combustible vapors within ©
~ vaults greatly mcreases the likelihood of vapor explosrons wrthrn the vault. Allowrng the -
use of long- -bolt manhole covers as a'means of emergency venting creates a hazard to .
anyone nearby the manhole should an emergency release occur without warning.
Disallowing the practices of in-vault venting and the use of long-bolt manhole covers
increases the public safety by requmng ventlng to occur at a safe locatlon

- 15. For sections not specmed above no express flndrngs are’ requrred under the .
requirements established by sections 17958, 17958.5, and 17958.7 of the California
Health and Safety Code as these amendments are administrative in nature, merely .
provrde clarification of eX|st|ng Callfornla Code requwement or address matters outsrde

‘the scope of the above sections.

Accordingly, the People of the Crty of Pasadena ordain as follows (

| SECTION1. This ordlnance due to its length and correspondmg publrcatlon cost will
be pubhshed by title and - summary as permrtted by Section 508 of the Charter of the
Crty of Pasadena. The approved summary of thls ordinance is as foIIows .

“Summary

‘Ordinance No. __-~ . The ordmance adopts the 2016 California Burldlng Code, the -
- 2016 Cal|forn|a Resudentlal Code, the 2016 California Mechanlcal Code, the 2016. | )
California Plumbrng Code, the 2016 Califomia Electrical Code, the 2016 Callfornla Fire.
Code and the 2016 California Green Building Standards Code as required by state law. -
‘The ordinance also provides for some amendments to these codes to accommodate
special topographic, geological, and climatic conditions found in Pasadena consistent
with state law. Ordinance No.____ shall take effect 30 days after its publication by titte
and SUmmary The full text of the ordinance is on file in the City Clerk’s Office.’f

SECTION 2 Trtle 14, Chapter 14 03 of the Pasadena Mumcrpal Code |s
amended as follows L , SRR

A By amendrng Sectlon 14 03 010 to read as foIIows

0000142278C031



14.03.010 - Adoption and filing

Except as herein provided by specific changes, the administrative, organizafional and
enforcement for the technical codes which regulate the site preparation.and .
construction, alteratlon movmg, demolition, repair, use and occupancy of buildings,
structures and buﬂdlng service equipment within the city shall be in accordance with the
prov:smns and in the manner prescrlbed in administrative provisions of the 2043 2016
Edition of the California Building Code, as pubhshed by the Callfornla State Bunldmg
Standards Commlssmn

B. By amending Sectlon 14.03.020 to read as follows:

14.03.020 - Sectlon 101.1 of Chapter 1 Division Il of the 2043 2016
Callforma Buﬂdmg Code amended Title. :

vThls ordinance shall be known and cited as the Pasadena Bu1ld|ng Code for Building
Construction Regulatlon and will be referred to herein as this Code

C. By amending Section 14.03.030 to read as follows:

14.03.030 - Chapter 1 DlVlSlon I Section 103.1 of the 2043 2016 Callforma
Buudmg Code, creation of enforcement agency is amended as follows

There has been established heretofore in this Junsdlctlon a code énforcement agency
entitled, The Planning and Community Development Department which employs a
Buﬂdmg Official who shall be authorized to enforce the provisions of this code.

SECTION 3. Title 14, Chapter 14. 04 of the Pasadena Mumcnpal Code is amended as
follows:

A. By amending Section 14.04. 010 to read as follows:
14.04. 010 Adoptlon and f|||ng

0000142278C031



California Building Codes adopted'.‘ California Code of Requlation Title 24 gart 1-

12. The 2016 California Building Code Chapters 1-35 and Appendix Chapters C,
D, H, I, and J; the 2016 California Residential Code Appendix Chapters E. H. J,
and V, the 2016 Callfornla Green Building Standards Code, the 2016 California
Electrical Code: The 2016 California Mechamcal Code the 2016 California
Plumbing Code, and 2016 California Fire Code all as mbllshed by the California
Bulldlng Standards Commission and as amended by the State Degartment of
Housmg ‘And Community Development (HCD); the Division of the State
Architect/Access and Compliance (DSA/AC), and the State Office of Statewid_g
Health, Planning and Development (OSHPD), The Office of the State Fire Marshal -
" (SFM):_all as published by the International Code Council. One copy of all of the

above publications is on file for public inspection and is hereby adopted with the
same force and effect as though set out hereln in full o

B. By amendmg Sectlon 14 04 01 5 to read as follows .- |

14.04. 015 - Sectlon 105. 2 1 is added to Chapter 1 DlVlSlOi'l |l Sectlon 105.2 of the2016
Callfornla Bunldmg Code to read as follows ) .. . '

A zonlng permlt may be requnred for |tems exempted from bu1ld|ng permit requ1rements
under Chapter 1 Division Il Section 105.2. Exempted work shall not violate any
provisions. of this code, Federal, State, Local laws, or regulations.

x

C. By addin_g,Seotio,ns 1404020 to read asfollows |

14.04.020 — Section 105.5 of the 2016 California Building Code and Section R105.5
of the 2016 California Residential Building Code is amended to read as follows:

teeLE_gratlon Beglnnmg January 1. 2017Leverv germlt issued by the Building
Official under the provisions of this Code shall expire by limitation and become
null and void if all work by said permit is not completed within the time limits
§p§cified".below from the date of issuance of the building permit:

Constructlon Type - fl’roie‘dt Completion Time
Slngle-Famlly or Duplex _ - 24 months
| Multiple Family (3+ units) | f 36 months
7

0000142278C031

“



Non-residential 36 months

A

0000142278C031

. Before such work can be recommenced, a permit extension, as
specified in Subsection A, shall be first obtained. NJ)Lermlt shaII be.
extended more than twice. ' .
Time limits will not be increased by i |ssuance of subsequent buﬂdl_nq

permits for the same project. ,
. When a project is divided into separate permlts by the appllcant the

work on such permits is to be done concurrently, the time allowed to.
complete all work on each separate permlt shall be establlshed fromf
the initial permit issuance date.

Extensions and "F‘ees'.

a. Any permittee holding an active permit may apply in writing for
an extension of the time within which work under that permit
may be continued when, for good and satisfactory reasons, he
or she is unable to continue work within the time required by
this section due to circumstances beyond the control of the
permittee. The written request must demonstrate that:

i. Due to circumstances beyond the owner’s or permittee’s
- control, construction could not be commenced, continued or
- completed in the authorized time period;
ii. If the construction has started, substant|a| progress has been
made; ‘
fii. _The condition of the property presents no healith or safety
hazard; and,
iv.  The continued delay will not create any unreasonable -
aesthetic impact to the neighborhood or substantlal economlc
' detrlment to the nengﬂporlrgproperty owners. '

b. The Building Official may extend the time for action by the
permittee for a period not exceeding six calendar months.
Payment of the building permit extension fee shall be required.
The extension fee shall be calculated as the greater of two
percent (2%) of the estimated total prolect valuation or one-
thousand dollars.

c. Building permits shall not be extended more than twnce, and
each extension shall not exceed six months.




B Aggeals If the property owner feels aggrieved by the determination -

. of the Building Official reqgarding the applicable time limit or by the
denial of an additional six-month extension, the property owner may.
appeal to the Code Compliance Hearing Officer within ten days of the
Building Official’s decision. The appellant shall pay a hearing appeal

~ fee at the time of filing an appeal in an amount as shall be
established from time to time by resolution of the City Council. The
Code Compliance Hearing Officer shall notify the appellant in writing .

- of the date of the hearing on the appeal, and such notice shall be
sent at least ten days before the date of the hearing, which shall be
held no later than thirty days after the filing of the appeal.

D.By adding Section 14.04.022 to read as follows:

14.04.022 Post_g of Constructlon S igns.

Except for smgle-famlly constructlon mvolvmg only minor mterlor remodel
minor building permits, window chanJgJuts re-roofs or other minor
building permits, one s ign, visible from the street, must be. pﬁsted listing
_project address, permit number, work descr ription, name of Construction
Company, contact name of Constructlon Comgany and Qhone number
and/or if owner-builder contact name and phone number of owner. The 5|g_
shall also list the City’s allowable construction hours and days pursuant to
' Pasadena Munlclpal Code Section 9.36.070, and clearly identify the permit
expiration date. Said sign shall be white in color as backgroundanda
minimum size of 24” in height by 36” in width with 1”7 hlgM&lele black .
lettering. Posting of the required sign is the. responsnblllty of the permittee,
and such sign shall be posted and maintained at the construction site where
it can be read by the. publlc This notice must be posted prior to the start of
" construction and displaced continuously until all permltted workis
inspected and approved by City of Pasadena Bwldmg & Safety Division.
Sign to be verified by the City upon the first inspection. Signs shall be
replaced if damaged, torn, faded, or if the required mformatlon is illegible,
as determined by the Building Official.

E. By__addin’g Section 14.04.024 to read as follows:

14.04.024 Construction Site Fencing.

0000142278C031



Whenever a building permit is issued to construct, add to or alter a building
or site, the bu1|d|n)@LoffIC|aI may require temporary perimeter fencing to be
installed and to be maintained i in good condition.

The installation of temuary fencmg shall be required for the followmg
projects:

1. Projects involve grading, trenching or excavation activities,

2. The construction area is visible from the public right-of-way with the
exception of roof replacement window change-outs W|th no framing
work.

3. There is outside storage of building materials, equipment,
construction materials or ecmlpment stored at the front of the
property.

4. The property is vacant during the duration of the construction.

5. As determined by the Building Official

The Building Official shall require the site to be temporarily fenced and
screened on all sides for the duration of the construction project. The
height of the fence shall be seventy-two inches (72) high wﬂL_cLates to
access the site. The screening material shall be tightly secured to the
fencing, free of holes and without advertising. The perimeter fencing may
be removed when there are no remaining exterior construction activities -
'visible from the public right-of-way and there is no longer visible outside
storage of building materials, equipment or fixtures or as determined by
the Building Official. An address sign shall be installed and be visible from
public right of way at all perimeter points to.include the street name and '
number of the site using minimum six-inch high letters and numbers, and
shall be  posted at the top of the perimeter fence or at least five feet from
the ground. A "No Trespassmg" sign, conforming to the requirements of
California Pénal Code, Section 602, shall be installed at all perimeter
access points, posted at the top of the perimeter fence or at least five feet
from t_m;_ground » ' '

F. By amending Section 14.04.030 to read as follows:
14.04.030 - Violations.

All sections in the 2016 codes referenced in Section 14.04.010 herein pertamlng to
violations are amended in thelr entlrety to read as follows:

It shall be unlawful for any person, firm or corporation to erect, construct enlarge, alter,
repair, move, improve, remove, convert, or demolish, equip, use, occupy, or maintain
any building or structure in the City, or cause same to be done, contrary to or in violation

10
0000142278C031



of any_of the provisions of this chapter. Any person, firm, or corporation violating any of
- the provisions of this Ordinance, shall be deemed guilty of a misdemeanor, and each
such person shall be deemed guilty of a separate offense for each and every dayor |
portion thereof during which any violation of any of the provisions of this Ordinance i lS
committed, continued, or permitted, and upon-conviction of any. such violation- such
persons shall be punished by afine of not more than one thousand dollars ($1,000) or

by imprisonment for not. more than one (1) year, or by both such fine and lmprlsonment
In addition to the above penalty provisions, violation of any of the provisions of this a

chapter may be subject to the admrnrstratrve proceedrngs set forth in Chapter 1 25 of
this code : Lo

G. By amendmg Sectron 14, 04 040 to read as fo|lows
14.04.040 = Board of appeals. |

All sectrons in the respective 2016 2016 codes pertarnlng to the Board of Appeals are hereby
amended in thelr entirety to read as follows:

In order to hear and decrde appeals or orders and determlne the surtabrlrty of alternate
materials and methods of construction and to provide for reasonable interpretations of
the provisions of these Codes, there shall be and there is hereby created a Board of
Appeals, composed of the Mayor and the Crty Councrl

The city clerk shall be the secretary to the Board The Board may adopt reasonable -
rules and regulations for conducting its investigations and shall render all its decisions
and findings on contested matters, in writing to the building official, with a duplicate copy
thereof to any appellant or contestant affected by any such decision of findings, and -
may recommend to. the City Council such new Iegrslatron if any, as is consistent
therewith. .

The City Council may prescribe by resolution, to employ at the cost and expense of the
City, such qualified individuals as the Board, in its discretion, may deem reasonably
necessary in order to assrst it in its lnvestrgatrons and |n maklng its fmdrngs and
'decrsrons ; - :

H. \By amendling' Seotion 14.04.050 to read as follows:

14 04 050 Fees

‘The councrl shall by resolutron adopt a schedule of feeS\for the permrts lssued pursuant
to the 2016 codes re_ferenceci in. Sec_tron 14 04 01 0 and as amended herein. herete-

"k By amendlng Sectlon 14. 04 080 to read as foIlows
14. 04 080 - Moved structures.

‘ 1
~.0000142278C031



'Sectron 409 3440—of Part 10 the—2943—edmen of the 2016 Calrfornla Burldrng Code is
amended by adding the foIIowmg :

Before a permit is issued, the building-mover shall furnish and file with the Clty Clerk, a
- good and sufficient bond in the principal sum of $5,000.00 in favor of the City of
Pasadena for the benefit of any person, firm or corporation who may be damaged
directly by the moving of said building or structure, provided that any person, frmor
corporation engaged in the business of moving buildings may file with the City Clerk a
surety bond in the sum of $10,000.00 indemnifying the City for the purposes, and in that
event such person, firm or corporation need not file the $5,000.00 bond herein above
. required for any single moving operation. , -

J. By 2016 amending s, 14.04.102, 14.04.110, 14.04.115, 14.04.120,' 14.‘04.130,'
14.04.140, 14.04.145, 14.04.147, 14.04.150, 14.04.160, 14.04.165, 14.04.170,
14.04.175, 14.04.180, 14.04.185, 14.04.190, 14.04.205, 14.04.210, 14.04.215,
14.04.216, 14.04.217, 14.04.220, 14.04.225, 14.04.235, 14.04.250, 14.04. 258,
14.04.260, 14.04. 265 14.04.267, 14.04.270, 14.04.275, 14.04.280, 14.04.282,

- 14.04.285, 14.04. 290, 14.04 .295, 14.04.315, 14.04.400, 14.04.500, 14.04.502, A
14.05.500, 14.04.502, 14.40.504, 14.04.506, 14.40.516, 14.40.526; deleting sections
14.04.155, 14.04.205, 14. 40.305, 14. 40.501,14. 40.508, 14.40. 512,14.40.514, 14, 40518

' 14.40.522, and 14.40.524; and adding section 14.04.257 as follows:

14. 04 100 Changes and additions to the adopted 2016 codes

Pursuant to the Health and Safety Code Sectlons 17358.5 and 17958.7, the Clty
establishes the following local modifications. The requisite findings if applicable for such
requirements are set forth in the ordinance fact sheet accompanying this-ordinance.

14.04.102 - Section 701A.1 of the 2943—2046 edltlon of the Callfornla Buﬂdrng Code is
amended to read as follows : :

}Scope. This chapter applles to building‘ materials, systeme and/or as’semblies used in
the exterior design and construction of new buildings, additions and alterations located
within a Wildland- Urban Interface Frre Area as deflned in Section 702A. ‘

14.04.110 - Sectron 1505.1 of the 2943 2016 Callfornla Building Code is amended to
read as follows.

General. Roof assemblies shall be divided into the classes defined below. Class A, and
B and-G roof assemblies and roof coverings required to be listed by this section shall be
tested in accordance with ASTM E 108 or UL 790. In addition, fire-retardant-treated
wood roof coverings shall be tested in accordance with ASTM D 2898. The minimum
roof coverings installed on buildings shall comply with Table 1505.1 based on the type
of construction of the building. All roof assemblies and roof coverings shall be of not
less than Class B. No wood roof covering material shall be installed on any structure

12
0000142278C031



' located in the very high, hlgh and moderate f|re hazard zones as ldentlﬁed by the _
Pasadena Fire Department R . ;-

Exceptlon

_ - In the moderate f|re hazard zone, the flre code off|C|al may, upon a showrng of
good cause and necessity, approved the use of fire-resistive wood as part of class A

- listed assemblies, and may reqwre addltlonal mltlgatlon as warranted for the repalr or
malntenance of existing structures. . e B : :

- Skyllghts and sloped glazrng that comply W|th Chapter 24 or Sectlon 2610..

"~ 14.04.115.- Sectlon 1505.6 of the 2043 2016 Edltlon of the California Bu1ld|ng Code is
amended to read as follows , . '

Flre retardant-treated wood shlngles and shakes. Fire- retardant-treated wood shingles
~ and shakes shall not be installed in the very high, high and moderate fire zones. Fire-
retardant-treated wood shakes and shingles are wood shakes and shingles complying
with UBC Standard 15-3 or-15-4 which are impregnated by the full-cell vacuum- .
‘pressure process with fire-retardant chemlcals and which have been qualified.by UBC"
Standard 15-2 for use on Class A anel orBerC roofs '

Flre-retardant-treated wood shakes and shlngles shall comply wrth ICC ES EG107 and'
with the weathering requirements contained in Health and Safety Code Section
- 13132.7(j). Each bundle shall bear labels from an ICC accredited quality control agency
identifying their. roof-covering: classification and indicating their compliance with ICC-ES
- EGIO7 and with the weatherlng reqwrements contalned in. Health and Safety Code
~ Section 13132.7(j). o . :

Health and Safety Code Sectlon 131 32 7(]) No wood roof covering materrals shall be
sold or applied in this state unless both of the followmg cond|t|ons are. met

(1) The matenals have been approved and listed by the State Fire Marshal as
complylng with the requrrements of this section.

(2) - The materlals have passed at least five years of the 10-year natural weatherlng
test. The 10-year natural weathering test required by this subdivision shall be conducted
in accordance with standard 15-2 of the 1994 edition of the Unrform Burldrng Code ata
testing facility recognized by the State Fire Marshal.: . L ; .

Exceptlon In the moderate fire hazard zone, the fire code official may, upon a showmg
of good cause and necessity, approve the use of fire-resistive wood as part.of class A |

listed assemblies, and may require addltronal mltrgatlon as warranted for the repalr or
- maintenance of exrstlng structures. . \

14. 04 120 Sectlon -1549 1507 of the 2013 201GCaI|forn|a Burldlng Code is amended by
addlng a section 4540—7 1507 1.1 ent|tled roof sheathlng to read as follows

When flnlSh roofrng material is removed to the existing open space sheathmg',' 8
minimum of 3/8-inch thick plywood sheathing shall be installed. The new sheathlng shall _

13
0000142278C031



comply with the requirements of the California Building Code. The sheathing shall be
installed such that the edges align over rafters and individual spaced sheathing boards. -
* The sheathing shall be attached to the existing spaced. sheathing with 6d common nails
at 6 inches (147mm) on center at supported edges and 6d common nails at 12 inches
(294mm) on center at mtermedlate supports. - ' :

. 14.04.130 - Sect|on 4643—7 1613.5.3 is added to Chapter 16 of the 2043 2016 Ed|t|on of
- the California’ Bu1ld|ng Code to read as follows. :

S 1613 5 ASCE 7,12.2.31, Exceptlon 3. Modlfy ASCE 7 Sectlon 12, 2 3 1
Exceptlon 3to read as follows:

e O Detached one and two-famlly dwelllngs up to two stories in helght of llght frame
construct|on S

14.04. 140 Sectlon 4643—8 1613.5. 4 is added to Chapter 16 of the 2043 2016 Ed|t|on of
the California Building Code to read as follows :

16438 1613.5.4 4 ASCE 7 Sectlon 12 11. 2.2.3. Mod|fy ASCE 7 Sectlon 12 11 2 2 3to
read as follows: -

12.11.2.2:3 Wood ‘Di'aphragms.‘ In wood dia’phr'agms,the cOntinuous ties shall be in
addition to the diaphragm sheathing. Anchorage shall not be accomplished by use of
toe nails or nails subject to withdrawal nor shall wood ledgers or framing be used in
cross-grain bending or cross-grain tension. The diaphragm sheathing shall not be
considered effectlve as providing ties or struts required by this section.

For structures assigned to Seismic Design Category D, EorF, wood dlaphragms
, supportmg concrete or masonry walls shall comply with the following:-

- 1. The-spacing of continuous ties shall not exceed 40 feet Added chords of dlaphragms
may be used to form subdlaphragms to transmlt the anchorage forces to the main
contlnuous crosstres : » - -

2. The maximum diaphragm shear used to determlne the depth of the subdlaphragm
shall not exceed 75% of the maximum dlaphragm shear .

14.04.145 - Section 47045 1704 6 of the 2943 2016 Edltlon of the Cahforma Burldlng
Code is amended to read as follows : 4

0000142278C031



Section 1704.6 Structural Observations. Where required by the provisions of

Section 1704.6.1 or 1 704.6.2, the owner or the owner’s authorized agent shall
employ a registered desg_grofesswns as a structural observer to perform
structural observations. Structural observatlon does not include or waive the
responsibility for the mspectlons in Section 110 or the special inspections in
Section 1705 or other section of this code. The structural observer shaII be one of

the followmg mdlwduals

1. The reglstered design grofesswnal resgonsmle for the structural design, or

2. A registered design professional designated by the registered dequ_
_ professional responsible for the structural design. ' '

Prior to the commencement of observations, the structural observer shall submit
to the building official a written statement identifying the frequency and extent of
structural observations.

The vowner or oWner’s authorized e'genf_t sh'ali coordinate and call a : '
preconstruction meeting between the structural observer, t:ontractors, affected

ubcontractors and SE&CIal mspectors The structural observer shall preside over
the meetmg The purpose of the meeting shall be to identify the major structural

elements and connections that affect the vertical and lateral Ioad resisting

systems of the structure and to review scheduling of the required observations. A
15 | |

0000142278C031



record of the meetJ shaII be lncluded in the report submltted to the Bu Idmg
Official. ' >

‘Observed deficiencies shall be reported in writing to the owner or owner’s ‘
authorized agent, special inspector, con tractor and the BulldlrLcLOfflclaI Umn the
form prescribed by the BmldmgOff' icial, the structural observer shall submit to
the BurldmgOff‘ icial a written statement at each significant construction sta age

- stating that the site visits have h been made and identifying any reported
deficiencies which, to the best of the structural observer’s knowledge, have not
been resolved. A fi nal report by the structural observer which states that all ‘
observed deficiencies have been resolved is requrred before accegtance of the

work by the BurldmgOfflclal | : ' |

14.04. 147 - Section 4—194—54 1704 6.1 of the 2043 2016 Edition of the Callforma o
Buuldmg Code i is amended to read as follows.

170454 1704 6.1 Structural observatlons for selsmlc re5|stance Str"uctu"ral" ' .
observations shall be provided for those structures assigned to Seismic Design
Category D EorF, where one or more of the followmg conditions. exist:

1 The structure is cIaSS|f|ed as RISk Category III or IV in accordance W|th Table
1604.5. - - S P S SO o P

2. The helght of the structure is greater than 75 feet (22860 mm) above the
" . base '

3.The structure +sassrgned—te—$ersmre-9e5|gn—eategery—E is cIassrf ed as Risk |
Category | or i in accordance with Table 1604.5, and &gmateﬁhan—hye-stenes 3
, ene—stenes—abeve—grade—plane—a lateral deSIQn is requ1red for the structure or.

- portion thereof

j EXceptlon. One-story wood framed Grou‘p R-3 and Group U Occupan_cles Iessv_than ,
2,000 square feet in area, provided-the adjacent grade is not steeper than 1 unit vertical
in 10 units horizontal (10% sloped), assigned to Seismic Design Category D.

4. When so desngnated by the reglstered desngn professmnal responSIbIe for the
- structural design. L _ . )

5. When such observation is specifically required by the building otﬁcial.'

114.04.150 - Section 1705.3 of the 2043 2016 Edition of the Callforma Burldlng Code is
amended toread as foIIows o : , . R

1705. 3 Concrete Constructlon The speCIal lnspectlons and venflcatlons for concrete_ '
constructlon shall be as requnred by thls sectlon and Table 1705 3 TE -a

Exceptlons Spe0|al mspectlon shall not be reqmred for

16
0000142278C031



1. Isolated spread concrete footings of buildings three stories or less above grade
plane that are fully supported on earth or rock, where the structural design of the. .
footing is based on a specified compressive strength, fic, no greater than 2,500
pounds per square inch (psi) (17.2 Mpa) regardiess of the compresswe strength
specified in the construction-or used in the footing constructlon o

2. Continuous concrete footings supporting walls of bu1|d|ngs three stones or Iess in
height that are fully supported on earth or rock where: = a

'2.1. The footings support walls of light-frame construction; =~
2.2. The footings are designed in accordance with Table 1805.4.2; or

2.3. The structural design of the footing is based on a specified compressive .
strength, f'c, no greater than 2,500 pounds per square inch (psi) (17.2 Mpa),
_regardless of the compressive strength specified in the construction documents
or used in the footing construction. . :

3. Nonstructural concrete slabs supported dlrectly on the ground mcludmg .t
prestressed slabs on grade, where the effectlve prestress in the concrete is Iess
than 150 psi (1.03 Mpa).’ o

4. Concrete foundation walls ,construCted in accordance_with Table 1807.1.6.2.

17

- 0000142278C031 .




é

{
%

14. 04 160 - Exception 3 of Sectlon 4—705——14 1705 12 of the 2943 2016 Edition of the
California Bunldlng Code is amended to read as follows.

18

0000142278C031




1705.12 Special inspections for seismic resistance. Special inggections for
seismic resistance shall be required as specified in Sections 1705.12.1 through
1705.12.9, unless exempted by the exceptions of Section 1704.2.

Exception: The special inspections specified in Sections 1705.12.1 through
1705.12.9 are not regulred for structures s designed and constructed in accordance
W|th one of the foIIowmg_ : '

1. The structure consists of li tht-frame construction; the design spectral
response acceleration at short periods, Sps; as determined in Section 1613.3.4,
does not exceed 0.5; and the building helght of the structure does not exceed
35 feet (10 668 mm) : :

2. The seismic force- reS|st|ng system of the structure con5|sts of relnforced
masonry or reinforced concrete; the design spectral response acceleration at
short periods, Sps, as determined in Section 1613.3.4, does not exceed 0.5;
and the building height of the structure does not exceed 25 feet (7620 mm)

3. The structure is a detached one- or two-family dwelanot exceeding two
stories above grade plane, is not assigned to Seismic Design Category D, E or

19

/0000142278C031



F and does not have any of the followmg horlzontal or vertlcal lrregularltles in
'accordance W|th Section 12.3 of ASCE 7:

3.1 Torsional or extreme torsional |rregular| ty.

3.2 Nonparallel systems irregularity. "3 : :

3.3 . Stiffness-soft story or stiffness-extreme soft story |rregular|ty
3.4 Discontinuity in lateral strengh-weak story irregularity.

14.04.165 - Section 1807.1.4 of the 2(-)43 201 6Ed|t|on of the Callfornla Bunldlng Code is
. amended to read as follows :

1807 1 4 Permanent wood foundatlon systems. Permanent wood foundatlon systems
shall be designed and installed in accordance with AF&PA PWF. Lumber and plywood
shall be treated in accordance with AWPA U1 (Commod|ty Specification A, Use
Category 4B and Section 5.2) and shall be identified in accordance with Section
2303:1.8:1. Permanent wood foundation systems shall not be used for structures ’
assigned to Seismic DeS|gn Category D, E orF. '

14.04.170 - Section 1807.1.6 of the 2043 2016 Edltlon of the Callfomla Bu1ld|ng Code is
~ amended to read as follows.

- 1807.1.6 Prescriptive desi_gn of concrete and masonry foundation walls.. Concrete and
“masonry foundation walls that are laterally supported at the top and bottom shall be
permitted to be designed and constructed in accordance with this section. Prescriptive
design of foundation walls shall not be used for structures assngned to Seismic Des19n
Category D E orF. - . &

14.04.175 - Section 1809. 3 of the 2943 2016 Edltlon of the Callfornla Bunldlng Code is o
amended to read as follows

1809.3 Stepped footlngs The top surface of footmgs shall be level The bottom surface
of footings shall be permitted to have a slope not exceeding one unit vertical in 10 units
horizontal (10-percent slope). Footings shall be stepped where it is necessary to change
the elevation of the top surface of the footing or where the surface of the ground slopes
more than. one unit vertical in 10 units honzontal (10- percent slope) :

For structures assigned to Seismic DeS|gn Category D, E or F, the stepplng requnrement
shall also apply to the top surface of grade beams supporting walls. Footings shall be
reinforced with four No. 4 rebar. Two bars shall be place at the top and bottom of the
footlngs as shown in Flgure 1809.3. : .

20
0000142278C031



TR RECOWmND RO L
S 2

L. sEembRowDsmoN . -
. FlGUREfEDS3 . LTl
L " STEPPEDFOOTING:. -~ "- -

14 04. 180 Sectlon 1809 7 and Table 1809 7 of. the 2043 2016 Edltlon of the Callforma
Building Code are amended to read as follows - %

—

1809.7 Prescrrptlve footings for llght-frame construction. Where a specific desrgn is not
provided, concrete or masonry-unit footings supporting walls of light-frame construction
shall be permitted to be designed in accordance with Table 1809.7. Prescriptive footings
- in Table 1809.7 shall not exceed one story above grade plane for structures as3|gned to
< Selsmlc DeSIgn Category D E or F : : :

-TABLE 1809 7 T
PRESCRIPTIVE FOOTINGS SUPPORT!NG WALLS
OF LIGHT FRAME CONSTRUCTIONa By e

NUMBER or= FLOORS SUPPORTED V;’:)DOTT":,\?C'; THICKNESS OF
BY THE FOOTINGf FOOTING (mches)
(inches)

For SI: 1 inch = 25.4 mm, 1 foot = 304.8 mm

- 21
0000142278C031 ° '



a. Depth of footinge shall be in accordance with Section 1809.4.

. b.The ground under the floor shall be permltted to be excavated to the elevation of the
~top of the footing.

.sha#be—seaeed—net—mere—than—@—feet—en—eentep Not Adopted

d. See Section 1908 for additional requurements for concrete footmgs of structures
aSS|gned to Seismic DeS|gn Category C, D, E or F.

e. For thlokness of foundatuon walls, see Section 1807.1.6.

f. Footings shall be pefmitted to support a roof additioh to the stipulated number of -
floors. Footings supporting roof only shall be as required for supporting one floor.

14.04. 185 Section 1809.12 of the 29-13 2016 Edltlon of the Callfornla Building Code is
amended to read as follows

1809.12 Timber footings. Tlmber footlngs shall be permltted for buildings of Type V
construction and as otherwise approved by the building official: Such footings shall be
treated in accordance with AWPA U1 (Commaodity Specification A, Use Category 4B).
‘Treated timbers are not required where placed entirely below permanent water level, or -
where used as capping for wood piles that prOJect above the water level over
submerged or marsh lands. The compressive stresses perpendlcular to grainin

- untreated timber footing supported upon treated piles shall not exceed 70 percent of the
allowable stresses for the species and grade of timber as specified in the AF&PA NDS.
Timber footings shall not be used in structures assigned to Selsmlc Desngn Category D,
EorF. :

14.04.190 - Sectlon 1810.3.2.4 of the 2943 2016 Edition of the Cahfornla Bu1|d|ng Code
is amended to read as follows.

1810.3.2.4 Timber. Timber deep foundation elements shall be designed as piles or
poles in accordance with AF&PA ANSI/AWC NDS. Round timber elements shall
conform to ASTM D 25. Sawn timber elements shall conform to DOC PS-20. Timber
shall not be used in structures assigned to Seismic Design Category D, E or F.

22
0000142278C031



14.04.210 - Sectlon 4995—1—8 1905 1.7 of the 2043 2016 Edltlon of the Callfornla .
. Building Code is amended to read as follows.

~ 0000142278C031



18 Sectibn 14.1.4, and replace with

1905.1.7 ACI 318, Section 14.1.4. Delete ACI 318,
the following: ' '

T 14.1.4 — Plain concrete in structures assigned to Seismic Design Category C,

D,EorF.

14.1.4.1 — Structures assigned to Seismic Design Category C, D, E or F shall
not have_ elements of structural Qlain'co’ncrete, except as follows:

0000142278C031




- ~Concrete used for fill with a minimum cement content of two (2) sacks of
Portland: cement or cementlous materlal per cubic vard

(b) Isolated footlrys of plam concrete supponlmedestals or columns are
permitted, provided the projection of the footing beyond the face of the |
supported member does not exceed the footlng hlckness ‘ -

’ Lc) Plam concrete footmgs supgortmg wa lls are permltted prowded the
footmgs have at least two continuous longitudinal reinforcing bars.-:
Bars shall not be smaller than No. 4 and shall have a total area of not
less than 0.002 times the gross cross-sectional area of the footmg_A
minimum of one bar shall be provided at the top and bottom of the -

" footing. Contlnulty of relnforcement shall be prowded at corners andj" 3
|ntersect|ons DT ‘ : o

Excegtlons

Detached one- and two-famlly dwellmgs three storles or Iess in hgght and
constructed with stud- bearlnglvalls are permltted to have plam concrete

footlngs with at least two continuous longitudinal reinforcing bars not smaller o

-+ than No. 4 are permltted to have a total area of Iess than 0. 002 tlmes the gross ‘
- cross-sectlonal area of the footlng_ ; ; ‘ '

14.04.215 - Section 1905.1.is amended and Sections 4965:4-49 1905.1.9 thru __ |
4905-1-12 1905.1.11 are added to Chapter 19 of the 2943 2016 Edition of the Callfornla
, Bmldmg Code to read as follows BRI S A :

- 0000142278C031



1905.1 General. The text of ACI 318 shall be modified as indicated in Sections

1905.1.1 through 1905. 1.11

1905.1.9 ACI 318, Section 18.7. 5. Modlfy ACIl 318 Sectlon 18 7. 5, by addlj
Sectlon 18 7.5.7 and 18. 7 5.8 as follows:

18.7.5.7 Where the calculated point of contraflexure is not within the middle half
of the member clear height, provide transverse reinforcement as specified in ACI
318 Sections 18.7.5.1, ltems (a) through (c), over the full height of the member.

18.7.5.8 — At any section where the design strength, P, of the column is less
than the sum of the shears V. computed in accordance with ACI 318 Sections
18.7.6.1 and 18.6.5.1 for all the beams framing into the column above the level
under consideration, transverse reinforcement as specified in ACI 318 Sections
18.7.5.1 through 18.7.5.3 shall be provided. For beams framing into opposite =
sides of the column, the moment components are permitted to be assumed to be

of opposite sign. For the determination of the design strength, oP,, of the column,
these moments are permltted to be assumed to result from the deformatlon of the
frame i in any one prmcmal axis.

1905 1:10 ACI 318, Section 18.10.4. Modlfv ACI 318 Sectlon 18 10.4; by addmg
Section 18.10.4.6 as follows ' ,

18.10.4.6 — WaIIs and portlons of walls WIth Pu > 0. 35Po shall not be conS|dered to
contribute to the calculated shear struh of the structure for resistin ng-.
earthquake-induced forces. Such walls shall conform to the re%urements of ACl
318 Sectlon 18.14.

.26
0000142278C031



- 1905.1.11 ACI' 318 Sectlon 18 12 6 Modlfv ACI 318 bv addlng Sectlon 18.12. 6 2 as
) }follows T : , . .

18 12. 6 2 Collector and boundary elements in topplng slabs placed ovemrecast
floor and roof elements- shall not be less than 3 inches (76.mm) or 6 dy in . |
_ thickness, where dy is the dlameter of the lar jest relnforcement in the togp_g ;

~ slab. - ‘

14.04. 216 - Seetren—2394—9—1 2304 10.1 of the 2043 2016 Edltlon of the Callforma
Burldlng Code rs amended to read as follows '

At 2304 10:1 Fastener requrrements Connections for wood members shall be
designed in accordance with the appropriate methodology:in Section 2301.2. The -
number and size of fasteners ‘connecting wood members shall not.be less than that set
forth in Table 2304.9-4. 2304.10.1 Staple fasteners in Table 2304-9-14:2304.10:1. shall -
not be used-to resist or. transfer selsmlc forces in structures aSS|gned to Selsmlc DeS|gn
CategoryD EorF TR ' R

Exceptlon Staples may be used to resrst or transfer se|sm|c forces when the aIlowabIe
shear values are substantlated by cycllc testlng and approved by the burldlng OfflCIa|

14. 04 21 7 Sectron 239441—1 _2_314_12_5 of the _2043 2016 Edltron of the Calrfornla
‘,Burldrng Code.i IS amended to read as follows B G

2304147 2304 12 5 Wood used |n retalnrng walls and cnbs ‘Wood mstalled in retamlng

- or crib walls shall be preservatlve treated in accordance wrth AWPA U1 (Gemmedrty

Speerfreatrens—A—er—E) for soil and fresh water use. Wood shall not be used in retammg '
or cnb walls for structures assrgned to Sersmrc Design’ Category D,EorF."

14 04 220 Sectlon 2305 4 is added to Chapter 23 of the 2043 2016 Edltlon of the
Callfornla Buudlng Code to read as follows L .

2305.4 Qualrty of Nalls In Selsmlc Desrgn Category D, E orF, mechanlcally driven nalls :
used in wood structural panel shear walls shall meet the same dimensions as that
required for hand-driven nails, including diameter, minimum length and minimum head
diameter. No Clipped head or box nails are net permitted in new construction. The
allowable desrgn value for clipped -head nails in. existing construction may be taken atno
“more than the nail-head- area ratio, of that of the same size. hand -driven nails. .

14.04:225 - Sectlon 2305 5i is added to Chapter 23 of the 2943 2016 Edltron of the ‘
California Burldmg Code to read as follows.

2305 5. Hold down connectors ln Selsmlc Desrgn Category D E or F hoId down
connectors shall be. deS|gned to reS|st shear wall overturnlng moments using approved
_cyclic load values or 75 percent of the allowable seismic arthguak e load values that -

do not consider cyclic loading of the product. Connector bolts into wood framing shall
require steel plate washers on the post on the opposite sidé of the anchorage devrce

: 27 :
0000142278C031 ‘



Plate SIze shall be a minimum of 0.229 lnch by 3 mches by 3 mches (5 82 mm by 76
mm by 76 mm) in size. He : :

' hal#@%%)—wmneh—tu#uust—pne#t&eevemg#e—waﬂ—#ammg Hold-downs shaII be re-

tightened |ust prior to covering the wall framing.

14.04.235 - Sectlon 2308—9—3—1—866#!99—2308—9—3—2 2308.6.5; Flgure 2308 6.5.1and

Figure 2308.9.3-2 2308.6.5.2 of the 20132016 Ed}tten—ef—the Callfornla Bwldlng Code
are amended to read as follows

| 28
. 0000142278C031 '



29

0000142278C031




2308.6.5 Alternative bracing. An alternate braced wall (ABW) or a portal frame

- with hold-downs (PFH) described in this section is permitted to substitute for a
48-inch (1219 mm) braced wall panel of Method DWB WSP, SFB, PBS, PCP or
HPS. For Method GB, each 96-inch (2438 mm) section (applied to one face) or 48-
inch (1219 mm) section (applied to both faces) or portion thereof required by
Table 2308.6.1 is permitted to be replaced by one panel constructed in -
accordance with Method ABW or PFH. ‘ :

2308.6.5.1 Alternate bracéd wall (ABW). An ABW shall be constructed in o
accordance with this section and Figure 2308.6.5.1. In one-story buildings, each

panel shall have a length of not less than 2 feet 8 inches (813 mm) and a height of
not more than 10 feet (3048 mm). Each panel shall be sheathed on one face with
3/8-inch (3.2 mm) minimum-thickness wood structural panel sheathing nailed with
8d common or galvanized box nails in accordance with Table 2304.10.1 and
blocked at wood structural panel edges. For structures assigned to Seismic
Design Category D or E, each panel shall be sheathed on one face with 15[324
inch-minimum-thickness (11.9 mm) wood structural panel sheathing nailed with
8d common nails spaced 3 inches on panel edges, 3 inches at intermediate
supports. Two anchor bolts installed in accordance with Section 2308.3.1 shall be
provided in each panel. Anchor bolts shall be placed at each panel outside

- guarter points. Each panel end stud shall have a hold-down device fastened to
the foundation, capable of providing an approved uplift capacity of not less than
1.800 pounds (8006 N). The hold-down device shall be installed in accordance
with the manufacturer’s recommendations. The ABW shall be supported directly
on a foundation or on floor framing supported directly on a foundation that is
continuous across the entire length of the braced wall line. This foundation shall
be reinforced with not less than one No. 4 bar top and bottom. Where the
continuous foundation is required to have a depth greater than 12 inches (305
mm), a minimum 12-inch-by 12-inch (305 mm by 305 mm) continuous footing is
permitted at door openings in the braced wall line. This continuous footing shall
be reinforced with not less than one No. 4 bar top and bottom. This reinforcement
shall be lapped 24 inches (610 mm) with the reinforcement required in the
continuous foundation located dlrecthLunder the braced wall line.

Where the ABW is installed at the first ston/ of two-story buildings, the wood
structural panel sheathing shall be provided on both faces, three anchor bolts
shall be placed at one-quarter points and tie-down device upllft capacity shall be
not less than 3,000 pounds (13 344 N).

30
0000142278C031



2308.6.5.2 Portal frame with hold-downs (PFH). A PFH shall be constructed in
accordance with this section and Figure 2308.6.5.2. The adjacent door or window
opening shall have a full-length header. '

In one-story buildings, each panel shall have a length of not less than 16 inches
(406 mm) and a height of not more than 10 feet (3048 mm). Each panel shall be
sheathed on one face with a single layer of 3/8-inch (9.5 mm) minimum-thickness
wood structural panel sheathing nailed with 8d common or galvanized box nails
in accordance with Figure 2308.6.5.2. For structures assigned to Seismic Design
Category D or E, each panel shall be sheathed on one face with 15/32-inch-
minimum-thickness (11.9 mm) wood structural panel sheathing nailed with 8d
common nails spaced 3 inches on panel edges, 3 inches at intermediate supports
and in accordance with Figure 2308.6.5.2. The wood structural panel sheathing
shall extend up over the solid sawn or ‘glued-laminated header and shall be nailed
in accordance with Figure 2308.6.5.2. A built-up header consisting of at least two
2-inch by 12-inch (51 mm by 305 mm) boards, fastened in accordance with Item
24 of Table 2304.10.1 shall be permitted to be used. A spacer, if used , shall be
placed on the side of the built-up beam opposite the wood structural panel
sheathing. The header shall extend between the inside faces of the first fgll:_
length outer studs of each panel. The clear span of the header between the inner
studs of each panel shall be not less than 6 feet (1829 mm) and not more than 18
feet (5486 mm) in length. A strap with an uplift capacity of not less than 1,000
pounds (4.400 N) shall fasten the header to the inner studs opposite the
sheathing. One anchor bolt not less than 5/8 inch (15.9 mm) diameter and
installed in accordance with Section 2308.3.1 shall be provided in the center of
each sill plate. The studs at each end of the panel shall have a hold-down device
fastened to the foundation with an uplift capacity of not less than 3,500 pounds

(15 570 N).

Where a panel is located on one side of the opening, the header shall extend
between the inside face of the first full-length stud of the panel and the bearing’
studs at the other end of the opening. A strap with an uplift capacity of not less
than 1,000 pounds (4400 N) shall fasten the header to the bearing studs. The
bearing studs shall also have a hold-down device fastened to the foundation with

an_uplift capacity of not less than 1,000 pounds (4400 N). The hold-down devices

shall be an embedded strap type, installed in accordance with the manufacturer’s
recommendations. The PFH panels shall be supported directly on a foundation
that is continuous across the entire length of the braced wall line. This foundation
shall be reinforced with not less than one No. 4 bar top and bottom. Where the
continuous foundation is required to have a depth greater than 12 inches (305

‘'mm), a minimum 12-inch by 12-inch (305 mm by 305 mm) continuous footing is

31
0000142278C031



B

permitted at door openings in the braced wall line. This continuous footing shall
be reinforced with not less than one No. 4 bar top and bottom. This reinforcement

shall be lapped not less than 24 inches (610 mm) with the reinforcement required
" in the contlnuous foundatlon Iocated dlrectly under the braced wall line.

Where a PFH is mstalled at the first story of two-story buﬂdmgs, each panel shall
~ have a length- of not |ess than 24 mches (610 mm).

" *Note: For figure 2308.6.5.1 and 2308.6.5.2, structures asmgned to Seismic
Category D orE, sheathed on one face with 15/32 inch-minimum thickness wood
structural panel sheathin ng na|led with 8d common nails spaced 6 mches on panel

o dges 12 inches at mtermedlate sugports

' 14.04.250 - Section 2308.12.5 2308.6.9 of the 2013 2016 Edltlon of the Callfornla
Bu1ld|ng Code is amended to read as follows. .

2308—4—25 2309 6.9 Attachment of sheathmg Fastenmg of braced wall panel sheathlng
shall not be less than that prescribed in Table 2308-42.4-6£2304.9-1. 2308.6.1 or

- 2304.10.1, Wall sheathlng shall not be attached to framing members by adhesives.
Staple fasteners:in Table 2304.9.1 shall not be used to résist or transfer seismic forces
in structures assrgned to Seismic Design. Category D E or F o

Except|on Staples may be used to resist or transfer selsmlc forces when the allowable
shear values are substantrated by cyclic testlng and approved by the burldlng official.

All braced wall panels shall extend to the roof sheathing. and shall be attached to
parallel roof rafters or blocking above with framing clips (18 gauge minimum) spaced at
maximum 24 inches (6096 mm) on center with four 8d nails per leg (total eight 8d nails
per clip). Braced wall panels shall be laterally braced. at each top corner and at
maximum 24 mches (6096 mm) mtervals along the top plate of dlscontlnuous vertlcal
framing. -

14. 04. .257 - Section 3109. 4 4 2 1 IS added to the 201 6 Cahfornla BurldnLtLCode to
read as follows L : : 4

Fences reqylred In addltlon to the regmrements in the Callforma Bu1ld|ng Code, '
a barrier in compliance with section 3109.4.4.3 of the CBC is requlred to |solate _
the pool or any other bodies of water over 18 mches deep from r@ghbon ng

propertles and public ways

" Exceptlon When the sw1mm|ng_pool or any other bod|es of water over 18 mches
- deep is fully enclosed around its perimeter by an enclosure complymg_
B Cahfornla Bu1|d|ng Code Section 3109 4.4. 3

. 32
0000142278C031



14.04.258 - Section 8-408 of the 2013 2016 Edition-of the California Building Code
entitled 2043 2016 Edition of the California Historical Burldrng Code is amended by
adding the followrng L . s L et

4. The use of wood on the exterior side of exterior walls shall be prohibited in the
- Extreme, high and moderate fire hazard severity zones as identified by the Pasadena
'Fire Department.. S _

Exceptlon In the moderate fire hazard seventy zone, the fire code offlmal may, upon a
showing of good cause and necessity, approve the use of flre-reS|st|ve wood as part of
class A listed assemblies, and may require additional mrtrgatlon as warranted for the

" repair or mamtenance of exrstmg structures

" 14.04.260 - Section R301.1.3:2 of the 2043 2016 Edltlon of the Callfornra ReS|dent|aI ,'-
Code is amended to read as foIIows

'R301.1.3.2 Woodframe structures The buﬂdlng offlcra| shaII requrre constructron o
documents to be approved and stamped by a California licensed architect or engmeer
for all dwellings of woodframe construction more than two stories and basement in
height located in Seismic Design Category A, B or C, notwithstanding other sections of
law; the law establishing these provisions is found in Busmess and Professrons Code
Sectron 5537 and 6737.1. : = ' A

The building official shall require construction documents to be approved and stamped'
by a California licensed architect or engineer for all dwellings of woodframe construction
more than one story in helght or wrth a basement Iocated in Selsmrc Desrgn Category
Do,D1,DzOFE - Q J.' :

14. 04 265 - Section R301 1.4 is added to Chapter 3 of the 29—13 2016 Ed|t|on of the -
Callfornla Resrdentlal Code to. read as. foIIows

R301.1.4 Seismic desrgn prowsmns “for buﬂdlngs constructed on or into slopes steeper
than one unit vertical in.three units horizontal (33.3 percent slope). The design and
construction of new buildings and additions to existing buildings when constructed on or
into slopes steeper than one unit vertical in three units horizontal (33 3 percent slope)
shall comply with Sectlon 1613 9 of the Burldlng Code ‘

14. 04 267 - Section R301.2.2.3.8 is added to Chapter 3 of the 2—043 2016 Edltlon of the
,Callfornla Resrdentlal Code to read as follows. . : .

R301 2.23. 8 Anchorage of Mechanlcal Electrical, or Plumblng Components and
Equipment. Mechanical, electrical, or plumbing components and equipment shall be
anchored to the structure. Anchorage of the components and equipment shall be -
designed to resist loads in-accordance with the International Building Code and ASCE

7, except where the component.is. posrtlvely attached to the structure and flexible -
connections are provided between the component and assocrated ductwork, prprng, and’
condwt and either : ' ,

| | 33
00001422780031



1. The component weighs 400 Ib (1,780 N) or less and has a center of mass Iocated 4 ft
‘(1 .22 m) or less above the supporting structure; or : :

2. The component weighs 20 |b (89N) or less or, in the case of a d|str|buted system B
Ib/ft (73 N/m) or less.

' 14.04.270 - Section R401.1 of the 2043 2016 Edition of the California ReSIdentlal Code
~ is. amended to read as follows.

R401. 1 Appllcatlon The prowsuons of this chapter shall control the de3|gn and

constructlon of the foundation and foundation spaces for a#t buildings. In addition to'the . |

prowsnons of this chapter, the design and construction of foundations in areas—prene—te

flooding flood hazard areas as established by Table R301.2(1) shall meet the h

provisions of Seci Section R322. Wood foundations shall be deSIgned and installed in -
accordance with AF&PA AWC PWF.

Exception: The prov13|ons of this chapter shall be permitted to be used for wood
' foundatlons only in the followmg S|tuat|ons ’ .

1.1n bu1ld|ngs that have no more than two floors and a roof

v 2, When interior basement and foundatlon walls are constructed at lntervals not
- . exceeding 50 feet (15 240 mm). 06 - :

'Wood foundations in Seismic Design Category Do, Dy or D2 not be permitted. -

- Exception: In non-occupied, single-story, detached storage sheds and similar uses
other than carport or garage, provided the gross floor area does not exceed 200 quare
feet, the plate height does not exceed 12 feet in height above the grade plane at any

point, and the maximum roof projection does not exceed 24 inches. ' -

14.04.275 - Sectlons R403.1.2, R403.1.3 and R403.1.5 of the 2043 2016 Edition of the
Callfornla Resudentlal Code are amended to read as fo||ows

" 0000142278C031



R403 1.2 Contmuous footmgm Seismic Design Categorles DOLQ1 and D,. Exterior
walls of buildings located in Seismic Design Categories Dy, D1 and D, shall be .
-supported by continuous solid or fully grouted masonry or concrete footings. All
required interior braced wall panels in buildings located in Seismic Design -

Categorles Do,_D1 and 02 shall be supported on contmuous foundations.

R403.1.3.6 Isolated concrete footulgs In detached one- and two-famlly dwellum_ :
that are three stories or less i in height and constructed with stud bearing walls,
isolated plaln concrete footings supporting columns or pedestals are permltted

R403.1.5 Slope. The top surface of footings shall be level. The bottom surface of
_ footings shall not have a slope exceeding one unit vertlcal in 10 units horizontal =
(10-percent slope). Footings shall be stepped where it is necessary to change the ,
elevation of the top surface of the footings or where the slope of the bottom
surface of the footings will exceed one unit vertical in 10 unlts horlzonta J10-

Qercent sloge)

For structures Iocated in Seismic Design Categories Do, D1 or D, stegped
footings shall be reinforced with four No. 4 rebar. Two bars. shall be place t the
- top and bottom of the footings as shown in Figure R403.1.5. '

: S 35
0000142278C031.



o RECOMEND: m_
EEE ¥

/ / mr.zsrmmnmmom
(mnomumrnn -

T smn
(TN il v

srtm:o romumoss |

b FlGURER4315 STEPPEDFOOT!NG o LA

14.04.280 - Sectlon R404. 2 of the 2043 2016 Edition of the California Resrdentlal Code
is amended to read as follows.

‘R404.2 Wood foundation walls. Wood foundation walls shall be constructed-in
accordance with the provisions of Sections R404.2.1 through R404.2.6 and with the
details shown in Figures R403. 1(2) and R403.1(3). Wood foundation walls shall not be
used for structures Iocated in Seismic Desngn Category Do, D4 or Do. -

' 14 04 282 - Section R501.1 of the 2043 201 6 Edition of the Callfomla ReS|dent|aI Code-
is amended toread as follows

R501.1 Application. The prowsnons of th|s chapter shall control the desrgn and

. construction of the floors for all buildings including the floors of attic spaces used to -
house mechanical or plumbing fixtures.and equipment.- Mechanical or plumbing fixtures -
and equipment shall be attached (or anchored) to the structure in accordance W|th '
Section R301.2.2.3.8. '

14.04. 285 Llnes 37 and 38 of Table R602. 3(1) of the 2943 2016 Edltlon of the
Cahfornla Residential Code are amended to read as follows.

Staples shall not be used on other waII sheathmg as fasteners in table R602.3(1).

14.04. 290 - Footnote "b" of Table R602.3(2) of the 2043 2016 Edition of the Cahfornla
Residential Code is amended to read as follows. oz ‘

b. Staples shall have a minimum crown width of 7/16 “inch on diameter except as noted.
Use of staples in roof, floor, subfloor, and braced wall panels shaII be prohlblted in
Seismic Design Category Do, D4, orD,.

36
0000142278C031



14.04.295 - Figure R602.10.6.2 of the 20432016 Edltlon of the Callforma Resrdentral o
Code is amended to read as follows. A

- Minimum 15/32" thick wood structural panel sheathing on one face shall be required.
Glavanized box nails shall not be used, portal frame with hold downs at detached

garage door openings shall be double portal frame (two braced wall panels) type at both
ends. Single portal frame shall not be used. Minimum width of portal frame shall be 24
inches with 15/3_21'_ thick wood str,uctural_panel sheathing fastened to the _fr_arne, -

14.04.315 - Sect|on R902 1 1. 1 is added to the 2943 2016 edltlon of the Cahfornla K
Resrdentlal Code to read as follows e

All roofmg materlal in the very-hlgh and moderate flre hazard seventy zone must be

class A. No wood roof covering material shall be installed on any structure located in the

very high, high and moderate fire hazard zones as identified by the Pasadena Flre s

Department. All other roof covering materials in other zones shall be class A or B.

~ Exception: In the moderate fire hazard zone, the fire code official may, upon a showmg
of good cause and necessity, approve the use of fire- resistive wood as part of Class A
listed assemblies, and may require addltlonal mltlgatlon as warranted forthe repair or

“maintenance of existing structure '

14 04.400 - Section AG100.3.4 AV1 00, 3 1 is added to the 2013 ed|t|on of the Callfornla
" Residential Code to: read as follows.

Enclosure (fence) required: In. addition to the requirements in the California Residential
Code, a barrier/enclosure is required to isolate the pool or any other bodies of water
over 18 inches deep from nelghborlng propertles and public ways. = - o

Exception: When the swimming pool or any other bodles of water over 18 mches deep
is fully enclosed around its perimeter by an enclosure per sectlon AG4OQ—3 AV1 00 3 of '
, the California Residential Code. -

14.04.500 - Section 101.3 of the 2043—ed+trenef—the 2016 Cal|forn|a Green Bu1ld|ngs k
Standards Code is amended to read as foIIows L S Lo

Section 101.3 Scope The provisions of this code shall apply to the planning, /destgn; ‘
operation, construction, use and occupancy of every. newly constructed building or

. structure, additions or alterations to existing: burldmgs unless othen/vlse lndlcated in th|s
code throughout the State of Callforma

-

It is not the intent that this code substitute or be |dent|f|ed as meetlng the certlflcatlon
reqwrement of any green building program. SRR i

- 37
0000142278C031



14.04. 502 Sectlon 301 3 of the 2043—ed+trer+ef-the 2016 Callfornla Green Burldlngs -
Standards Code is amended to read as follows. « :

' Nonresrdentral addrtlons and alteratrons. The provisions of individual sections of
Chapter 5 apply to newly constructed buildings, building additions and/or building
alterations (for occupancies within the authority of California Building Standards

Commission). Code sections relevant to additions and-alterations shall only apply to the

portions of the building being added or altered within the scope of the permitted work.

A code sectron will be designated by a banner t6 indicate where the code section only
applies to newly constructed buildings {N} or to add|tlons and alterations {AA} When the
_code sectlon applies to both no banner will be used. :

14.04.504 - Section 307.1 and section 307.2 is added to the 2—943—edrtrerref—the 6
Callifornia Green Burldlngs Standards Code to read as follows. = '

307.1 Buildings required to comply with Tier 1. include the following:

1. Municipal 'buildings of 5,000 quare feet or more of new construction,

2 Nonresidential buudlngs with 25,000 square feet or more of new constructlon

3. Tenant rmprovements of 25 000 square feet or more, |

4. Mixed use and mu|t|-fam||y residential buildings of four storles in helght or. more
- 307.2 Burldmgs requrred to comply with Tier 2 include the followrng '
1. New Municipal buildings, - o | "

2. Municipal burldlng renovatlons of 15 000 square feet or more,

-3 New commercral type buildings of over 50,000 square feet or more.

~Note: Where there are practrcal difficulties involved in comp|y|ng with the threshold
levels of a Tier, the enforcing agency may grant modifications for individual cases. The
enforcing agency shall first find that a special individual reason makes the strict Ietter of
the Tier impractical and that modification is in conformance with the intent and purpose
of the measure. The details of any action granting modrfrcatron shall be recorded and
entered in the files of the enforcing agency.

: _

-38

J

0000142278C031

k|



- 14.04.506 - Sections 4.106.5.1 through 4:106.5.4 are added to the 2043ed4tren—ef—the "
2016 California Green’ Burldmgs Standards- Code to read as follows.

4.1086. 5 1. Cool Roof. For new buildings and additions.or alteratlons to existing. roof
'framrng, rooflng materlals must comply W|th sect|ons 4, 106 5 2 4 106 4 and table '
4, 106 5. . _

4.106.5.2. Cool Roof for Reductlon of Heat Island Effect Roofrng matenal shall comply
with the followrng : .

‘4 106. 5 3. Solar: Reﬂectance Root" ng matenal shall have a mlmmum 3-year aged solar -
reflectance equal to or greater than the values specmed |n Table 4.106.5. . j o

4.106.5. 4 Them1al Emrttance Rooflng materrals shall have a Cool Roof Ratrng Councrl "
(CRRC) initial or aged thermal emrttance equal to or greater than those specmed in
Table 4.106.5. BRI 7 o WoEeE ; oo .

Solar reflectance values shall be based on the'ag'ed ”r‘eflec'tahce‘ 'vaer of the rOOfing
product or the equation in Section A4.106.5.1 if the CRRC certified aged solar
 reflectance are-not available. Certified thermal emittance used in'the Solar Reflectance.

Index Calculation-Worksheet (SRI-WS) developed. by the Energy Commrssmn may be ,
either the lnltlal value or the aged value listed by the CRRC. i3

EXCEPTlONS e EE TR
e :,1 Roof repalr e

2. Roof replacement when the roof area bemg replaced is equal to or Iess than
o 5 0% of the total roof area or " ; :

3 Burldmg mtegrated photovoltalc (BlPV)

TABLE 4.106.5
l " MINIMUM 3-YEAR AGED SOLAR _ B
| ROOF SLQPE,;; . REFLECTANGE . THERMAL EMITTANEE .
212 ] T Y AR R
T E T

0000142278C031




14.04.510 - Sections 4.202 - 4.202.1.1 are added to the 2013 edition-of the 2016
California Green Buildings Standards Code to read as follows. '

_ Sectlon 4, 202 Renewable Energy. Sections 4.202.1 and 4.202.1.1 shall apply to
reS|dent|aI multifamily, mixed use buildings.

40 -
0000142278C031



- 4.202.1. Space fore Future Electrical Solar System Installation [N]. Comply with
Section 110.10 of the California Energy Code. 4.202.1.1. Future access for -
Electrical Solar System [N]. For new buildings or when an existing service is
. relocated to new construction area, a minimum of one mch electrical conduit
- shall bgprowded from the electrlcal service equipment to an accessible location
_of the attic or other location suitable for future connection to a solar system The
conduit shall be labeled as future access for electrical solar system The
electrlcal panel shall be slzed to accommodate the |nstallat|on of future electncal
solar system. ' :

Exceptlon Buildings not requwed to provnde a solar zone per Sectlon 110 10 of the '
Cahfornla Energy Code. - .

14.04.516 - Sectlon A4106.53— A4 106.5.3 of the 2043-edition-of-the 2016 California
Green Building-s Buildings s Standards Code is deleted and Tables A4.106.5.1(1)

- through A4.106.5.1(4) of the 2013 California Green Buudlngs Standards Code are |
amended to read as follows. :

, , 41
0000142278C031 :



A4.106.5.3 Solar Reflectance index altematwe Solar Reflectance index (SRI) equal to

or greater than the values

TABLE A4.106.5.1 (1)

TIER 1-LOW RISE RESIDENTIAL

| | MINIMUM 3-YEAR AGED .
ROOF SLOPE - SOLAR =~ ETMF:E'TT,\’:‘(':‘E
REFLECTANCE |
<2:12 0.68 - 0.85.
>2:12 0.28 085
TABLE A4.106.5.1 (2)
TIER 2-LOW-RISE RESIDENTIAL
) MINIMUM 3-YEARAGED N
ROOF SLOPE SOLAR E-Kﬂl-:ill?x\lA(I)_E
R REFLECTANCE - o
212 0.70 085
3212 034 - 085
TABLE A4.106.5.1(3) - .
TIER 1 - HIGH-RISE RESIDENTIAL
BUILDINGS, HOTELS, AND MOTELS
MINIMUM 3-YEAR AGED e
ROOF SLOPE - SOLAR ',Ehﬂﬁm&_
REFLECTANCE
212 0.68 0.85

0000142278C031

42




52112 | 0028 | 085

TABLE A4 106 5. 1(4)
TIER 2 - HIGH-RISE RESIDENTIAL
BUILDINGS, HOTELS, AND MOTELS

B MINIMUM 3-YEAR AGED -
ROOF SLOPE | SOLAR EL":E?:"[\?CLE
| REFLECTANCE ANGE
R R R oy 7o
—— T N T

14.04.526 - Sectlon A5:106. 11 2.3 of the 294%edﬂren—e£the 2016 Callfornla Green
Building Standards Cods is deleted and Tables A5 106.11.2.2 {BSC} and A5. 106.11 2 3
~of the 2013 edltlon of the Callfornla Green Buﬂdlng Standards Code. are amended to .
read as follows : - '

43
0000142278C031




TABLE A5.106.11.2.2 [BSC]

TIER 1
“MINIMUM 3-YEAR AGED
ROOF SLOPE | SOLAR | THERMAL EMITTANCE | SRI
| REFLECTANCE | |
<212 | o068 T oss
>212 | o028 | 08 ]

TABLE A5.106.11.2.3

| MINIMUM 3-YEAR AGED
TIER 2 ROOF SLOPE | ' SOLAR THERMAL EMITTANCE | SR
B REFLECTANCE |
212 | 034 | oss

. Section 4. Title 14, Chapter 14.28 of the Pasadena Munlcmal Code is amended as -
follows:

A. By gmendi_ng Section 14.28.010 to read as fpllows: LI

14.28.010 - California Fire Code adopted. v
Except as is otherwise provided for in this chapter by specific provision, the minimum
standards, provisions and requnrements for the safe construction and maintenance of
property, facilities, conditions, materials, equipment, fire prevention and alarm systems,
and the general supervision thereof for the purpose of combating and control of fire and
fire hazards and abatement of same, within the corporate limits of the city, shall be in
accordance with the provisions and in the manner prescribed by the California Fire
Code, 2013 2016 Edition ("California Fire Code") in its entirety, as published by the -
International Code Council and including Appendix Chapter 4 and Appendices B
through D, and |, all as compiled, adopted, and subsequently amended bythe
_International Code Council, California State Fire Marshal's Office, California Building
‘Standards Commission, or City of Pasadena. One copy of the above publications is on

44
0000142278C031




file for publlc inspection and they are.adopted and mcorporated herem as if fully set :
forth in th|s chapter :

14. 28.020 - Changes and add|t|ons to the adopted code— o

1. Sectlon 101 1 of Chapter 1 of the 2016 Cahforma F|re Code is amended to read as ‘
follows: N

These regulatlons shall be known as the F|re Code of the Clty of Pasadena herem ,
referred to as “th|s code AT e ~ : - S :

2. Sectlon 104 of Chapter 1 of the 2016 Callforma F|re Code is amended by addlng
Sectlon 104 12 entltled “Cost Recovery, to read as follows .

Where an emergency s1tuat|on is caused or exacerbated by a w1llful act a negllgent act,
or a violation of the Fire Code, Building Code, or any other applicable law, ordinance or
- regulation, the cost of mitigating and securing any emergency that is within the
responsibility of the Fire Chief is a ¢charge against the person who caused the
‘emergency or who caused the circumstances leading to the creation of the emergency.
Damages and expenses incurred by any public agency providing mutual aid shall
constitute a debt of such person-and shall be collectible by.the Fire Chief for proper
distribution in the same'manner.as in the case of an obligation under contract
expressed or implied. Expenses as stated above shall include, but not be limited to,
equipment and personnel committed and any payments. required by the public agency
to outside business firms requested by the ‘public agency fo mltlgate or secure the .
emergency, monitor remedlatlon and clean up. ‘

3. The exceptlon in Sectlon 105. 6 27, ltem 1, of Chapter 1 of the 2016 Ca"fornla F|re
"Code is'amended to read as follows: " - N

Exceptlon A permit is not required for lndlwdual contamers with a 20-gallon (45.5 L)
~water capacity or less, or 40 gallons (75 7 L) cumulatlvely, servmg occupancres in"
Group R—3

4. Sectlon 105 of Chapter 1 of the 2016 Callfornla Flre Code is amended by changmg
Sectlon 105. 7 4 entitled "Cryogemc Flu1ds "to read as follows

A constructlon permlt is required for installation, alteratlon or closure of cryogenlc flu1d

- storage systems where the system capaCIty exceeds the amounts listed in Table
105.6.10. Maintenance performed in accordance Wlth this code is not conSIdered an

alteration and does not requ1re apermit. .

5. Sectlon 108 of Chapter 1 of the 2016 Callfornla F|re Code is deleted in its entlrety

0000142278C031



Section 109 3 of Chapter 1 of the 2016 Callforma Fire Code is amended to read as
~ follows: - :

Violatidn benalties Persons who violate any provision of this code or shaII fail to
comply with any of the requirements thereof or who shall erect, install, alter,

~ repair or do work in violation of the approved construction documents or
directive of the fire code official, or of a permit or certificate used under
provisions of this code, shall be guilty of a misdemeanor and subject to the
penalties specified in Chapter 1.24 of the Pasadena Municipal Code '

7. Section 111 4 of Chapter 1 of the 2016 Cahforma Flre Code is amended to read as
follows: :

Any person who continues any work after havmg been served with a stop work order
except such work as that person is directed to perform to remove a violation or unsafe
condition, shall be guilty of a misdemeanor and subject to the penalties specnfled in
_SeetlerH—OQ-zt—ef—tmeeede— Chapter 1.24 of the Pasadena Munlclpal Code

8. Section 510 of the 2016 Callfornla Fire Code is amended by addlng Section 510 1 1,
entitled "Dlsruptlon of Radio Communications," to read as follows .

The intentional |nstallat|on or use of matenals devices or other bundlng design features
which dlsrupt or otherwise decreases the effectiveness of radio communlcatlons shall
be prohlblted

46

0000142278C031




Section 510.3 of the 2016 California Fire code, entitled "Emergency responder .

radio coverage in existing buildings," is amended by changing Iitem 2 and adding
ltems 3 through 6 to read as follows: ' S

Existing occupancies shall comply with section 510.1 where one of the following
conditions exists: ‘ ,

1. Wherever existing wired communication system cannot be repaired or is
- being replaced, or where not approved in accordance with Sectlon 510.1,

Exception 1

2. Whenever the fire code official determines that compllance is required for
the protectlon of the health and safety of the public or emergency- responders

3. Whenever additions result in an additional level above or below gradtior a
total increase of more than 1000 square feet (92.9 m?) or an increase of more -
- than fifty percent (50%) in the total floor area including mezzanines and
additional stories, whichever is less, regardless of ownership. Additions shall
be cumulative wit_h each application for building permit from January 1, 2008;

4. Whenever the value of alterations exceed fifty percent (50%) of the
replacement value of the structure, excluding the value of property and
contents. Alteration values shall be cumulative with each‘application for a
building permit from January 1, 2008. Expenditures for maintenance and
-repairs such as interior and exterior painting, carpeting, interior window
coverings, drapes, movable partitions, surface re-roofing or plumbing,
mechanical and electrical repairs shall not be considered when calculatmgthe
percentaL e of alterations;

o 47
0000142278003



8. Whenever there is an occupancy classification change to a more hazardous
use, as determined by the fire code official; or,

6. Whenever any existing Group R Division 1 occupancy is subdivided to
condominium or any non-residential occupancy is converted, in part or whole,

to a residential occupancy.

Ch J)ter 6 of the 2016 California Fire Code is amended by addlngLsectlon 610
entitled “Photovoltaic Systems”, to read as follows:

The fire code official may adopt such fire and life safety requirements as are
necessaw for the safe installation and operation of photovoltaic systems. Unless
‘and until spec|f' ¢ requirements are adopted, the current version of the Calnforma
Department of Forestry and Fire Protection, Office of the State Fire Marshal’s
“Solar Photovoltaic Installation Guidance” is adopted.

Section 903 of the 2016 California Fire Code is amended by adding Section
903.1.2, entitled "Minimum Fire S uppression Protection for New Construction," to
read as follows: '

All new'construction‘ shall be provided'with an approved automatic fire ,
suppression system throughout the buildin Hq¢wthout rega d to the criteria Ilsted
in section 903.2 et seq

Exception: The following types of construction may be exemJ;t from this sectlon
‘when amgroved by the fire code off' cial: o

1. Garanes carports and similar structures provided he pertion of the
structure is located more than 150 feet (45720 mm) from approved fire
department access; :

| ’ 48
0000142278C031



2. Utility sheds, gazebos, and similar structures of less than 120 square feet
- -(11.15 m®) provided no portion of the structure is located more than 150 feet
(45720 mm) from approved fire department access; ; :

3. Fences and open trell|ses and

4. Other similar structures as deemed appropriate by the fire code official.

Sectlon 903 of the 2016 Callfornla Flre Code is amended by addmg Sectlon -
903 1.3, entltled "EmstmgOccm)ancles to read as follows '

~J

EXIstln@ccupancles, with the exception of R-3.1 and R-4 occupancres, shall
comply with section 903.1.2 where one of the followmg condltlons exnsts

1. Whenever additions result in an additional level above or below grade ora

- total mcrease of more than 1000 square feet (92.9 m?) or an increase of more

- than fifty percent (50%) in- the total floor area mcludrrLCLmezzanmes and

- additional s storles whlchever is less, regardless of ownership. Additions shall
be cumulatlve with each appllcatlon for building permit from January 1, 2008. .
R-3 occupancies shall not be required to comply with this condition solely due
to the addition of an addltlonal IeveILunIess one of the criteria for an increase
of total ﬂoor area is. also exceeded o

o Whenever the value of alteratrons exceed f|fty percent (50%) of the
replacement value of the structure, excludlrL(Lthe value of property and
~_contents, as determined by the Building Official. Alteration values shall be
cumulative with each application for a building permit from January 1, 2008.'
Expenditures for maintenance andﬁgalrs such as interior and exterior
pamtlrLtharpetlng, interior wmdow covermgs, drapes, movable partitions,
surface re-roofing or Qlumblng, mechamcal and electrical repairs shall not be
- considered when calculatlngthe percentage of alterations; :

3. Whenever there is an oc_cupancy classification chanie-to a"m'ore hazardous
use, as determined by the fire code official; or, PR

. 49
0000142278C031



4. Whenever -any emstmg Group R Division_1_occupancy -is subd|V|ded to
- condominium or any non-residential occupancv is converted |n part or whole,
to a reS|dent|al occupancy , .

Section 903 of the 2016 California Fire Code is amended by adding Section
903.1.4, entitled "Partial Automatlc Fire Suppression Systems Prohibited,"
'to read as follows:

o Whenever an automatic fire suppression system is installed for any portlon
of any building or structure, an automatic fire suppression system shall be
mstalled for the entire burldrng or structure. :

Flndlng Topog;a_phlc and cllmatlc-Narrow and wmdlmiccess roads to hillside
areas, and hot, dry weather and seasonal winds result in increased exposure to
fire risk. Additionally, the increased use of decreased property line setback -

development increases the community risk from fire spread. The California Fire
Code recognizes the benefits of fire sprinklers in requiring installation in new

- structures. Partial fire sprinklers protect only limited areas of the structure and
 provide less protection than complete systems. This amendment continues the

existing prohibition of partial fire sprinkler S)Lstems in order to decrease the rrsk
of conflagratlon wrthm the communltv -

, 50
0000142278C031



Section 903 of the 2016 California Fire Code is amended by addlngLa sentence at
the end of Sectlon 903 3. 5 entltled “Water su pphes” to read as follows L

H draullc calculatlons shall rnclude a 10% reductlon from the source

Sectlon 903 of the 2016 Callfornra Flre Code is amended by addrnla sentence at

~ the end of Section 903.3.5.1 2 entitled “ReS|dent|aI comblnatlon serwces” to

read as follows:

Combination ser\»li-ces"'are n'otvk'a'l’loWed for NFPA 13R systems.

51
0000142278C031



Finding: Geologic- Pasadena is located within a seismically actlve zone and i is
. near several active fault lines. Residential domestic water supplies are generally

" not as seismically resilient as fire sprinkler systems. For example, m the event a

porcelain fixture broke in an earthquake, a fire suppression system usinga .
. combination water supply could be compromised, whereas a fire sprinkier

system with a dedicated supply could still be functlonal Thls amendment

mcreases the survwabllltv of flre _s_grlnkler systems ‘

‘Section 907 of the 2016 Callfornla Fire Code is amended by changmg the first
‘parag@ph of Section 907.2, entitled "When requ|red—new bulldlng s and -
structures," to read as follows:

For new construction of 10,000 square feet (929 m?) or more, an approved
automatlc fire alarm system shall be installed in compllance with this code and

52

00001422780031



NFPA 72. At a minimum, smoke detectors, or otherlisted and approved detection
devices, shall be installed in all electrical, mechanical, storage; conference or
similar rooms. Listed and approved alarm notification appliances providing both
audible and visual notification shall be mstalled throug_rlggt the bmldeq__
comLIance wnth thls code and NFPA 72 .

~ Section 907 of the 2016 Callforma Flre Code is amended by changmg Sectlon ¥
907.3, entitled "EmstmgOccuBanCIes," to read as follows -

Ex1stquoccqpancles shall comply WIth sectlon 907 1 5 where one of the
following cond|t|ons exists:

, 1. Whenever addltlons result in an additional level above or below grade, or a
total increase of more than 1000 square feet (92.9 mz) or an increase of more
than fifty percent (50%) in the total floor area mcludmg mezzanines and

53
0000142278C031



addmonal stories, whichever is less, reqgardless of ownership. Additions shall
be cumulative with each appllcatlon for bu:ldlrm permit from January 1, 2008;

2. Whenever the value of alterations exceed fiftv p'ercent (50%) of the
replacement value of the structure, excluding the value of property and
contents, as determined by the Building Official. Alteration values shall be
cumulative with each application for a building permit from January 1, 2008.
Expendltures for maintenance and repairs such as interior and exterior
painting, carpetin ng, interior window coverings, drapes, movable partitions,
surface re-roofing or plumbing, mechanical and electrical repairs shaII not be
' conS|dered when calculating the percentage of alterations;

- 3. Whenever there is an occupancy classification change to a more hazardous
_use, as determlned by the fire code official; or,

4, Whenever anxemstl ﬁcLGroup R Division 1 occupancy is subdlwded to
condominium or any non-re5|dent|al occupancv is converted, in part or whole,
to a residential occupancy.

5. Where required byAChapter_ 46.

Section 908 of the 2016 Callfornla F|re Code is amended by adding section 908 7,
entitled “Requirements”, to read as follows:

All emergency alarm control panels shall be UL 2017 or UL 864 Listed. All
sensors shall be UL 2075 Listed. All Detection and Alarm systems shall be -
powered and supervised as required for fire alarm systems NFPA 72. Secondary
power supplies shall be calculated for 24-hours equipment standby time plus
emergency standby duration calculated for the longest modeled release rate or 5-
minutes, whichever is the longest duration. Visual alarms shall be blue.

0000142278C031



Sectlon 1008. 1 10 of the 2016 Callfornla F|re Code is amended l;v deletlng th
xceptlon ‘ oo _ : , e

‘Section 2403 2 of the 2016 Callfornla F|re Code is amended to read as follows:

Tents and membrane structures haancLan area in excess of 100 square feet (9.5
m?) shall not be erected, operated or maintained for any purpose without f‘ rst
| obtammga germlt and apjroval from the fire code official. ‘

Excegtlons.

1. Tents used exclusively for recreational camping purposes.

- 21. Section §064 2701 of the 2016 California Fire Code is amended by addmg Sectlon
5001.6.14-12701.6.1.1, entitled "Temporary Facmty Closure " to read as follows ‘

Unless othervwse specified, a temporary facility closure shall last not more than 180
calendar days. The fire code ofﬂcnal may authorize one 180 calendar day extensnon

22. Section 5003 2703 of the 2016 Callfornla Fire Code is amended by addlng Sectlon
5003.2.9.3,2703.2.9.3 entitled "Mlmmum Testlng,“ to read as follows '

- At a minimum, all tanks, prlmary storage, secondary. contalnment momtorlng systems ‘
release prevention and mitigation systems, and other safety equipment or systems for .
the storage, use or handling of any hazardous material shall be tested for proper
function as described by manufacturer's or design specification, whichever is more .
stringent, prior to the lntroductlon of a hazardous materlal : :

1 23. The first paragraph of Sectuon 5704.2.7.4 3404 2 7.4 of the 2016 California Fire
Code is amended to read as follows: , ‘ o

Stationary, above-ground tanks shall be equipped with. a’dditio‘nal Ve'nting that Wlll relleye
excessive internal pressure caused by exposure to flres Emergency venting devices

shall be listed and approved. Emergency vents for.Class |, Il and lIA liquids shall

not discharge inside buildings. This requirement shall also apply to each
compartment of a compartmentallzed tank, the interstitial space. (annulus) ofa A
~ secondary contalnment-type tank and the enclosed space of tanks of closed-top dike .
construction. ~ ; -

0000142278C031



ventsiee@lassJ—H—and—mAlmaldsshaanetdlsehargmnsrde-beMdmgs Additionally, this

requirement shall apply to spaces or-enclosed volumes, such as those intended for
" insulation, membranes or weather shields that can contain liquid because of a leak from
“the primary vessel or can inhibit venting during fire exposure. The insulation, membrane
__“or weather shield shall not interfere with emergency venting. The venting shall be
installed and maintained in accordance with Section 22.7 of NFPA 30.

| 24. Section §704.2.7.5-8 3404.2. 7 5 8 of the 2016 California Fire Code is amended, by
deletrng the exceptron

25. Section 5704.2.8.44 3404 2 8.14 of the 2016 Callfornra Fire Code is amended to
read as follows:

Emergency vents shall be vapor tight and shall not be allowed to discharge msrde the
vault. Long-bolt manhole covers shall not be allowed for this purpose.

26. Section 5204—2—964 3404.2.9.6.1 of the 2016 Calrfornra Fire Code is amended to
read as follows:

Storage of Class | and Il liquids in above-ground storage tanks outsrde of burldlngs is
prohibited within the City of Pasadena.

27. Section 5706-24-4 3406.2.4.4 of the 2016 California Fire Code is amended to read
as follows:

The storage of Class I'and Il quwds in above ground storage tanks outS|de of burldrngs.
is prohrblted within the City of Pasadena.

28. Section 5896—2 3506 2 of the 2016 Cahfomra Fire Code is amended to read as. / |
follows: o

Storage of flammable cryogemc fluids in stationary contarners outsrde of burldmgs is.
prohlblted within the City of Pasadena.

29. Sectron 6494—3 3801 .3 of the 2016 California Fire Code is amended to read as .
foIIows o

Where a single container is more than 20 gallons (75.7 L) in. water capacrty, or the
aggregate water capacity of LP-gas containers is more than 40 gallons (151 L) the
-mstaller shall submit constructron documents for such lnstallatlon

30. Section 6404 3801 of the 2016 California Fire Code is amended by addlng Sectlon'
6494—4 3801 A4, entrtled "Mrnlmum Testrng," to read as follows . , ~

* At a minimum, all tanks prlmary storage, secondary containment, monitoring systems _
release prevention and mitigation systems, and other safety equipment or systems for .
the storage, use or handling of any hazardous material shall be tested for proper '
function as described by manufacturer's or design specification, whichever is more
stnngent prror to the mtroductron of a hazardous material. ‘

' 56
0000142278C031 ° '



31. Sectlon 61042 3804.2 of the 2016 California Fire Code is amended to read as
follows

Within the City of Pasadena the aggregate capacity of any one lnstallatlon shall not
exceed a water capacity of 2,000 gallons (7570 L).

32.-Appendix Aof the-Califoraia.Fire-Code s deletodin-its-ontiretys

*Section 3804 2 of the 2( 2016 Callforma Fire Code is amended by changmg the first
paragragh to read as. follows

An a Jproved emer;qency v0|celalarm comuunlcatlon system shall be Qrowded in
every existing high-rise building which exceeds 75 feet (22860 mm) in height
measure in the manner set forth in Section 403 of the California Building Code.
Such system shall provide communication from a location avallable to and
desi gnated by the f' ire code offlclal to not less than all p_bllc areas. R

Section 4901 of the 2016 California F|re Code is amended by adding Sectlon
4901.1.1, entitled “Referenced Standard,” to read as follows:

The International Wildland-Urban Interface Code, 2009 edition is gdopted asa
referenced standard for the enforcement of this chapter and other related
sections of the Fire Code. Where conflicts occur between the provisions of

adopted codes and the referenced standard the growswns of the adogted codes
shall apply.

Section 4905.2.1 of the 2016 California Fire Code is amended by adding Section
4910.1.1.1, entitled “Wood Roof Covering Prohibited,” to read as follows: =

No wood roof covering material shall be installed on any structure located in the -
Extreme Hazard, High Hazard or Moderate Hazard Fire Severity Zones as
identified by the Pasadena Fire Department.

57

0000142278C031



35, A lix L is deloted in its.ontirety.

Sectlon 4906.2 of the 201 6 California Fire Code is amended by changlng item 2 to
read as follows: . , .

Land designated as Moderate, High and Very ngh Flre Hazard Severity Zone by
cities and other local agencies. .

36. Appendix A of the 2016 California Fire Code is deleted in its entiret)L

37. Exceptlon 1 in Section B105.2 of A_ppendlx B of the 2016 California Flre Code
is amended to read as follows

1. A reduction in required fire-flow of up to 50 percent, as approved, is allowed
when the building is provided with an approved automatic sprinkler system
installed in accordance with Section 903.3.1.1 or 903.3.1.2. The resulting fire-flow
shall not be less than 1,500 gallons per hour (5678 L/min) for the prescribed
duration as specified in Table B105.1. Table B105.2 is amended by replacing
“25%” with “50%” wherever “25%” appears in the Table.

38, Section D103, 6 of Appendlx D of the 2016 Callforma Flre Code is amended to
read as follows

Where r gmred by the fire code official, fire apparatus access roads shali be
marked with permanent NO PARKING-FIRE LANE signs complying with the
current specifications maintained by the Pasadena Department of Public Works.

30. Appendices J throuLhM of the 2016 California Fire Code are deleted i in their

 entirety.

B. By amending Section 1 4.28.040 to read as_ follows:
14.28.040 - Board of appeals.

All sections in the respective 2016 codes pertaining to the board of appeals are hereby
amended in their entirety to read as follows:

In order to hear and decide appeals or orders and determine the suitability of alternate
materials and methods of construction and to provide for reasonable interpretations of
the provisions of these codes, there shall be and there is hereby created a board of
appeals, composed of the mayor and the city council. The city clerk shall be the
secretary to the board. The board may adopt reasonable rules and regulations for
conducting its investigations and shall render all its decisions and findings on contested
matters, in writing to the building official, with a duplicate copy thereof to any appellant
or contestant aﬁeqted by any such decision of findings, and may recommend to the c1ty
council such new legislation, if any, as is consnstent therewith.

: 58
0000142278C031 \



C
The city council mayprescribe by resolution, to employ at the cost and expense of the
city, such qualified individuals as the board, in its discretion, may deem reasonably
necessary in order to assist it in its investigations and in making its findings and
decisions. B ~

'SECTION 5. This ordinance shall take effect 30 days after its p'ublicétion.
Signed and approved this ___dayof ., 2016 |

Terry Tornek

14

~ Mayor of the City of Pasadena

| HEREBY CERTIFY that the foregoing ordinance was adopted by the City Council of .
the City of Pasadena at its meeting held this ____ day of , 2016, by the following
vote: ‘ '

Ayes . :
Noes

Absent _

Abstain

Date Published:

Mark Jomsky, CMC
City Clerk

j?ved as to form:

\;}/ank L. Rhemrev
ssistant City Attorney

. 59
0000142278C031 '



