
) 

Introduced by: __ _....;.... __ · ·_' _·_:· --,---

ORDINANCE NO~ ______ _ 
• • • . • I . <.' -~· . ' . ' . . , I . ·. 

AN · ORDINANCE · OF: THE CITY· OF · PASADENA AMENDING PASADENA . 
. MUNICIPAL CODE TITLE 14 AND ADO,PTING TITLE .. 24 .0F .THE ., ... . . 
· CALIFORNIA CODE OF .REGULATIONS INCORPORATING THE. 2016 . 
. CALI,FORNIA_.. BUILDING CO.DE AN-D AP~i;NDIX . CHAPTE~~ C, .D, ~, -·.h AND 
J; THE 2016 CALIFORNIA RESIDENTIAL.BUILDING CODE AND APPENDIX 
E, G, AND H; -'tHE~20.16 CALIFORNIA MECHANICAL COPE;; THE 2016 ·, . '. 
CALIFOR~IA PLUMBING CODE; ·tHE '201'6 CAt:IFORNIA ELECTRICA.L . .· .. ) . 
CODE; THE 2016 CALIFORNIA FIRE CODE; ,AND. THE.2016 CALIFORNIA:·· 
GREEN· BUILDINGS STANDARDS CODE ·· ··. · · ... · 

.. I 

Whereas the City. of. Pasadena is. adopting the 2016 ec:Jitiof)s of the . California Buildi_n-g : · 
Code, Reside.nti~l Building.Code, .Fire Code anq Green:.Building Stpndards Code· and is 

. making· cert~in amendt:nents·. th~reto; and '. · ... · .. ' . . . ' ' . r '• .. 

Whereas State law requires that a city must adoptspecific:-finding's ·as t~ - the .· 
-~- . . . ~~ . 

topographic, g~olqgicat, ... . and climatjc ·condition.sJo· just~fy ;th~ -a~endment to thes~ .. · 
codes; .. 

Now; Therefore, the City Council. of .the City :ofPasaden~- finds ~s-- follow~: • 

1. v\i'ith' respect to. the ~mend~~'rits'to the statE{ code' ~s ~effdrth 'in ·. Sectibns 14.04.1 02, . 
•• • • ; • - • • • - - • _- • : • • • • • • ' . • : ~ •. • : • • -_ ' . ' • • ' : • . • .• • .._ • •• J • : • • • • -

_1 10, 1 t5, ~.58, and ·315·,bei6W, · · 
, , . . r · , '. 

' I • • ' : ', : ~ '• 
.. ·: 

Justification: ·Topographic and Climatic·. ·Pasadena is hillside areas·have.· narrow and 
winding acces~ roads, which 'makes .. timely response by ·large -fire suppression .vehicles . 
difficult. 'Addilionally, -long"·periods of dry, hot weather,· combined wit~ unpredictable···: 

. seasonal winds' (SantaAna.wlnd conditions) result ih· irfcreased exposure to fire risk. · 
These am·endrhents prohibit, the use of wood as exteriorwall ··~:ind · roof covering· material 
in very high, 'highand·· moderate fire ·hazard areas af.ld:require·other exteriorwall finishes 
and roofing materials ·tcfhave a class· A assembly.· This will' reduce the potential for rapid 
spread of fire through'outthe city du'ting ·pe'riods ofstrohg se~isonal winds .. 

· ... · \.:; 

2. With respect to the. amendments·· t<;> the state .. podes as set~orth. in $ection 14~04J:1-00 
below, 

, ('; • < • I ' <, < , \ ' • • ' o ., ' 

Justification Climatic: Because of the .risk of. 9~1ays in fire resc~~· r~spons~ time dl)e ·. 
. to traffic congestion and due to the high number of swimming pools within close 

. . . . ." . . . . ·. '.'' . . . . (\.· 

proximittto small children _because oflocal .clhnate·which ·makes poo·l ownership 
d~sirable; pool· barriers ate necessary. Additionally, the amendments correct an . · .. ·: · · ·'; 
ad~inistrative :error ·in the State's adoption which intended to ;provide pool barriers:-The 

1 
00~0142278C031 

• - • : .. . ·1 ... ' 



amendments are consistent with barrier requirements previously_ in force in the City. of 
Pasadena. 

3. With respect to the amendments to the state codes as set forth in Sections 
14.04.120; ·130, 140,"145, 147, 150,-155, 160, 170, 175, 180, 205, 210, 215," 216, 220, 
225,235,260, 267,·275~ · 2.82~ 285,290, 2Q5, and "305 below, . 

Justifica_tio~: Geologic . . Pasadena is·s.ituated prirnarily on the Sierr~ ·Madre-fault near 
the base of th:e San Gabriel-Mountains. ·other fauits ._:n~~r .or in the· city are the Eagle 
Rock fault (originally termed· the San Rafael_ fault):~ Verdugo. Hills fault, ··and. Elysian Park 
fault. .Said faults are gene~ally. considered major Southe~ California· earthquake faults 
which may expedence rupture at any time. -Review of damage resL,Jiting from the 
January 17, 1994 Northridge Earthquake revealed significant damage to many buildings 
throughout the So-uthern California region. The referenced amen·dments are ne·cessa,.Y 

. to implement improved design standards, to use current recognized standards and . 
referenced recently· published, and to reduce the risk of persoriallnjury; loss of -life and 
.property damage within structures. . . . 

4. With respect to the. amendments to the state code as set forth in Se.ctiohs ·14.04.165; 
· 185, 190, 217, 270~ and 280 below, 

Justification: -Local Cli_matic and Geological Conditions. The ·greater Los Angeles 
region is a densely popul-ated area having builc~ings and structures _constructed o~~-r and 
near~ vast ~rray of fault systems capable of producing major earthquakes, ii1Ciuding . 
hut not limited to the recent 1994 Northridge E_arthquake. In addition, the r~giori is within .. 
a climate ~.y~tem capable-of produ.cing major winds, ;fire and rain related disast~rs, 
including but not limitrd to those -caused by the Santa Ana winds and.EI Nino (or La · 
Nina) subtropic~l-like weather.· This region is especially susceptible to more active 
_termite and --wood attapking insects and microorganisms. The proposed. rnod_ification ·to .-. 
prohibit the use of wood. foundatio"n systems as well" as limit prescriptive ·design 
-provisions in-an effort to .mitigate potential problems.or:deficienGies dtJe. to the . 
proliferation of wood-destroying organisms and therefore need to be incorporated into : 
the code to assure that new buildings and structure~fand · additions or alterations to · · 
existing . buildings or structures. are designed and constructed in accordance with the 
scope and objectives ofthe International Residential· Code. 

\ . 

5. _·With respect to the amendments to the state code as set forth in Sections14.04.500, 
501; 502, 504, 506, 508, 51 o, 512; 514,' 516, and 518 below, 

Justification: Local environmentai/Ciif'llatic._Con_ditions. The greater Los Angeles ... 
. . . . . -

region is a densely populated area having residential·buildings constructed within a · 
. region wh~re environmental resour,~es .are ~carce due to varying and occasional · . 

2 
. 0000142278C03-1 



:immoderate temperatures -and ,weather conditions. The_ proposed modification to 
. require . higher efficiencies of "ene'rgy··usage ahd ·greater· beneficial use of environmental' . 
material will be achieved with the- proposed expansion of the Mandatory and Voluntary 
requirem~nts arid therefore need to be' incorporated· into the code to assure ·that new · 
residential ~rid non-residential: buildihgs·.ar~ designed -and constructed in accorda'nce . 
·with the scope and objectives of the Califorhia'Gteen Building--standards-Code. 

6. With respect to the ·amendments to the state :fire code'- as set forth. in section · 
14.28.020: items 3, 4, 24,- 31, ·32, 33, 34 and 36 below, the proposed-amendments are· · 
required due to _ topographic conditions: The in·creased use of decreased .property· line : 
setback ·development and increased development densities ·increase the· comr:nLniity risk 
from- fire or hazardous materials spread ·and-the number of persons· potentially · -
efidangered. The proposed amendrhents:allow"for either-increased reyiew and·· 
mitigation,--or: de-creased hazard to the-community, or both: : ·- ·-

7_. With respect to -tn_e amenpments to th~ stat~ ffre code as setforth in :section ,.·: . 
14.28~020 jtems 13·, 14? 20~ 25, a_nd 2~. below,. th~propos~d, ·am:endment~are ~~qui_red . 
due to topographic and climatic conditions. Narrow and_ winding access roads to 
hillside areas;-and hot, dry weather arid -seasonal wirids result -in increased exposure to 

. : I 

fire risk. The 'increas~d use of decreased-property line setback·developmenfand -_ · . 
increased ~evelopment densities increase the community risk from fire· spread and the · 
number of persons pote-ntially ·endangered.· Th-e proposed amendments ·allow for either· 
increased review and mitigation, or decreased hazard to the community -through · 
increased use of automatic fire extinguishing systems and/or the decreased use of -
combustible exterior. materials, or both. · 

I - . . . ' 

8. With ·respect to the amendments to the state fire ~ode as set forth in section 
14.28.020 items ·15, and ·16 below·, the proposed amendments· are required due to 
geologic conditions. Pasadena- is located within a seismically active· zone artd is near 
several active fault ·lines. Residential dome·stic ·water supplies ·are generally not as· 
seismically resilient as fire sprinkler systems. For example~ ·in the ·event a porcelain: · 
fixture broke in an eartt)quake, a fire suppression -system· using· a combination water · · · · 

. . supply ·could be compromised-, 'whereas a fire sprinkler system with' a dedicated supply·. 
could still be functional. T~is amendm_ent increases the survivability of fire sprinkler 
systems. Tne propos~d amendments allow for either increas~d review and mitigation, , 
decr~as~d hazard to the )co-mmunity by_~ilow!rig f~r ·lirnited leakage or other water loss · 
in caiculat_ions and disaUowiri.g a inore_:v~lnerableJype_.o(system, 9r'both~ . . . . -

:· . . . ' . . . . . . ' . . . - . ,· ~ - . ·. . : ... . ~ ' : ~ .., . . . ' . .. . : . ';_ ·. . 

9. With respect to the amendments:to· the state fire code as set forth in section. 
14.28.020 'ltems·12·and.1-9 below, 'the· ptoposed ar11endments ·are ·requited due to 
topographic -conditioh.s; The-increased- use of-decreased property· line ·setback -· · 
development, increased use of ·light weight construction, . increased inte'rmingling of_:: . ' . 

·3 . 
0000142278C031 



hazardous occupein,cies with less hazardous occupancies that h_ave been . historic~lly 
separated, and increased development densities increase the community risk·· from fire -
spread and other hazardous ,conditions a·nd t~e number of persons potentially . 
endangered. The proposed amendments allow.for the increased efficacy and safety of 
the response to emergencies by ensuring acceptable emergency communications ~nd .. 
thereby improving- ~he safety of both the~community and emergency _responders . . , 

10. With respect to the amendments to the state fire code as set forth in section · .. 
14.28.020 item 38 be_low, the proposed amendments are required due to _topographic · 
conditions. The increased use of decreased _property line setback development,. 
increased use of light weight con~truction, increased intermingling of hazardous 
occupancies with less ha?ard9us occupancies that have been historically separated; _ 
and increased development densities increas~ the-community risk from fire spread and 
other hazardous conditions and the number of persons potentially endangered~ T~is _ 
amendment increases public and firefighter safety by increasing the likelihood that 
automatic fire extinguishing systems wiH' ha've sufficien{ water flow capacitY' to contain or 
extinguish significant ~ires before the fire· eXtends to adjacent areas or structures. -

11. With respect to the amendments to the state fire code as set forth in section 
14.28.020 item 15 below, the proposed amendment is required due to geologic 
conditions. : Due to the City's significant ·use of groundwater, fire suppression systems 
experience an increased rate of mineral deposition que to dissolved minerals in the 
groundwater. This amendment mitigates the potential decreas~ in water flow caused by 
miner~l deposition. 

12. With respect to the am~ndment to the state fire code as set forth in section · 
. 14.28.020 items 17, 18 and 21 below, the proposed amendments are required due to 
topographic conditions. The increased use of decreased property line setback · 
development and increased development densities increase the community risk from . 
fire spread and increase the number of persons potentially endangered, and limits the 
space available in which ·emergency responders may operate effectively. Early and 
effective evacuation of building ocqupants increases the efficacy_ of fire attack a~d 
decre.~ses the risk of fire spread. The proposed amendments_ allow for either increased . . 
review and mitigation, or.decreased hazard to the. community, :or bQth. 

13.·With n3s.pect to -the ame(1dme~t to the state fire code as set forth ih secti.on · . . 

- _14.28.020 'item 30 below., the propbsed amendment~ ~re requir~d ' due to topographic 
conditions. The increased use of decreased property line .,setback development 
increases the community risk-from _fire-spread. Sm~ller flammable and combustible -
liquid -t~nks are a' lowed by code to be placed relatively. close to buildings and property 
lines. The installation of overfill prevention decreases the likelihooq that spills during the 
filling proce~s will -enc;:Janger structures-on the same br adjacent pr.operties. 

4 
0000142278C031 



14. With respect to the amendment to the state fire code as set forth· ih section_ _ 
14.28.020. item 25 below, t~e proposed amendments are required due to topographic 
conditions: The increased· use of decreased :property line setback qevelo-pment 

. increases the community risk fr.orri fire spread. Sm.alfer flammable· arid combustible ··· 
liquid tanks·· are-allowed by code to be -placed relcdively.c_lose.to· buildings and property · 
lines. 'AIIowlng th·e:·emergency venting ·of flammable· ana· combustible· vapors· within !: ·.: 

vauits greatly increases the likelihood of vapor explosions withih the ·vault. Allowing th~e · 
use of lohg~bolt 'mahhole covets as' a. means of em~rgency ~en'ting cre:ates ·a ' haz~rd 'to'. 
anyone nearby the manhole should an emergency release oc_cur without warning.· :· · · · 
Disallowing the practic,es of in-vault venting and. the use of long-bolt_ manhole covers · 
increases the public safety by requirin9 venti-ng to occur at' a_ safe location. · ··- . · 

15. For sections ·not : sp~btfied :above, no. e~presS._ .flndings are·required. under the .. . - . _ 
requirements established by sections 17958, · 17958.5, and· :17958-.t of the California -.. · 
Health and Safety Code as .the~e amendments are ac;tministrative in. nature, merely _. __ . 
provide clarification ot existi~g California. cod~ ~equi~ement,' .. or address· matters outs_ide 

. the scope of the above sections-~ . ' ' . - ' . . ' - - . ·,. ' . . . . 

Accordingly, the People of.the City of Pasadena ordain-as follows: :, 

SECTION-- 1. This .ordinance, .du_e_ to its length and correspondin_g p_ublication cost will __ 
be published by_ title· and _·sum_rnary as p~rmitte_d by .Section 508 of the Charter of the 
City of Pasadena. The ·approved summal)i of this ordinance 'is as-follows: 

~ .. - ,-:' ' 

. -

·Ordinance ·No. The ordinance··adopts the 2016 California Building Code~- the -
· 2016 California Resider)tiai _Code, the 2016 Califo_rni,a Me.chanical Code, the 2016 . 

California Plumbing. Code, the 2016 California Electric~! Code, the 2o1a· California Fire 
Code and the 2016 California Green Building Standard~ Code as required by state law . . 

·The ordinance. also provides for some amendm __ ents to these codes_ to -accommo<;tate · · 
special' topographic, geologiqal, and climatic conditionsfound in Pasadena consistent _ 
with state law~ Ordinance No. __ shall take effect 30 days after its publication by title · 
a_~d summ_ary. The full .t~xt of the ordinance is on .file .in the Gity C_l~rk's_ Office.'~ ,_ 

SECTION 2 ... Title 14,_ Chapter 14.03 of t_he Pasadena Municipal Code ·is . 
amended as follows: · . ~ .. 

. . ~ 

A. By amending -Section: 1-4.03:0_1 0 to ,read as follows: .. -· · ,' · 
.... . 

. '· :· ~ .. 

5 
0000 142278C031 

l. 



14.03.010 · • Adoption and filing 

Except as herein p~ovided by specific c;hanges, the administrative, organi4,ational and 
enforcement for the tech.nic~l codes which regulate the site preparation and , 
construction, alteration,. moving, demolition, repair, u~e and -occupancy of build.ings, 
structures .and building service equipment within the city shall be in accordafiC~ with the . 
provisi'ons ~nd in the m~nner prescribed in administrative pr~vis!ons . ofthe ~ 2016 -
Edition of the California Building Code, as publishe9 by the California Stat~· BL:Jilding 
Standards Commission. 

B. By amending Section 14.03.020 to read as follows: 

14.03.020 - Sectio~_ 101.1. of Chapter 1 Division II 9-f..thQ ~ 2016_ 
Cal_ifornia Building Code amended Title. 

This ordinance shafl .be ·known and cited as the Pasadena Building Code for Building 
Constru~tion Regulation, and will be referred to · herein as this Code. · 

C. By amending Section 14~03.030 to read as follows: 

14.03.030 - Chapter 1-Di-vision 11. Section 103.1 of the 2043 . 2016 California · 
Building Code, creation of enforcement agency is a·mended as ·foUows: 

There has been established heretofore in(this jurisdiction a code· enforcement agency 
entitled, The Planning and Community Development Department which employs a 
BuildirJg Official who shall be authorized to enforce the provisions of this code. 

SECTI9N 3. Title 14, Chapter 14.04 of the Pasadena MLinicipai _Cbae is amended a.s 
follows: 

A. By amending Section 14.04.01.0 to read as follows: 

14.04._01 0 ~. Adoption anq filing .. 

California Building Codes adopted. Caiifornia Code of Regulation Title 24 part 1 . 12~ The 
2013 California ~uilding Code Chapters 1 35 and ,A,ppendix Chapters C, H, I, and J; the 
2013 California· Residential Code and l\ppendix Chapters E, G, H, the 2013 California 
Green Building Standards Code, the 2013 California Electrical Code; The 2013 
California Mechanical Code; the 2013 California Plumbing. Code, a·nd 2013 California 
Fire Code all as published by the California Building Standards Commission and as 
amended by the State Department of Housing ,'\rid Community Development (HCD), the 
Division of the State 1\rchitect/Access and Compliance· (DSA//\C), and the State Office 
of State\vide Health, Planning and Development (OSHPD), The Office of the State Fire 
Marshal: all as published by the International Code Council. One copy of all of the 

6 
0000 142278C031 



. I 

above publications is on file for public inspection and is hereby adopted 'Nith the same 
force and affect as thoug_h set out herein in full. 

California Building Codes adopted;. California Code of Regulation Title 24 part 1-
12. The· 201·6 California Building Code Ch~pters 1-35 and Appendix Chapters C, 
D, H;l, and.J;. the 2016 California Residential Code Appendix· Chapters E. H. J, 
and V, the 2016 California Green Building Standards Code.~ the 2016 California 
Ele'ctrical Code; The·' 2016· Califon1ia Mecllanical·co~e; the ·2016 _California 

· Plumbing Code, and 2016 California Fire Code all as published by the California 
. .· . : . , . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . I , 

Building Standards Commission and as amended by the· State Department of 
Housing ·And Community Development CHCDl; the. :Divis.ion of the State 
Architect/Access and ComJ?Iiance (DSAIAC), and the State Office of Statewide 
Health, Planning and Developme.nt COSH PO), The ·Office of the State Fire Marshal · 

· (SFMl: all as published by the International Cod~ Council. One copy of all hof the 
above publications is on file for public Inspection and is hereby :adopted with the 
same force and effect as though set out herein in full. 

) 

·B. By am~nding .. se~tior114.o4.p15 ;tb_·:read -:a~ fo~lows: .:· . 

14.04:.015- Section"105.Z.1 is.addeo to Chapter 1.D.ivisioh u··section 105.2 ofthe2016 
Californ.fa . Building :·G~de to re_ad as. follow~. . . . . 

\ A zoning permit may be· requ·i-red f~r items· exempted frdm t>t1ildin.g permit requirements 
. under Chapter 1 Division II Section 1 05 .. 2. Exempted work shal·l. not violate any 
provisions. of this .cod~, :Fed~r~.l,. State,. Loc~l:laws, o~ regulation.s .. · 

C. By addin_g~~ctions 14 .. 04~Q20tqread as .. foUows: ... 

14.04.020- Section ·105.5 o~ the 2016·· California Build.ing·Code and Section R105.5 
of the 2016 California Re!;_iden~ial Building ~ode i.s am~nded to read as follows: 

te€h-Expiration~ Beg·i.nning ·Janualv 1', 2011, -~verv permit·issued by the Building 
Official under the provisions· of this Code shall eltpire· by limitation and become 
null and void if all work by said permit is not completed within the time limits 
specified ·.below from the date of issuance. of the building· perm.it: . 

. . . . . J 

. ·. :Construction ·Ty~e ·.Project Com~letion Tim'e 
.. -· ,. 

·-· 

Single-Family o.r Duplex .. . :. 24 months 

Multiple. Family {3+ unit~} 36 months 
. ... 

. . 

7 
0000142278CQ31 

'-.,__ 



I Non-residential 36 months 

-, 

a. Before. such work can be recommenced, a permit extension, as _ 
specified in Subsection A, shan be first obtained~ No permit shall be_ 
extended more than twice. - - -

b. Time limits will not be increased by issuance of subsequent building 
_permits for the sa'me project. . _ : 

c. When ·a project is divided into separate· permits by the applicant,' the -
work on. such permits is to be done concurrently, the time allowed to 
complete all work on-each separate permit shall be established from 
the initial permit issuance date.··_ 

- . . 

A. Extensions and Fees. 

0000142278C031 

-- . 
a. Any permittee holding an active permit may apply in writing for 

an extension of the time within which work under that permit · 
may be continued when, for good and satisfactory reasons, he 
c)r she is unable to continue work within the time required by · 
this section due to circumstances beyond the control of the 
permittee. The written request must demonstrate that: 

i. Due. to circumstances beyond the -owner's or permittee's 
control, construction could not be commenced, continued or 
completed in the authorized time period; 

ii. If the construction has started, substantial prog·ress has been 
made; 

iii . . The condition of the property presents no health or safety -
hazard; and, . ___ _ - · 

iv. · The continued delay will not create any unreasonable . 
aesthetic impact to the neighborhood or substantial economic. 
detriment to the neighboring property owners.- - -.. 

~J. 

b. The Building Official may extend the time for action by the 
permittee for a period not exceeding six calendar months. 
Payment of the building permit extension fee shall be required. 
The extension fee shall . be calculated as the greater of two 
percent (2°/o) of the estimated total project valuation or one
thousand dollars. 

c. Building permits shall not be extended more than twice, and 
each extension shall not exceed six months. 

8 



B. Appeals. If the property owner feels' aggrieved by the· determination . 
, · of the Building Official 'regarding the applicable time limit. or by the 

denial of an additional six-month extension, the property owner. may 
appeal to the Code Compliance . Hearing Officer within ten days of the 

. Building Official's decision. The a·ppellant shall pay a hearing appeal 
· fee ·at the time of filing an appeal' in an amoullt as shall be __ - · 

established from time to time by resolution of the City Council. The 
Code Compliance Hearing Officer shall notify the appellant in writing 

: of the date of the hearing on· the appeal, .and such notice shall be· 
sent at least -ten days before the date of the hearing.-which shall be 
held no late·r than thirty days after the filing of the appeal. 

D.By adding · Section 14.04.022 to read as foli~ws:· · 

14.04.022 Posting of Con~truction Signs. 

Except for single~familyconstruction · i~volvin:q only min·c,-rint~ri~r r~model, 
minor building permits, window change outs, re-roofs Or other minor 
building permits, one sign, visible from the street, must be.- posted -listing 

. project address, permit number, work description, name of Construction-
Company, contact nam·e of Constructi-on Company and phone. number . 
and/or if owner-builder contact name and phone number of owner. -The- sign 
shall also list the City's allowable construction hours and days pursuant to 
Pasadena Municipill Code Section 9.36 .. 070.- arid-clearly Identify the permit 
expiration date. Said sign shall be white in color as· bac-kground and a · .. 
minimum size of 24" -in height by 36;,- in Width with 1" high legible· black 
lettering. Posting of the required sign is the-.responsibility of the permittee, 
and such sign shall .be posted and ma_intahied at the construction site where 
it can be read by the. publi'c. This notice must. be posted prior to the start of 

· construction and displaced continuously until all permitted work is . _ 
inspected and approved by City ot' Pas~den~ Building & Safety Division • . 
Sign to be verified by .the City upon the first inspection. Signs shall be 

. , replaced ·if damaged, torn, faded, or if the ·.required inform at~ on is illegible, -
as determined by the Building Official. 

E. By adding. Section 14.04;024 to read as follows: 

14.04.024 Construction Site Fencing. 

9 
0000142278C031 



Whenever .a building permit is issued to construct, add to or alter a building 
or site, the building official may require temporary perimeter fencing to be 
installed and to be maintained in good condition. 

The installation of temporary fencing shall be required for the 'following 
projects: · · 

· ·1. Projects involve grading,·trenching or excavation activities, 
·2. The construction .area is visible from the public right~of-way with the 

exception of roof replacement, window change-outs with no framing 
work. 

3. There is outside storage of building materials, equipment, 
construction materials or equipment stored at the front of the 
property. 

4. The property is vacant during the duration of the construction. 
5. As determined by the Building Official 

The Building Official shall require the site to be temporarily fenced and 
screened 'on all sides for the duration of the constructio~ .project. Th~ 
height of the fence shall be· seventy-two inches (72) .high .with gates to 
access the:site. The screening material shal·l be tightly secured to the 
fencing, free of holes and without advertising .. The perimeter ·fencing may 
be removed.when there are no' remaining exterior construction activities · 
·visible from· the public right-of-way and there is rio longer visible outside 
storage of building materials·. equipment or fixtures or as determined by 
the ·Building Official. An address sign shall be installed and be visible from
public right of way at all perimeter points to iticlude the street name and 
'nu~ber of the site us.ing minimum six-inch high letters_ and numbers. and 
shall be _posted at the top of the _perime-ter fence or at least five feet from 
the ground. A "No Trespassing" sign~· conforming to the requirements of 
"c";alifornia Penal Code, Section. 602, shall be installed at all perimeter · ( 
access points, posted at the top of the perimeter fence or at least five. feet 
froni the grou-nd. · 

F. By amending Section 14.04.030 to read as follows: 

14.04.030 - Violations. 

All sections in the 2016 codes referenced in Section 14.04.010 herein pertaining to 
violations are amended in their entirety to read as follow~: 

It shall be unlawful for any person, firm or corporation to erect, construct; enlarge,· alter, 
repair, move, improve, remove, convert, or demolish, equip, use, occupy, or maintain 
any building or structure in the City, or cause same to be done, contrary to or in violation 

10 
0000142278C031 



of any of the provi'sions ·of this chapter. Any person, firm, or corporation violating ariy of 
the provisions of this Ordinance, shall be deemed guilty of a mi.sderriearior,"·and each 
such person shall be .. d~emed guilty of a separate offense for each and every day _or , 
portion thereof qudng which any violation of.a.ny .qf the provision~ of this Ordinance is .· 
COf'Timitted,- CO_ntinued, or permitted, and .. UpOO···Conviction Of any. SUCh Violation-such .· ... 
persons shall be punished by a. fine. of.-not .mote than one thousand dollars .($1 ,000) 01\ 

by imprisonment for not -more than o'ne-.( 1 Lye_ar, or by both· such .fine and lmprisonr:nent. 
. . ~ 

In addition to the above penalty provi~ions,- violation o'f ·any of the provisions of this 
chapter may be subject' to the administrative ·proceedings·· set forth ·in Chapte_r"-1.25 ·of 
this code. · · 

. . . . 

G. By ameridin_g Sectio_n_14.04.04Q to read ~:s foUows: 

14.04.040 ~ Board of appe_~l~> 

All sections in the respective 20·1·6 codes ·pertaining ·to·the Board ofAppeals are -hereby 
amended in their-entirety _to read · as ·follows: · · - . : · ' : · -· · · · : · : · 

ln. order to hear and decide appeals or orders and determine the suitability of alternate ' 
materials and~m'ethods a( construction arid to . provide for reason'able interpretations of . 
the provisions of these ·codes, there shall be and there is hereby created a Board of ... 
Appeals, composed ~f the,. Mayor and the City Cou_ncil_: . · · 

The city clerk shall-be the secretary to the Board~ The Board may ~dopt reasonable. ·. 
rules and regulations for conducting its investigations and shc;tll -render all its decisio~s · . 
and findings on cqntested matters, in writing to -the building official, with a duplicate GOPY 
thereof to any appellant or contestant affected by any such deci'sion :Of: findings, and 
miy recommend to the City Council such new legislation, if any, as ·is consistent 
therewith. · 

The City Council may pre~cribe ·by resoluti9n, to . employ. at the cost and .expense of the 
City, such qualified individuals as the Board, in its discretion; may dE}em reasonably 
necessary in order to assist . it in its investigations and in r:naking its findings and · · 

· decisions. · ·. · · .-· · 
, . 1 o ' ' 

H. By amending Section 14.o4.oso t~ read as follows: 
~ • • • • • • ' J • • "'. • • , • ~· •• • • ~ 

14.04.050 - Fees. 

·The counCil shall ·by resolution adopt a schedule offees\forthe permits issued pursuant 
to the ·2016 codes referenced .. in~ section 14·.04~010 and as amended he·rein. hereto. 

\. 

· I. By amending Section 14.04.080 to read as follows: . 
' , ··. 

14.04.080 - Moved stn..ictures: 

11 
.. 0000 142278C031 



.. Section 409 3410 of Part 10 the 2013 edition of the 2016_ California Building Cpde is 
amended by adding the follqwing: ·· 

Before a permit is issued, the buildh1g-mover shall furnish and file with the City _Cierk, a 
good and sufficient. bond in the· principal sum of $5,000.00 in favor of the City of 
Pasadena for the benefit of any person~ firm or corporation who may be damaged 
directly by the· moving ·of said building or structure~ provided that any -person, firm or · . 
corporation ·engaged in the business of moving buildings · may file with the City Clerk a 
surety bond in the sum of $10,000.00 .indemnifying the City for the purposes, and in that 
event such person, firm or corporation need not file the $5,000.00 bond herein above . 
required for any single moving ·operation. 

J. By 2016 amending s, 14.04.102,-14.04.110, 14.04.115, 14.04.120," 14~04.130,-
14.04.140, 14.04.145, 14.04.147, 14.04 .. 150, 14.04.160, 14.04.165, 14.04.170, 

·14.04.175, 14.04.1BO, 14.04.185, 14.04.190, 14.04.205, 14.04.210, 1·4.04.21-5, 
14.04.216, 14:04.217, 14.04.220, 14.04.225, 14.04.235, 14.04.250, 14.04.258,. 
14.04.260, 14.04.265, 14.04.267' 1.4.04.270, 14.04.275, 14.04.280, 14.04.282, 

. 14.04.285, 14~04~290, 14.04 .295, 14.04.315, 14.04.400, 14!.04.500, 14.04.502, .. 
14.05.500, 14.04.502, 14.40.504, _14.04.506, 14.40.516_, 14.~0 .. 526; deleting sections 
14.04.155, 14.04.205_, 1 ~.-40.305, 14.4Q.-501 '14.40~508, 14.40.51 ~' 14:.40.514, 14 .. 405_18, 
14~40.522, and 14.40.524; and adding section 14.04.257 as follows: 

1-4.04.100- Changes and additions to the adopted _2016 codes . . 

Pursuant t6 the Health and , Safety Code Sections 17358.5 and 17958.7, · the City 
. establishes the following local modifications. ·The requisite findings if .applicable for such 
requirements are set forth in the .ordinance. fact sheet accompanying this :ordinance. 

14.04.102 ... Section 701A~1 of the'2013 ~edition of the California-Building Code is 
amended to read as follows. 

. . . . . . . . . 

. Scope. This chapter ap-plies to building · materials, systems and/or assemblies -used in 
the exterior design and construction of new buildings, additions and alterations located 
within a Wildland-Urban Interface Fire Area as defined in Section 702A. 

14~04.11 0 - Section 1505.1 of the ~ 2016 California Buil_ding Code is amended to 
read as follows. 

General. Roof assemblies .shall be divided into the classes defined below. Class A, and 
B and C roof assemblies and roof coverings required to be listed by this section shall be 
tested in accordance with ASTM :E 108 or UL 790. In addition, fi-re-retardant-treated 
wood roof coverings shall be tested in accorda-nce with ASTM D 2898. ·The minimum -
roof coverings installed on buildings ~hall comply with Table 1505.1 based on the type 
of construction of the building. All roof assemblies and roof coverings shall be ·of not 
less than Class B. No wood roof covering material shall be installecJ .on any structure · 

. 12 
0000142278C031 



located ·in the· very ~igh, high arid moderate fire· hazard zones as -identified -·by the 
Pasadena ·Fire Department. ·· · ·. ' 

.... - . ··. ·· .. 
Exception: ·.:. ,I. 

-In the moderate fire hazard zone, the fire code official -may, upon :a shoWing of . . 
good cause and necessity, approved the use of fire-resistive wood as part of class ·A 
listed assemblies, and may· require additional mitigation as warranted, for the repair o'r 
~aintenance.-. of..existi~Jg: s~ruct~re~~ . ·: __ _ _ _) , 

-Skylights and sloped glazing that comply with Chapter ·24. or Section 2610.- . · ;:· 

14.04.115; ~ Section 1 f?05~6 of the ~ 2016 Edition of the Califorrii_a. Building Code is 
. . . . . •· ' . '·. . . .· . . ' . . . . 

amended to read as follows. 

Fire-retard~nt-trea~ed wood shingles and shakes. Fire-retardant-treated ·wood shingles 
· and shakes shall not be installed in the very high,· high and moderate fire zones . .Fire

retardant-treated wood shakes and shingles are wood shakes and shingles complying 
with UBC Standard 15~3 or -15-4 which _are ·impregnated by the ·full~cell vacuum;;. · ·. 

_. pressure process with fire-retardant chemicals, and which have been qualified, by ·usc·< 
Standard 15-2 for use_ on _Class A aRd or B GF-G roofs. 

Fi.re-retarda.nt-treated ~dod :sh~kes·· ~nd shingles shalrcom'ply.with ICC-ES-EG107. ~nd · 
with the weathering requirements contai.ned in Health and Safety Code Section ... 

· 131132.7(j). Each-bundle shall be~r labels from an ICC accredited-quality control agency 
identifying the_ir roof.:covering·_classification and indic~tingtl;leir compliaf1ce with ICC~ES 
EGI07 and with the weathering requirem~_nts contained .. in .Health and Safety Code .. 
Section _13-132.7(j).- · : _ _::; .. -. . , · ,. . . . . .. ::. · . . . 

Health and Safety Code Section 13132. 7(j). ·No wood roof cove·ring materials-shall 6e · 
sold or applied _in .this st~t~ UIJI~ss both of ~he follo,v.ving; conditions are . met: . -.. ·. . . 

(1) · . Themateri~l~ · ha~e; b~eh app;~ved .and -- list~~ bythe.State Fire_- Marshai-. as· · 
complying with the requirements .of this section.· .. . 

. (2) . . The mat~ rials-h·a~~:.passed at least five ~ear~ . of the_ to.:year nat~ra·l w_eathering : 
test. The-1 0-year natural weathering test required. by this· subdivision sh~ll be conducted 
in acc9rdance with standard 15-2 of the 1 994 edition of the Uniform Building Code at a 

·testing facility recognized .by the··state Fire 'MarshaL· . · · · .. , 

Exception: In the moderate fire ·hazard zone;, :the fire code official may, upon a·showing·
of good Qause 8f1d .necessity, approve the use o(fire-re.sistive wood as part. of class A. ) 
listed assemblies, cind may require 'additional mitigation as warranted, for the repair _or 
maintenance of existing structures. · · · · - · · · · · · 

14.04.120 - Section -1-aW 1507 of the. ·2013 ·201:6California Building. Code is amended by 
adding .a section - 1~10.71507.1.1 ·entitledroofsheat~ing to . r~ad as follows. 

. • ' .• . ! , ' . ' ' -;:.; .. : • .• .. •. . . . • 

When fihish roofing materi~d is removed to th·e existing ope~~space sheathing~ . a 
minimum ·of 3/8-inch thick plywood sheathing· shall be installed. The new sheathing shall 

f3 
0000 142278C031 . : ~ : : . 



comply with the requirements of the California Bui.lding Code_. The sheathing shall be 
installed su.ch that the edges align over· rafters and individual spaced_. sheat~ing boards. · 

· The sheathing shall be attached to the existing spaced. sheathing with 6d c9mmon nail.s 
at 6 inches (147mm) on center at supported edges and 6d common nails at 12 inches 
(294mm) on ·center at intermediate supports. · 

. I 
. . . 

14.04.130- Section 1613.71613.5.3 is added to Chapter 16 of the ·~ 2016 ·Edition ·of 
the California· Building· Code to read as follows. 

1613.71613.5 ASCE 7, ·12.2~3.1, Exception -3. Modify ASCE 7~ection 12.2.3.1 . :·· · · .. 
Exception 3 to read as follows: · · · · 

3. Detached one and two-family dwellings up to· two stories in height.of light frame · 
·construction.· · · · ·· · 

· . , 

14.04.140.- Section 1.613.8 1613.5.4 is addec.J to Chapter 16 of the -~ 2016 Edition of 
the_ California Building Code to· read as follows·. · · 

. . 
1613.81613.5.4ASCE.7, Se~tion 12.11.2.2.3. ModifyASCE 7, Section 12.11.2.2.3to 
rea·d as follows: · · \ · · · · 

12.11..2.2~3 Wood ·Diaphragms.· In wood dia-phragms, the continuous ties shall be in 
addition to the diaphragm sheathing·. Anchorage· shall not be accomplished by use of 
toe nails or nails subject to Withdrawal nor shall wood ledgers ·or framing be used -in 
cross-grain bending or cross-grain tension. The. diaphragm sheathing shall not be 
considereq effective as providing ti~s or ~truts requ_i~ed by this se.ction. . .. 

For structures assigned to' Seismic Design Category D, E or F, wood diaphragm~ 
. suppqrting concrete or. masonry walls shall comply:with the following: . 

. ·1. The-spacing of continuous ties shall not exceed40 feet. Added chords of diaphragms · 
may be tised to form subdiaphragms to transmit the· an·chorage forces to the ·main · 
continuous crossties~ : . . . 

.J 

. . 

2. The maximum diaphragm shear used to determine the depth of the subdiaphragm 
shall not exceed 75o/o of the rT)aximum diaphragm shear. 

14~04.145- Sectio·n 1704.5 1704.6 of the~ 2016 Edition of the California Building_ 
Code is am.ended to· ·read as follows. · ~ · · · 

1704.5 Structural Observations. 'l'/here required by the provisions of Section 1704.5.1 
· or 1704 .5.2, the shall employ a registered design professional ·structural observer to . 

perform structural observations as defined· in Sectio.n 1702'. · ~ 

,A,t the conclusion of the \vork included in. the. permit, the structural observer shall submit 
to the building official ~ 'llritten ~tatement that the site visits have_ been made _aFJd 

' 14 
0000142278C031 



· identify a:ny reported deficiencies that, to the · best of the structutat observer's 
kno,,•vledge, have not been resolved. 

The o,11ner .or O'llner's repres_entative shall co()rdinate and _call .a preoo.nstruction me~ting 
bet\'Jeeri the structural_ ol;>server, contractprs, affected subcontractors and _speCial . . 
'rns·pectors. The -'structural observe.~ shaii ·.P.-resi,de O'ler t_he meeting:_ The purpose ,of-tt~e . 
meeting ~hall pe to · identify the _ major structur~l eiEnnents 'and· con·nection.s .that. affect the 
vertica'l and 'lateral .lo.ad reslsti8g systerns of'the structure and 'to relJie'Ji scheduling of 
the required observations./\ record of the meeting shall be inciuded in 'the report ' 
submitted to the· building QfficiaL · · · · · .. · · 

Observed deficiencies shall be ·rpported in \;ritirig to the ·o~j;r;~r .or .ovineF's . _ . · 
representative, special inspector, contractor and the-building ·official: :upon the ter.m 
prescribed by the building official, the structural observer :shall submit to the building· 
·official a v1ritten statem~nt at. each significant _construction stage, stating that the site . 
visits have been made' ·and identifying ·any reported deficiencies \\'hich, to the best of the 
Structural observer's knO\VIedge, have not been· resoived~··,A, final .. report by the structural 
observer v1hich states tnat all ob~e~ed d~fioienc~es ~a~ · b~en .resolved is required . 
before acceptan¢a·· ofth_e \\!Qrk by the buildiflg. offidal. .· · · · · · .. . ... _- :· . .·• ' ' . . 

Section 1704.6 Struct~ral ObserVations.': 'Where required by the provisions of 
SE)ction . 1704.6.1 or -1704.6.2. the ·owner or·· the· owner's ·authorized agent shall 
employ a registered design professions as a structural observer to perform 
structural' observations. Structural observation does not include _or waive the 
responsibility for the .. h1spections in Section 11 ci or the speci-al inspections i·n 
Section 170.5 or other section ofthis code. The structural -observer shall be one of 
the following individuals: 

1. The registered design · professional responsible ·for the structu~al design, or 

2. A registered design professional designated by the registered design 
professional responsible for the structural design. . · · · 

Prior to the commencement of.. observations, the structural observer shall submit 
to the building· officiaf a written statement identifying the frequency and extent of 
structural observations. · · · · · 

The owner or ~wner's authorized agen-t shall coordinate and call .a 
preconstruction meeting between the structural observer, contractors, affected · 
subcontractors and special inspectors. The structural observer shall preside over 
the ineeting:l'he· .. purpose .of the. meeting.stiall be to ,identitv 'tile major structural .·. _ 
elements . and connections 'that affect the ve,rti'cal and lateral load resisti'ng ' 
systems of the structure and to teviev/ scheduling of the required· observations~ A 

15 
0000142278C031 



record ()f the meeting ·shall be included :in _the-report submitted to the Building · 
Official. - __ _ 

. . · . . . 

-Observed deficiencies shall be reported -in writing to the · owne·r or· owner's 
authorized agent, ·special· inspector,.- contractor and the· Building Official. Upon-the 
form prescribed by the Building Officiai, -the' structural observer shall submit to -
ttie Building Official a written statement ·at each significant construction stage 
stating that the site .visits have been made and identifying any repo-rted 
deficiencies which, to the best of the structural observer's -knowledge, have not : .. 
been resolved. A final report by the structural observer which states that all · 
observed deficienci-es' have been resolved is required-before acceptance -of the 
work by the --B.uilding OfficiaL · 

14.04.14'7- Section .17d4.5.f1704.S.1. ofthe·~ 2016 Edition of the CaUfornia _
B:uildi":g Code is amenqe~ · to .read as follqws. ·-

1704 .5.1' 1--704.6.1 Structural obseniati6ns.for s_eismic resistance. Structurar _ 
observations shall -be provided for those -structures assigned to Seismic Design 
Category D, E or F, wh~re on~ · qr_ more qfthe follo~ing _ conditions , exist: 

1. The structure is-Glassified as: Risk Category II_ I or IV_- in accordance vvith Table 
1604.5. . . _/ 

2. The height of the structure is greater than 75 feet (22860 m'm) above the 
base: · · - · · · · 

3. The structure is assigned to -Seismic Design Category E, . is -dassified a~ Risk 
Category I or II in accordance with Table 1604.5, ~nd is greater than t¥10 ·stories 

_ one stories_ abo\~ grade plane a lateral design is required for the structure or . 
- · portion thereof. · · · · 

. . 

Exception: One-story wood framed Group·R.:.3 and GroupU Oc~upancies lessthan 
2,000 square feet in area, provided-the adjacent grade hs· not steeper than 1 unit vertical 
in 1 0 units horizontal ( 1 Oo/o sloped), assigned to Seismic Design · Category D. 

· 4.: Whef! so designated by·the .registered design professionai responsible fo·r th-e 
structural design~ __ ·_ -_ 

. -

5. When such observation is specifically required by the building official. 

-14.04.150.- Section 1705.3 o.f the~ 2016- Edition oft~e California ,Building-C~de js - -
amended to read as follows. 

t705.3 Concrete Construcuo-n. · Tne ·special jnspections_ and verificatior1s for .. ·concrete _ 
. construction shan ·be·as required by this se·ction and Table 1705.3. -~ . - -

Exc~ptions:-- Special _in.spection shall no( be-re.quired .for: 

·16 
0000142278C031 



1. Isolated spread concrete footings of buildings three stories or .less.above grade 
plane that are fully supported on earth or rock, where the structural qesign ·ofth~.: _. 
footing is based· on a-specified compressive strength, fc, no greater 'than 2,500 
pounds per square inch (psi) (17.2 Mpa) regardless· of. the compressive _strength 
specified in the construction ·or used in the footing construction.· · · · · 

2. Continuous concrete footings supporting walls of buildings three stories _pr less in 
height that ·are fully supported on earth or rock where: _. · - · 

· 2.1. The -footings sup·port walls of light-frame construction;·· · .·. 

2.2. The footings are designed in accordance with Table 1805.4.2; or 
- .. 

2.3. The structural design of the footing is based on a specified compressive . 
strength, fc, no greater than 2,500 pounds per square inch (psi) (17.2 Mpa), 
regardless ·of tne c~rnpressiye str~ngth specifi~d inth~ construction d~cuments 

·or used in th~ footin'g con~tru.ction. · · ··· · · 
. . ·r-:., . 

' . . 

3. Nonstructural concrete slabs· supported directly otrthe ground; .including . ~~ . · 
' prestressed slabs on grade, where ·the 'effective prestress in ,the· concrete isles~:···: 
thai1150 psi (f.03 :Mpa). · · · · ·· · · · · · ·· · ·.. · · · · 

: . .. 

4. Concrete foundation walls constructed in accordance with Table 1807.1.6.2. 
. . 

5. Concrete patios, drivevlays and side'llalks, on grade. 
' : . . ~ 

14.04.155 Table-1705.-a of the 2013.- Edition of. the California Builqing Code is 
. : . - . . ' . . . ~ . . . . . ' . 

amended to read as follo\\'-8. 

+ABLE1705.3 - ... ..,. 
· · REQUIRED VER,FICATION ,A,ND INSPECTION OF CONCRETE CONSTRUCTION 

. I .. ~ 

\ 1ERIFICATION AND .. 
INSPECTION 

REFERENCE · . . t8G 
CONTINUOUS ' PERIODIC STP.,NDARb~ ; REFERENCE 

3. Inspection of anchors 
cast in concrete 'Nhere 

allovlable loads· hav~, been . 
increased or '•¥here 

strength design is used. 
·.·' .. 

. 4. Inspection of anchors 
; post installed in hardened 

qoncrete members&.-

0000142278C031 . 
f7 

X 

X 

ACI 318: D.9.2, . 
8.1 _.3, 21.1.8 

ACI 318: 3.8.6, 
8.1.3, 21.1.8 

1908.5, 
1909.1 . 

1909.1 



· a~.Ael:lesive ·aAcheFS 
installed in horizontally or · , . 

' "ACI318: 
. · up>,·~ardly inclined ' X .. -

0.9.2.4 
erientatierts to resist 

sustainee tension leaes . 
... 

-- · - · --

e. Mecl:laRical ancl:leFS 
ane ael:lesive ancROFS net X ~A,CI 318: 0.9.2 --

; 

eefinee iR 4.a. 

·. . . . -

e. Specific requitements fer special· inspe-ction sl:lalf be in9lueee· in tl:le research report · 
fer the anchor issuee by an approvee source in accordance 'Nith ACI .355.2, 0.9~2 in 
ACI 318 or ether qualification preceeures. VVI:lere specific requirements are net · 

. previeee, ;special inspection requirements sl:lall. ee specified ey the: re.gistered design 

. professional ane sl:lall ee approved ey tl:le euileing official prier to the cenim~nce'ment of 
tl:le 'NOrk. . . . . . 

(.P.ortions of table hot shov1i1 remain unchanged.) . . 

14.04.160- Exception 3·otSection 1705~111705.12 ofthe20-1-32016 Edition of the 
California Building Code is ·amended to read a~ follows·. · · 

1705.11 Special inspections fer seismic rosistaRce. Special inspections itemizee in · 
Sections 1705:11.1.through 1705.11.8, unless exempted eytl:le exceptions of 

·Section 1704.2, are requiree fer the follo'NiAg: 

1. The seismic force resisting systems in structures assignee to Seism.ic Design . 
Category C, D, E or F·in accordance \IIIith Sections _1705.11~1. tl:lro!Jgh 1705.11.3, as. 
appli'cable. · 

2. o·esignatee seismic systems in structures assignee to Seismic Design Category 
C, 0, E or F in accordance \Vith Section 1705.11.4. · · 

3 .• ~rchitectural, mechanical ane. electrical components in accoreance 'Nith .Sections 
1705.11.5 ane 1705.11.6. 

. ' 

4. Sterag~ racks in structures assigned to S~ismic Design Category D,: E or F i·n . 
accorEJance 'Nith Section 1705.11·.7. 

5. Seismic isolation· systems in accordance 'llith Section 1705.-11.8. 

18 
Od00142278C031 



) ' 

Exception: Special inspections itemized in Sections 1705.11.1 through 170.5.11.8 
are n·ot required for structures designed and constructed in accordance 'llith one of 
the follov..'ing: 

1. The structure consists of light frame construction; the design spectral response 
acceleration at short periods, Sos, as determined in Section 1613.3.4, does not 
exceed 0.5; and the building height of the structure does not exceed 35 feet (1 0 668 

_mm}. . - -

2. The seismic force resisting sys~em of the structure consists of reinforced · 
· masonry or reinforced concrete; the design spectral response acceleration- at short . 
periods, SGS, as determined in Section 1613.3.4, does not exceed 0.5; and the 
·building height of the structure does not exceed 25. feet-(7620· mm). 

3. The structure is. a detaqhed one or tv10 family dv,relling riot _exceeding t\vo stories 
above .grade plane is not assigned to Seismic Design Category D, E or F and does _ 
not have .any of the follo~ving horizontal or vertical irregularities in accordance 'Nith 
Section 12.3 of ASCE 7: · · · 

3.1 Torsional or extreme torsion~! irregularity. 

3.2 Nonparallel systems irregularity. 

3.3 Stiffness ·soft story or stiffness extreme .soft story irregularity. 
. ' 

·. 3.4 ' Discontinuity..i'n lateral strength 'Neak story irregularity. 

1705.12 Special inspecti-ons for seismic resi-stance. Spe.cial inspections .fc:»r 
seismic resistance shall be required as specified in Sections 1705.12.1 through 
1705.12.9, un~ess exem.pted by. the exceptions of Section 1704~2. 

Exception: The special inspections specified in Sections 1705.12.1 through 
1705.12.9 are not required for structures designed and ·constructed' in accordance 
with one of the following: ·: 

1. The structure consists of light-frame construction; the design spectral 
response acceleration at short periods; Sos; ·as determined in Section 1613.3.4, 
~oes -not exceed 0.5; and the ·building height of the structure does not exceed 
35 feet (1 0 668 ·mml 

2~ The seismic force-resisting system of the structure consists of reinforced 
masonry or reinforced concrete; the design spectral response acceleration at 
short periods, Sos. as determined in Section 1613.3.4, does not exceed 0.5;" 
and the building height of the structure does not exceed 25 feet (7620 mm) 

/ 
3. The structure is a detached one- o·r two-family dwelling not exceeding two 

· stories above grade plane .• is not assigned to Seismic Design Category D. E or 

19 
· 0000 142278C031 



F and does not have any ·of the following horizontal or vertical irregularities in 
·accordance with Section 12.3 of ASCE 7: 

3.1 Torsional or extreme torsional irregularity. -
-3.2 ·_Nonparallel systems irregularity. _ 
-3.3 -. Stiffness-soft story or stiffness.:.extreme soft story irregularity. 

· 3.4 · Discontinuity in lateral strength-weak story irregularity. 

14.04_.165- Section 1807.1.4 of tne 004-3 2016Edition ofthe California Building Code is 
anierided, to read as follows . 

. _. \-

1807.1.4 Permanent wood foundation systems. Permanent wood foundation . systems
shall be de~igned and installed in accordance with AF~PA PWF. Lumber and plywood 
shall be treated in accordance Wi~h AWPA-U1 (Commodity Specification A,- Use . 
·category 48-and Sectidri 5.2)-a-nd shall be identified in accordance with ·section 
2303;1.8~1 ~Permanent wood foundation system-s shalf not be used for structures 
assigned to-Seismic Design Category D~ E or F. .. · - · 

14.04.1 ?O - Section 1_ 807.1.6 of the 004-3 201-s Edition of the California Bu-ilding Code is 
- amended to read as follows. 

1807.1.6 Prescriptive .desi_gn of concrete and masonry foundation wa_lls._ Concrete and 
-masonry foundation walls that are laterally supported at the top and bottom shall be -
permitted to be designed and co-nstructed in accordance with this ·section. Prescriptive 
design 9f foundation walls shall not be used for structures assigned to S~is~ic Design 
Category D, E or·F. · _ _ - · · \ · 

14.04.1-75 - Section 1809.3 of the 004-3 2016 Edition of..the California Building Code is 
amended to read as follows. 

1.8Q9.3 Stepped footings. The top surface of footings _shall be level. The bottom surface 
of f6otii1g-s shall be permitted to have a slope not exceeding" one unit vert_ical in 10-units 
horizontal (tO-percent slope). Footings shall be stepped where· it -is necessary to change 
the elevation of the top surface of the- footing -or where the surface of the gro"und slopes 
morethan.orie unit vertical -ii-I 10-units horizqntal (10-percent slop~). 

· - -

For structures assigned-to Seismic besign Categbry D, E or F, .the stepping --requirement
shall also apply to the-top _surface of grade beams supporting walls. Footings shall be 
reinforced with four No. 4 rebar. Two bars shall be place at the top and- bottom of the 
footing.s -as shown in Figure 1809.3~ 

- ' -

20 
0000142278C031 



/ 

~ --·--·------------·-·--

> • ~ ; I ' • ..1 

{_ . 

I . ·· ,· • ' ' .STEPJ'EDFOVt\'DATIQNS : . . ' . : . . 

'----~--,--.'----............. '--.....:.------.........;._ __ ... __.-~ :. j~~~~!.~~!'~~;:__:·~ ·. ___ :;":.": :···'- <·-;· _·:·' .. !' _· :· .· : . . .·,, 

14~04.180 ~ Section.1.809.7 and Table 1_809.7 _ofthe ~ 2016 E~:t~tion-ofthe Ca.liforni~ 
Building Code are amended to read as follows·.· . 

1809.7 Prescriptive foo~ings for light-:-frame construction. Where a &·pecifi~ d~sign is not 
p"rovided, concrete or masoriry-unit footings supporting walls Q( light-frame-construction 
shall be permitted to be designed in accordance ,with Table f809.7. Pres-criptive footings 
in Table 1809.7 s.hall .not exceed. o.n~ . s~()ry above grade plane f9r stru.ctures a~signed to 

. Seismic Qesign Category ·o, E or F .. , ' . . . ·. . . . . . . '· . . . . . . 
• • i ·: .. ·,'f • • : • I 

• - · 1 ' 't ·~ ;. : I - ' • ' I ' ' ' • 

TAB~E 1~09 .. 7 ., ... , . . . .. . . . , ... · . 
PRESCRIPTIVE FOOTINGS SUPPORTING WALLS ·.· .. . · 
OF LIGHT -FRAME. CONSTRUCTION~· b, c, d,·e· . . . . .. 

o ' • • I ,, .'.' 

.. ' 

- i ~ - ; . 

. . . . . .. . . . ·---.W.IDTH OF ·· 
NUMBER-q,:: ·:F_ LOO __ R_-s ··suPPORTED ·. -~ 

B'(TffE FOOTINGt 

1 

2 

. 3 " 
r· . 'f, 

' ' ' . ' 

. ··· . :FOOTING 
(inches) 

12 

"15 , .. 

_.;;_: ' 

18 

For Sl: 1 inch = 25.4 min, 1 foot= 304.8 mm 

21 
0000142278C031 t 

' ! . ; ' 

. __ , .. _ 

THiCKNESS OF :· . 
. ' -~ . 

FOOTING (inches) 

6 

6 

· · s~t~ .· 

,"- .·-. 



a. Depth of footings shall be in accordance with Section 1809.4. 

b. The ground under the floor shall be permitted .to be excavated to the elevation of the 
top ·of the footing. · 

c. 'nterior stud bearing 'llalls shall be permitted to be supported by isolated footings. 
The footing 'Nidth and length shall be tlNice the vvidth sho,.vn in this table; and footings 
.shall be spaced not more than 6 feet on center. Not Adopted. . · 

d. See Section 1908 for additional requirements for concrete footings of structures· 
assigned to Seismic Design Category C, D, E or F. 

e. For thickn~ss of foundation walls, see Section ·1807 .1.6. 

f. Footings shall be permitted to support a roof addition to the stipulated number of · 
floors. Footings supporting roof only shall be as required for supporting one floor. 

g. Plain concrete· footings for Group R a· occupancies shall be permitted to be 6 inches 
tmGit . . 

. . 

14.04.185 ~Sectio-n 1809.12 of the ~' 2016 Edition. of the California Building Code is 
amended to read as foliows . .. . ' . . . . . . 

1809.12 Timber· footings. Timber footings shall be permitted for buildings of Type V . 
construction and as otherwise approved by the building officiaL Such footings shall .be 
.treated in accordance with AWPA U1 (Commodity Specification A, Use Category 48). 
·Treated timbers are not required where placed entirely below permanent water level, or · 
where used as capping for wood pi!es that project abhve the water level over 
submerged or marsh lands. The compressive stresses perpendicular to grain in 
untreated timber footing supported upon treated piles shall not exceed 70 percent of the 
allowable .stresses for the species and grade of timber as specified in the AF&PA NDS. 
·Timber footin·gs shall not be used in structures assigned ·to Se.ismic Design Category D, 
EprF. . . ... 

. -

14.04.190- Section 1810.3'.2:4 of the~ 2016 Edition of the California Building-Code 
is amended to read as follows. . 

·181 0.3.2.4 Timber. Timber deep foundation elements shall be designed as piles or 
poles in accordance with AF&PA ANSI/AWC NOS. Round timber elements shall 
conform to ·ASTM D 25. Sawn timber elements shall conform to DOC PS-20. ·Timber 
shall not be used in structures assigned to Seismic Design Category D, E or F. 

14.04.205 Section 1905.1.3 of the 2013 Edition of the California Building Code is 
amended to read as follovt's. 

22 ·.., 

0000142278C031 



1905.1.3 ACT-318,· Section 21 A.: Modify ACI318, Section·21.4;-by.rei1umbering s·ection-
21.4.3 to become 21.4 A and adding ne'~·' se·ctions 21.4.3, 21.4 .5; 21 A ~6 and ·21.4 .7 to 

. read as follo'.v.s:. · · 

21.4 .3 · Connections that are designed to yield shall be capable of maintaiofng 80 · 
percent of their design strength at the deformation induced by the desigri d_isplacement 
or shall use Type 2 mechanical splices~·· · · · 

·.- l ... 

. 21.4 .4 ~laments of the connection that are not designed to yield shall dev-elop at least 

~ · ·. 

· -··21.4.5 .'A'all piers in Seismic Design Category.:D, E or·F shall comply·'.''/ith Section 
· 1'905.1.4 of the lnternatioJlal Building Code. In structures as~igned to SeJsmic Design 
Category D, E or F, intermediate precast 'hall panels and v.r.SII piers shall be designed in 
accordance \\'ith Section 21.9 or 2·1.13. · · 

21.4 ~6 .VVall piers not designed ·as part of a moment frame.in buildings assigned to _ 
Seismic Design Category C_ shall have transverse reinforcement designed to resist the · 
shear forces determined- from 21.3..3.' Spacing of-transverse rei_nforcement shall not 

. exceed 8 inches (203 mm); Transverse reinforcement shall be extended beyond the 
pier clear height for at least 12 inches (305 mm). . . · 

' ) 

Exceptions: 

t~·VVall piers that satisfy 21.A3 .. , 

. '2.. 'JVall piers ~long. a ~Naif line V~'ithin a story '1/hero .other.shear_\\tan s~-gments 
. . : provide lateratsupport to 'the \\'all piers and such segments have a total 

. _ .. stiffnees~of at l~ast six times the sum of the stiffnesse~ of all the \~.tall piers. · 
.. .· ' . - ' ' .· . . . . ' - . . .. 

. . . . . \ ·.. .. -- . ,' . . . . . : ... 

21 A .7 '.0/all segments 'Nith a horizontal length to thickness ratio ·less than· 2.5 shall · 
be -d~signed as colum·n~. · -

14.04.21 o -- Section 1 Q-05.1.8 1905.1·. 7- of the~ 20_16 Edition of the ~c~lifo_rnia 
Building Code is amended to read as folloWs . 

. 1:905.1.-8 ACI 318, Section 2?.10. Delete AGI31.8,_Se_ction 22.10,a~d -repla_ce 'Nith 
the follo'Ning: · · .. · - · · · 

I . 

· _22.10 ·Plain concrete in structures assigned to··seisniic Design ·categ·ol)' C, D, E. or 
--~ . ,, . '_.· 

. 22.10.1·. Structures': assigned to Seismic Design Category G, D, E or F shall. not 
have elements of structural plain concrete, except as follo'Ns: 

· (a) Structural_ plain co.ricrete :ba~ement;·_foun9ation .or.otherv.~lls belov'l the· 
base are permitted i~ dQtache~. OF:le aF}d ~~10. f~mily d\\tOIIing_s thre~ stories or 
less in height constructed v1ith stud bearing ·,11alls. In d'Nellings assigned to 
·seismic Design.Category D orE, the height of the 'Nan shall not exceed 8 feet 

23 
0000 142278C031 



(24a8 mm), the thickness shall not be less than.714 inches (1 90 .mm), and the· · 
'Nail shall retain no more than 4 feet (121 9 mm) of unbalanced fill. VValls shall . 
have reinforcement in accordance 'Nith 22.6.6.5. Concrete-used for fill 'Nith a .. 
minimum cement content of tv:o (2) sacks of Portland cement or cementious · 
material per cubic yafd. 

(b) Isolated footings. of plain concrete supporting pedestals or columns are _ 
permitted, provi_9ed the projection of the footing beyond the face of the 

· ~upperted· member .does· not exceed the footing thickness. 

Exception: In detached one and tv.fQ family d'Nellings three stories or less in 
height, the. projection of the -footing beyond the face of the supported member is · 
permitted to exceed the footing thickness. 

. - . . 

(c) Plain concrete footings supporting 'Nalls are permitted provided the fo()tings 
have at least tv.fQ continuous longitudinal reinforcing bars. Bars shall not be 

· smaller-than No. 4 and shall have a total area of not less than 0.002 times the· 
gross cross sectional area of the footing~· For footings that exceed 8 inche·s (203 
mm) in. thickness, a minimum of one bar shall be provided at the top and bottom 
of the footing. Continuity of reinforcement shall be provided .at corners and 
intersections. · · 

Exceptions: 

1. In Seismic Design Categories/\, 8 and c; detached one and tv.fQ family 
dwellings three stories or less in height and constructed ¥lith stud bearing vtalls, 
are permitted to have plain concrete footings 'Nithout longitudinal reinforcement 
'itith at least tv.fQ continuous longitudinal _reinforcing bars· not smaller t~an No. 4 
'are permitted to have a'' total area of less than 0~002 times the gross cross 
sectional area of the footing. · 

2. For foundation systems consisting of a plain concrete footing and a plain 
concrete stem\\r.all, . a .minimum of one bar shall be provided at the top of the 
stem'Nall and at the bottom of the are .footing. · 

a. '!'/here a slab on ground is cast monolithically 'Nith the fo.oting, one No. 5 bar 
· is permitted to be located at either the top of ttie slab or bottom of the footing. 

1905.~.7 ACI318, Section 14.1.4. Delete ACI318, Section 14.1.4, and replace with 
·the following: · 

14.1.4-: Plain concret~ in structures assigned to Seismic Design Category C. 
D. E or F. 

14.1.4.1 -Structures assigned to Seismic De.sign Category C. D. E or F shall 
not have elements of structural plain concrete. except as follows: 

0000 142278C031 

.....__ 



. ·,··Concrete used·for.fill with ·a minimum ·cement content of tWo (2) ·sacks of· 
Portland: ceme'nt or cementious. material per cubic yard. ·: .. · · 

U)l ·Isolated .footings of plain concre.te. supporti~g pedestals or colum-ns are 
permitted, provided the projection of the footing beyond the_ ~ace of the·· 

.· · supported memb:er does: not exceed-the footing thickness. -·· . 

. (c) Plain concrete footings~supporting walls are permitted provided the . 
. _;footings have at least two continuous longitudinal reinforcing bars.~-~ 

. ,. . Bars shall not' be s·maller than No. 4 and shall hav~ a total area of not' 
less than.0.002 times the gross cross-sectional-area of the footing. ·A 

-... . . I 

minimum of-one.bar shall'be provided at the. top and bottom of the· . .-
footir1gi-Continuity o'f reinforcement ·shall be· -provided· at corners and·-. 
intersections.· ' :.-: · .. ;·- · · .,. 

., ",' 
- • • i' '_: ~ '. 

. ::' 

Detached one- and two-familv dWellings .three stories or less in height' and · 
constructed with stud-bearing 'walls, are .permitted to· have plain concrete . . 
footings with at l·east two continuous lonclitudinal reinforcing bars not smaller . 

· t.han No. 4 are permitted to have a total area of less th~n 0.002 tim~s- t~e gros~ 
· cross-sectional area of the footing~ . . - · . · ./. . · 

. .1 • ••• = •••.. : ., •.. _ • 

. . - . 
. . . . . 

14~04.215- Sectiori 1905·.1-:i~iam·ended··and Sections·.1'905~1.t0 1905."1.9 thru 
1905.t.121905.1'.1fare added-to Chapter·1-9:ofthe-~2016 Edition of the c·alifornia 

. . .. . • ./ . 

Building Codeto read.asfollows~·.: · · · .. :.: ·. ·· . ·. ,.. . . 
·, '. . ::·· ·.· " •" \ .. ,, .. · ' ·. . ..... 

1905.1.Generttl. The textoti\CI 3ta:sha.llbe ~edified as:i·ndicated in Se.ction~-1.905.1.1 
through 1908~1 :1.0·, .190GA A2 .. -~ · · · · .. · 

~- :0:,;; '._ " 

19.05. t .1 0 ACI 318, ·Section 21 ~.6.4'. Modify Acr:a18~· ::s·octlon·-_21.6.4, by adding _Section· 
21.6.4 .8 and 12.6 .. 4.9 as follov.<s_:· . · _ . · ·.· = · .. · · · · 

21.6.4 .8 VVhere the calculated point of contraflexure is not 'Nithin the middle half of the 
member clear ~eight, provid_e transverse reiF1forcement a~ specified in ACI ~1.8 Sections 

. 21.6.4 .1; Items (a) through (c), over. the fUll height of the·rne~per~: · · 
. ) . . · .. ,' ·-· .. ; ...... . . - . 

21 .. 6.4 .9 At any section 'Nhere the design _strength, e:pPn, of the column is less than the. 
sum of the shears 'J~ cd'mputed ·in accordance \vitn ACI at a Sections 21 :5.4 .1 and 
21.6.5.1 for·an .the beams framing' into' the column abo.veJheJevel·under consideration,: 

· transverse_reinforcement a~.speclfiQd jn}\CI_3~~ ·section_~.21.6.4_.1.thro~gh 2~.~6.4.3 · 
shall be provided. For beams framing into opposite siqes of the column, the moment· ·.;· · . 
components are permitted to be assumed to be of opposite sign. For the determination· 

0000 142278C031 



of the design strength, {fPR, of the column, these moments are permitted to be assumed . 
to result from the deformation of the frame in ,any one prinCipal axis.' 

' ' 

1905.1.11 ACI 318, Section 21.9.4. Modify ACI 318,-.Section 21.9.4, by addiog Section 
21.9.4 .6 as foiiO'NS: . , 

21.9.4.6 VValls and portions of'Nalls 'Nith.Pu > 0.35Pe shall not be considered to 
contribute to the calculated .shear strength of the structure for resisting earthquake 
induced forces. Such 'Nalls shall conform to the requirements of P,CI 318 Section 21.1 a. 

1905.1.12 ACI 318, Section. 21.11.6. Modify i\CI 318~. by adding Sectio~ .21.11.6.1 as 
foiiO'IJS: . . . . 

21.11.6.1 Collector and boundary elements in topping slabs placed ove·r precast floor 
and roof elements shall not be less than 3 inches (76 mm) or 6 dg in thickne~s, v:here d9 

is .the diameter of the largest reinforc-ement in the topping slab. 

1905.1 General. The text of ACI 318 shall be modified as indicated in Sections 
1905.1.1 through 1905.1.11. 

1905~1.9 ACI318, s·ection 18~7.5. Modify ACI31S, Section 18.7.5, by adding 
Section 18.7.5.7 and 18.7.5~8 as follows: .. 

18.7 .5. 7 Where the calculated point of contraflexure is not within the middle half 
of the member clear height, provide transverse reinforcement as specified in ACI 
318 Sections 18.7.5.1, Items (a) through (c), over the full height of the member. 

18.7.5.8- At any section where the design strength, cpPn, of the column is less 
than the·sum of the shears Ve computed in accordance with ACI318. Sections · 
18.7.6.1 and 18.6.5.1' for all the beams framing into the column above:the level 
under consideration, transverse reinforcement as specified in ACI-318 Sections 
18.7.5.1 through 18.7.5.3 shall be provided. For beams framing ·into opposite · 
sides of the column, the moment components are permitted to be assumed to be 
of opposite sign. For the determination of the design strength, cpPn, of the column, 
these moments are permitted to be assumed to result from the deformation ·Of the 
frame in any one-principal axis . 

. 1905.1-~10 ACI318, Section 18.10.4. Modify ACI31.8, ·section 18.10.~; by adding 
Section 18.10.4.6 as follows: 

18.10.4~6.:. Walls and portions ·of walls with •'pu >.0.35Po shall not be considered to 
contribute to the calculated shear strength of the structure for resisting-_ . · 
earthquake-induced forces. Such walls shall· conform to the requirements of ACI 
318-Section 18.14. 

.26 
0000142278C031 



1905~1..11·ACI~·318~·Section 18.12~6.· Modifv_·ACI-318, by adding Section·tS.·t2~6~2 as 
· follows: ·. ~· ·· · ··· · ··· _, · ; ·' · · · 

.-- ,q' ~ :' '· .. < ' -~ ' 

. . ~- . . 

18.12.6.2 Collector and· boundary el-ements in topping slabs placed· over .precast-
floor and roof elements-shall_. not be-less than 3. inches (7-6-mml .or .6 db ih__ . 
thickness, where: db is the. diameter ofthe largest reinforcement :in. the. topping_· . 

.. ' . . . . . . .. •' . .· .... ·.' - . · .... 

slab. . ·' ,>• . . -· ,. ·, ' . . . ·. 
. . . 

14.04:2-16 - Section .2304 .9.1 2304.10.1 of the-~- 2016. Edition of the .. California. 
Building C~de is amended to read as follo~s~.·- -.· . ---._. ..... -: .. - ,_ . 

. 2304.9.1- 2304.10~1 Fastene'i'" .. requirements. Connections forwoo_d members _shall be 
designed in accordance .with the-appropriate methodology- in Sectio_n 230(2; The · · ·· :· ·,·· 
number. and· size ·of fasteners. connecting wood ·members sh.all' not be ·less than that set 
forth in Table 2304.9.1. 2304.10.1· Staple .fasteners· in Tabl_e 2304.9.t---2304~1o·-~1. ·shall · -~ 
not be usedt() resist or.transfer.seismic.forces·-in structures assigned·-to·S~ismic Design 
CatE3gory. D,. E :or F.~ . - . . - . -. : ~ ,.: -, ·:.-. · .: ·· · . . . . 

Exception: ·S~·aple.s_ may be· usedt~-·:r~s_i~t ~r tr~nsfe·r -s~-is.mf~- for~~s \Nh~~ th~- ~'ilo.wable·-: 
shear vaiUE3~ are S~Qstanti~te,~ :by cyclic te~ting ::~nd: ~ppr9ve·q by_.th~ .b~ilding _pffici_~f· .. _ >. 

14.04.217. -· Se.ctloh -230{.-11 ·~t 2304.12~5 of th~:~.201.6 Edition ofthe. California · :. < 
Building Code. _is ame~ded to r~ad as fbllq\.vs. . .. . . ·.. . .. · .. , _ .. 'c :-

. . ' . . ~ 

2304~1-1.'7 2304.12.5-Wood u~~d. in ret_ai~ing J/aUs and cril:>S.~···wood in~talled kl.retalning 
or crib wafls ··shall be preservative treated· in aeco'rd~u1ce 'with .AWPA U1 (Commodity .. 
Specifications ,A, or F) for sqii arid. fresh "water use. Wood shall n'ot ,be used in retaining . ~ 
o(cribwaJis·for structu-res assignedtcfSeismic Design Cate·gory D, E br·F~-- · 

14.04.22() -~- S~ction 23b5;~4J$-·a,dded to Ctlapf_er 23 of the:~ 2o16·_:.Edltion of the. · .. 
California- B~ildi11g· .c69_e to read _as .follows. · · ___ . , , .. ·, · · ·. · ·_ . _ · · · 
. . . 

2305.4- Qu~lify_ of Na-ils. In se·j:smic· [)e~ign Catego~ o·:. E'nr F' mechanically driven nails 
used in wood strllcturc:11 panel shear wc:IIIs .shali meet the same dimensions as that . ·. 
required for ·hand-driven nails, :includin·g diameter, minimum lengtn and minimum head . 
diameter. No C~ipped head or box nails are Ret permitted in new construction~ The · · · · ,, . . . 
allowable design value for clipped-head nails ·in.existing.con.struction may be taken_ at no 
more than the nail~head-area ratio o(that of the same ·size. hand~driven nails.. · · 

. 14. 0~ :225 c ~ection 2305.5 is add~d to Chapter 23 ()f ihe ~ ;0 16 EditiOn of the 
California 'Building Code to read as fo-llows.' . . . . . . 

2305.5. Hold~d0\1\fD contie.ctors. I nSeis.mic Qe-sign Category D,. E. or F,. hold7down 
connectors shall be. design~d to ,res.i~t she~r V\{all:_q~e~qrning' ~onients using approve~. 
cyclic load values or 75 .percent of the allowable seismic earthquake load values that - · 
do not ~onsider cyclic loading of the product. Connector bolts into wood framing shall · 
require steel plate washers on the post on the opposite side of the anchorage device . . 

'27 
0000142278C031 



Plate·size shall be a minimum.of0.2~9 inch by 3 inches by 3 inches (5.82 mm by 76 
mm by 76 mni) in size. Hold dO'Nn connectors shall-be tightened to finger tight plus one· 

. ha.lf (1/2) 'llrench turn just prior to covering the 'Nail framing. Hold-downs shall be re-

. tightened just __ prior to covering the wall. framing.: -
' . . . - . 

14.04.235 ·-Section 230~.9.3.1, Section 2308.9.3.2 ·2308.6.5; Figure 2308~6.5.1- and 
FigurEf23~8.9 .. 3.2 2308.6.5.2 of ·the ~-2016-li:ditio~ of the California· Building Code · 
are amended to read as follows. 

2308.9.3.1 'Alternative bracing:'l\ny bracing required by Section 2308.Q.3 ·is" permitted·to 
be replaced by the· follov:ing: 

1. In one .stol),· buildings, each panel·shall have a length of not less th:an 2 feet 8 inches 
(813 mm) ano a height of not more than·1o feet (3048 mm). Each panel shall be 
sheathed ·on one face·vlith 3/8 inch minimum thickness (9.5 mm) 'wtvood structural' panel 
sheathing nailed· vvith 8d common or galvanized box-nails. in ·accordance li/ith Table 
2304 ;9.1" and blocked at 'NOod structural panel edges. For structures assigned to 
Seismic Design Categol){ D or E, each panel shall be sheathed_ on one ·face \Vith 15/32 

. inch minimun1 thickness (11.9 mm) 'llood structu.ral panel sheathing nailed 'Nith 8d · __ _ 
somnion nails spaced 3 iriches or{pa"nef edges, 3 inches at intennedlate supports. ·1\vo 

: anchor' bolts installed in accordance Vt'ith. Section 2308.6_shall be provided in each 
panel.l\n9hor t?olts shall be placed at _each panel out~ide _quarter points. Each panel . 
end stud shall ha\le a tie dO'Nn device fasten-ed t() the· foundation,· capable Of p'roviding 
an approved uplift capacity of not less than' 1 ,890 pounds (8006, N). The tie do'..vn' device · 
s.hall be· installed in accordance .'.ltw'ith the manufacturer's recommendations .. The panels 
shall be supported directly_ on a foundation or on floor framing supported directly on a 
foundation thatjs :continuous across the entire length of the braced \\'alii hie. This _ 
foundation shalrb~ reinforcE?d 'Nith not less than one_ No·. 4 ba~ top and bottom'.·, . 

V'/here the continuous foundation is required. ~o have a depth greater than 12 inche.s · 
(305 mm), ·a minimum 12 inch by 12 inch (305 mm by 305 mm) continuous footing or 
turned do\4w'n slab edge is permitted at door openings in the braced \Vall line. This 
continut;>us footing .or turned do)Nn slab edge shall be reinforced 'Nith not Jess than one 
No·. 4 .bar-top ~nd bottom. This·reinf()i=ceni'ent shall be lapped ·15 inches (381 min) v..'ith 
the reinforce_ment required in the contin'-!fous foundation located directly under the _ - · 
braced \vall line. · 

. . . 

2.- ·1n the fir=St stOry ot' w.!Q story -buildings, each 'Nail panel shall be· braced in accordance 
· ;Nith Section 2308.9.3.1, Item t ,- e:xcept that the 'NOod· structural panel sheathing shall be 
provided on both face~, three anchor bolts shall be placed at one quarter points, ·and · 
.tie dov;n device uplift capacity shall not be less than 3:,00Q pounds (13 3-44 N).· 

230.8.9.3.2 Alternate bracing 'Nail panel adjacent to a door OF.'Nindo'N opening. Any 
bracing· requi.red by Section 2308.9;3 is permitted-to be· replaced by the follo'.Aling 'Nhen' · 
used ad;jacen·t to? door or v;iridoviw' opening vvith a full length header: · · · 

28 
0000142278C031 



In one stoA' e ·19· 1 ~Hngs, each panel shall.h " . 
mm) anda_helght of not more than 10 fe~·;~41ength of notless than 16 incheS (406 
one ~ce \\qth. a single layer of 3/8 inch (9 r} .. : ~"!). Each panel shall be sheathed 
pane sheathing nailed with 8d com 0 mm mlmmum thickness wood stF ~ I on 
Figur 230

8 
· .. " mon or galvani d b . . " uc ura . . ~~ .9.3.2. For structures aSsiQnOd; S -~ ox _nalls In accordance with . 

pane shall be sheathed on one face.... ~ ~ISmlc Design Categorv i:> orE . 
::od str~ctural Panel sheathing ·nailed~~~it15:2 Inch minirll_um thiGkn;~s (11.9·~~)h . 

ges, 3 Inches at intermediate s " . common nmls spaced 3 irlches . 
The_ wood structural panel sheath~::::,~"! In ;ccordance 'liith Figure 2308 go; g~nel 
am mated head · · e en up o"er th r · · · · · er ane shall be nailed . : : ~.ve so ld sav:n or glued 

PQ~;cl (~: ;3stened.tothe·foundation wi~~~a~ \iPiitt~eann~ ~tuds shall also have a tie . 
. · . s ._ 0 NJ. .• . . .. . -·· - ·· . .. . · .•.. · . · ·• capaCity ~f ,notless than 1,000 

The tie dO'IIA de•lic9s ~han b . . , .... • .. _·.· . . . . . .• . .. .· _·. . .· " _· . ··.·_._ . 
manu~ t · • . e an embedded strap t. · · . · ·· .· . · ; ;3~urer s recommendations The . . . i ~-~ype, Installed IR accordance i•'ith th . oundat~on that is continuous acro.sS th pan~ s shall be supporteddirectly on a ,. . ... e. 
foundation shall be reinforGed\\•ith nOt ?e::~: length of the bri3ced wall line. This .· ..• 
\At • . . . .. . . . . . .· . an one No. 4 bar top and b tt . . . .· 
.. hero tho continuous foundation . . . . . . . . .. o om . . · . . 
(305 mR'i) · ·· · · !S FO!JUired to ha"e a d th · · · ·. · · t i ·, a miRimum 12 inch by 12 in~h (305~ rbep•greater than 12 inches . . 
urne down slab edge is . · mm Y 305 mm) continu ~ . · 

continuous ~ f . ~ . . permitted at door openings in th b . . . ~us ~otmg or _ oo IRQ or turned down slab d . . . . . e . raced wall hnO. This .. 
No. 4 bar top and .bottom. This i'Oi ~ . ~ e~ge shall be FOinferoed with not less th 
(381 mm) with th0minfo£Goment ~~"?em~mtshall b? lapped not less than 15 inan one 
under the braced wall line. . !JUired In tho contlnuous.foundation located lh'*;l. . . ·. · . . · _lreG y · 

*Note: For figure 2308 9 3 . . . . . . . .. . . . . : . . . . . 
on ono fa ,., , ·~· ·2• structures ass1gned tO Soi · •· · · · · .. · · 
with 8d C:!~lth15:~ lOCh minimum thicknoss wood s:r~= C~tegory D or E, sheathed 
supports on nal s spaced 6 inches on panel edges 12 . u~ pane_l sheathing nailed / . . ' Inc es at Intermediate .. 

29 
0000 142278C031 



2308.6.5 Alternative bracing. An alternate braced wall CABW) or a portal .frame 
. with hold-downs CPFHl described in this section is permitted to substitute for a 
~8-inch (1219 mm) braced wall panel of Method DWB, WSP, SFB, .PBS, PCP or 
HPS. For Method GB. ·each 96-inch (2438 mml section (applied to one face) or 48-
inch (1219 mml section (applied to both faces) or portion thereof required by 
Table 2308.6.1 is permitted to be replaced by one panel constructed in 
accordance with Method ABW·or PFH. · 

2308.6.5.1 Alternate braced wall (ABW). An ABW shall be constructed in 
accordance with this section and Figure 2308.6.5.1. In one-story buildings, each 
panel shall have a length of not less than 2 feet 8 inches (813 mm) and a height of 
not more than 1 0 feet (3048 mm). Each panel. shall be sheathed on one face with 
3/8-inch (3.2 mml minimum-thickness wood structural panel sheathing nailed with 
Bd common· or galvanized box nails ·in accordance with Table 2304.10.1 and 
blocked at wood structural panel .edges. For structures assigned to Seismic 
Design Category D or E •. each panel shall be. sheathed ori one face with 15!32~ 
inch-minimum-thickness (11.9 mm) wood structural panel sheathing nailed with 
8d common nails spaced 3 inches on panel edges, 3 inches at intermediate 
supports~ Two anchor bolts installed in accordance with Se.ction 2308.3.1 shall be 
provided in each panel. Anchor bolts shall be placed at each panel outside 
quarter points. Each panel end stud shall have a hold-down device fastened to 
the foundation, capable of providing an approved uplift capacity of. not less than . 
1,800 pounds (8006 N). The hold-down device shall be installed in accordance 
with the manufacturer's recommendations. The ABW shall be· supported directly 
on a foundation or on floor framing supported directly on a foundation that is 
continuous · across the entire length of th.e braced wall lirie. This foundation shall 
be reinforced with not less than one No. 4 bar top and bottom. Where the 
continuous foundation is required to have .a depth greater than 12 inches (305 
mm), a mininium 12-inch ·by 12-inch (305 mm by 305 mm) continuous footing is 
permitted at door openings in the braced wall line. This continuous footing shall 
be reinforced with not less than one No. 4 bar top and bottom. This reinforcement 
shall be lapped 24 inches (~1 0 mm) with the reinforcement required in the 
continuous foundation located directly under the braced wall line. 

Where the ABW is installed at the first story of two-story buildings, the wood 
structural panel sheathing shall be provided on both faces, three anchor· bolts 
shall be placed at one-quarter points and .tie-down device uplift capacity shall be 
not less than 3,000 pounds {13 344 N). 

30 
0000142278C031 



2308.6.5.2 Portal frame with hold-downs (PFH). A PFH shall be constructed in 
accordance with this section and Figure 2308.6.5.2. The adjacent door or window 
opening shall have a full-length header. 

In one-story buildings, each panel shall have a length of not less than 16 inches 
(406 mm) and a height of not more than 10 feet (3048 mm). Each panel shall be 
sheathed on one face with a single layer of 3/8-inch (9.5 mm) minimum-thickness 
wood structural panel sheathing nai_led w.ith 8d common or galvanized box nails 
in accordance with Figure 2308.6.5.2. For structures assigned to Seismic Design 
Category D ·or E. each panel shall be sheathed on one face with 15/32-inch
minimum-thickness.(11.9 mm) wood structural panel sheathing nailed with 8d 
common nails spaced 3 inches on panel edges, 3 inches at intermediate· supports 
and in accordance with Figure 2308.6.5.2. The wood structural panel sheathing 
shall extend up over the solid sawn or glued-laminated header and shall be nailed 
in accordance with Figure 2308.6.5.2. A built-up header consisting of at least two 
2-inch by 12-inch-_ (51 mm by ·305 mm) boards, fastened in accordance with· Item 
24 of Table 2304.10.1 shall be permitted to be· used. A spacer, if used, shall be 
placed on the side ofthe built-up beam opposite the wood structural pa~el 
sheathing:'The header shall extend between the ins.ide faces of the first full
length outer studs of each panel. The clear span of the header between the inner 
studs of 'each panel shall be not less than 6 feet (1829 mm) and not more tha'n 18 
feet (5486 mm) in length.' A strap with an uplift capacity' of not less than 1',000 
pounds (4,400 N) shall fasten the header .to the inner studs opposite the . 
sheathing. One anchor bolt not less than 5/8· inch (15.9 mm) diameter and 
installed in accordance with Section 2308.3.1 shall be provided iri the center of 
each sill plate. The studs at each end of the panel shall have a hold-down device 
fastened to the foundation with an uplift capacity of not less than 3,500 pounds . 
(15 570 N). 

Wh~re a ·panel is located on one s_ide of the. opening, the header shall extend 
between the inside face of the first full-length stud of the panel and the bearing · 
studs at the other end of the opening. A strap with an uplift capacity of not less 
than 1,000 ·pounds (4400 Nl shall fasten the header to the bearing studs.· The 
bearing studs shan also have ··a· hold-down device fastened to the foundation with 
an uplift capacity of not less than 1,000 pounds (4400 N). The hold-down devices 
shall be an embedded strap type, installed in accordance with the manufacturer's 
recommendations. The PFH ·panels shall .be supported directly on a foundation 
that is continuous across the entire .. length of the braced wall line. This foundation 
shall be reinforced with not less than one No. 4 bar top and bottom. Where the 
continuous foundation is required to have a depth greater than 12 inches (305 
mm), a minimum 12-inch by 12-inch (305 mm by 305 mm) continuous footing is 

31 
0000 142278C031 



_\ 

permitted at door openings in the braced wall line~ This continuous footing shall 
be reinforced with not less .than one No. 4 ·bar top and bottom .. This reinforcement 
shall be lapped not less than 24 inches (61 0 mm) with the reinforcement required 

· in the continuous foundation located directly under the braced wall line. 

Where a PFH is installed at the first story of two-story buildings~ each. panel ~hall 
have a length--of not less than 24 inches (610 mm). . 

·*Note.: For figure 2.308.6.5.1 and 2308.6.5.2, structures assigned to Seismic _. 
Category D or E, sheathed on one fa·ce· with 15/32 inch-minimum thickness wood 
structural panel sheathing nailed with 8d common nails spaced 6 inches on. panel 
edges, 12 inches at intermediate supports. 

· 14.04.250 ~·section 2308.12.5 2308.6.9 of the~ 2016 Editio~ of the California· . 

Building Code is amended to read as follows. 

230tl12~5: 2309.6.9 Attachment of shea.thing. Fastening of brac~d wall panel sheathing 
shall ho~ be les~ than ·that p~escribed _in Table 2308.12.4 or 2304.9.1. 2308.6.1 or · 
2304.10.1, Wall sheat~ing shall not be attached to framing members: by adhesives. 
Staple fasteners ·in Table 2304.9.1 shall no't be used to resist or transfer .seismic forces .. 
in structures assigned to' Seismic Design. Category. D, E or F. . . . 

. . '' . . 

.Exception·:··staples may be· -Used .to resist or transfer seismic forces when the ailowable 
shear· v<;~lues. are_ substantiated ·by. cyclic testing and approved by. the buHding official. 

All braced ·w~ll panels shall extend to the roof sheathing.and shall' be attached -to 
parallel roof raft~rs or blocking above with framing clips ( 18 gauge minimum) spaced at 
maximum 24 inches (6096 mm) o.n center with four .Bd 'nails per leg (total eig~t 8d n~ils 
per.clip). Braced wall panels· shall be laterally braced. at each top corner and at . . 
maximum 24 inches (6096 mm) intervals along the top' plate ofdiscontinuous vertical . 
framing.· , -'- · · 

1~.04.257- Section 3109.4.4.2.1 is added to the 2016 California Building Cod~ to . 
read :as follows: . · -.. · 

Fences required:· In addition to the requirements in the California Building Code, 
a barrier in compliance with·section 31-09.4.4.3 of the CBC is ·required to isolate 
the· pool' or any other bodies of water over 18 inches .deep from neighboring_ . 
properties and public ways 

Exception: .When the swimming- pool or any other bodies of water over 1-8 inches· 
.. deep is fully enclosed around Its perimeter by an-enclosure complying_to .. 
· "·california Building Code Section.3109.4.4.3 

32 
0000142278C031 



14.04.258 - Section 8·408 of the 2().1.3 201·6 Edition of ~he California Building· Code 
entitled 2().1.3 2016 . E~ition of the California HistoricaiBuiiCJin·g C'Ode is·· amended by 
adding the following. .-· _.,. , 

\ . j . . 

4. The use of wood on the exterior· side of exterior walls shall be prohibited in the 
Extreme, high and moderate . .-fire hazard severity zones_.a$ identified by the Pasadena 

· Fire Department. . · 

ExceptiOfl;: _ l~ t~e moderate fire hazard severity .~one, t~e fi,re cod.e -off~cial m~y, upon a 
showing of good cause. and necessity, . approve the use a.f .fi_r~-Tesistive wqod as pa~ of 
class A listed assemblies, and may require additional mitig.ation as warranted, for the 

. repair or m~intenan~e of existln'g .structures. ":·.:. . . . . . ·.. ' . . . ,; . .• 

) 14.04.260 ~ - sectioh R301.1.3~2 ofthEf~ 2016 Editl_oQof the p _aJifornia Residenti-al 
Code is amended to read as follows. •·- · 

· R301.1.3.2 Woodframe. structures. Ttie building official. shan require constructio~ 
documt3nts to be approved and stamped · by a California licensed architect or .en-gineer·. 
for all dwellings of woodframe construction more than two stories and oasement in 
height located in Seismic Design :Category A, 8 or C, notwithstanding other sections of 
la·w; the law-establishing thes·e provisions is found in Business and -Professions Code 

1 Section 5537 and 6737.1. · · · · 

. The building official shall -require construction documents -to be :a·pproved ·and ·stamped ·-. 
by a California licensed architect or engineer for all. dwellings of wqodframe construction 
more than one stor)l_ in height or\vith ~ basem~_nt .located in . Seismic Des_ign Category .· 
Do·, D1 ,· Di orE. . j . . .. . . . - . . . . , .. .. .. . . . . . ,_ . 

·'· . . ' '. - ' ' ', ' . · . .- .. ' . . . . . ',·. . . . . ' . _) 

14.04.265 - Section R301.1 ~4 is added to Chapter 3 of the ~ ·2016 Edition of the · 
Cali_fornia R~~idential Code to .. r~a~ as. follows. . 

R301.1.4 Seismic design provisioni:for buildings· constructed on or ihto· slopes. steeper· 
than one unit vertical in three units horizontal_(33.3· percent slope). The design aiJd 
construction of new buildings .. and ad_ditions to existing building~ when._ constructed on or 
into. slopes steepe'r ·than one unit vertical' ih three units hbrizon~al (33.3 perce_nt slope) · 
shall comply with Section 1.61'3:·9 _of the auildin:g Co'de. . . . . - . . . 

. · \... . '' .,_. '· .. ·_.- . . . .. ' ' ' :·.·.. . ·.. :'· .· . 

14.04.26!. ~· section R301:.2.2.3.e_is ~qded_ to Chapter 3_ of the. 2().1.3 2016 Edition of the 
. California .'Residential Code to. re·ad as follows. . . ' . . , . . 

R301.2.2.3.8 Anchorage of Mechanical, Electri.~al, or Plumbing .Components· and 
Equipment. . Mechanical, electrical, or plumbing comi)oiients a·nd equipment shall be 
anchored to ttle structure. Ancqorage of the c.omponents·_and equipment shall ·be . 
designeq to resist loaqs in accordance with th~ lnterrJational Building Code and ASCE 
7; except where the component is . po~itively. atta~hed ·to the-~tructure and. flexible 
connection~ are provided betw~en :the component and asso~i~ted . d_uctwork, piping_; and· 
conduit; and either 

33 
0000142278C031 

· ... ·; 

\ 



1. The compof1ent weighs 400 l_b (1 ,780 N) or less and has a center of mass located 4ft 
(1.22 m) or less above the supporting structure; or . · 

2. The component weighs 20 lb (89N) or less or, in the case of a distributed system, 5 · 
lb/ft (73 N/m) or less. · · 

14.04.270 - Section R401.1 of the ~ 2016 Edition ofthe California Residential Code 
-- l 

is amended to read as follows. 
j 

R401.1 Application. The· provisions of this chapter shall control the design and . 
construction of the foundation and. foundation spaces for aU buildings. ln·:·additio.n to·the 

' provisions of this chapter, the design and construction of foundations in· areas· prone t_o 
flooding flood hazard areas as established by Table R301.2(1) shall meet the 
provisions of Section R322. Wood .foundations shall be designed and installed in · 
accordance with ,1\,F&PA AWC PWF. , · · · 

Exception: The _provisions of this chapter shall be permitted to be used for wood 
foundations only in the following situations: · · 

- ·. - . ~. ' ' . . . . 

1. ·In buildings that have. no more than two floors and : a ·roof.· 

. 2 .. Whe·n-_ interior -basement and foundation vvaUs are constructed. at intervals not 
exceeding 50 feet (15 240 mm). 

Wood foundations .in Se.ismic Design. Category ·Do, D1 or D2 not be permitted._

Exception: .In no.~-occupied, -single-story, detached storage sheds .and similar uses . 
other than carport or garage, provided the gross floor area does not excee,d -200 square 
feet, the plate height does not exceed 12 feet in height above the grade plane at any 
point, and th~ maximum roof projecti_on does not exceed 24 inches. 

14.04.275 - Sections R403.1.2, R403.1.3 and R403.1.5 of the ~ 2016 Editiort' of the 
California Residential Code are .amended to read as follows. 

R403.1.2 C_qntinuou's tOoting in 'seismic Design Gate'gories DG,Q-1-~ . 
braced v1{lll panels .at exterior .\valls of buildings located in Seismic Design :·. _ 
·categories Og,...Q-1-_ and. D2 shall be supported by continuous footings. All required · 
interior braced 'llall panels in buildings shall be supported by continuous footings: _ 

R·4oa.1.3 Seismic reinforcing·. Concrete footings loc~ted in Seismic ·oesign _ · · 
Categories Do,...Q-1- and D;2, as established in Table R301.2(1 ), shall have. minimum . 
reinforc_9ment. Bottom reinforceme.nt shall be located a minimum of 3' inches (76 
mm)'clearfrom th~ bottom of the_footing. · · · · 

. In Seismic Design Categories DQ,--Q-1- and Di vJhere construction joint is cre·ated 
bet\'veen a 'concrete footing and a stem 'Nail, a minimum of one No. 4 bar shall be 
installed at not more than 4 feet (1210 mm) on center. The vertical barshall extend 

· to 3 inches (76 mm) clear of the bottom of the footing, have a standard hook and 
extend a minimum of 14 inches (357 mm) into the stem \!Jail. · · · · 

34 
·- 0000142278C031 



In Seismic Design Categories Og.,-0-t and D2 vJhere a grouted masonry stem wall is 
supported on a concrete footing and stem 'Nail, a minimum of one No. 4 bar shall.be 
installed at not more than 4 feet (121 9 mm) on center. The vertical bar shall e~end 
to 3 inches (76 mm) clear of the bottom of the footing and have a standard heal<: 

In Seismic D~sign Categories Dg-;--1;)-t and [h masonry stem \.Valls '.vithout solid grout 
and vertical reinforcing are not p~rmitted. 

Exception: In detached one and t\•Jo farnilydvJellings located in Seismic Design 
. Category A, B or C vJhich are three stories or less in height and constructed 'Nith 

stud bearing 'Nalls, iSolated plain concrete. footings, ·supporting COlumns OF 
pedestals are permitted. \ . 

R403.1.5 Slope. The top surface of footings shall be level. The bottom surface of 
footings shall be pprmitted to have a slope not exceeding one unit vertical in 10 
units horizontal (1 b percent slope). Footings shall be stepp.ed v.'here it is necessary 
to change the elevation of the top surface of the footing or 'ilhere the surface of the 
ground .slqpes more than one unit verti?al in.1 0 units horizoptal (1 0 perceF<lt slope). 

For structures located in Seismic Design Categories Dg,--04~, stepped footings 
. shall be reinforced 'IJith fol:Jr No: 4 repar.l?w~'~ bars shall be place at the· f<)p and 

bottom of the footings as sho,.vn In Fi.gui=e R403.1.5. · 
. . . ~ . . . 

R403.1'.2 Continuous footing ii1 Seismic Design Categories Do. D1 and D~. Ex.terior 
walls of buildings located hi Seismic Design Categories D0, . D1 and D~ shall be . , 

. s·upported by continuous solid or fully grouted masonry-or concrete footings. All· 
required interior braced wall panels in . buildings located in Seismic Design . 
Categories Do. D1 and D~ shall be supported on continuous foundations. 

- . ') 

R403.1.3.6 Isolated concrete footings. :ln :detached one- alid two-family dwellings . 
that ·are three :stories or less. in height and constructed with stud · bearing walls, 
isolated plain concrete footings supporting .·columns ·or pedestals are permitted·. 

'R403.1.5 ·Slope. The top surface of footings shall be level. The bottom surface of 
. footings shal'l not have a slope exceeding one unit vertical iri 10 units horizonta'l .. 

(10-percent slope). Footings shall be.stepped where 'it is ·neces·sary to.change the 
elevation of the top surface of the-fo.otings or where the slope .of the bottom . 
s~rfac~ of the footings will exceed o_ne _unit vertical in 10 units horizontal (1 0-
percent slope). 

For structures located in Seismic Design Categories 00, 01 or D~, stepped . . 
footings shall be reinforced with four No. 4 rebar. Two bars.~shall be place -~t: the.· 
top and bottom ofthe footings as· shown in Figure R403.1.5.. · 

35 
0000 142278C031 . 



~' -:---·--·----,-----·--·--·--

STEPPED FOlTh'lh\TIONS :- . . ' · 

·, ' . . 

14.04:280- Section R404.2 of the ~ 2016 Edition of the California- Residential Code 
is amended to read as follows-. 

-R404.-2 Wo~d foundation walls. Wood foundation walls shall be constructed-in __ 
accordance with the provisions of Sections R404.2.1 through R404.2.6 and with th(3 
details shown in Figures R403.1 (2) and R403.1 (3). Wood ·foundation walls shall not be 
used for structures located in Seismic Design Cat~gory_ Do, D1 or D2~ . 

- 14~04.282 .-Section R501 ~ .1 of the~ '201_6 _Edition of the Califo'rnia Residential Code 
is amended to, read as follows. _ 

R501.1 Application. The provisions of this chapter shali control the_design arid 
. c.onstruction of the floors for all bui!dings including the floors of attic spaces used to 

house mechanical or plumbing fixtures.and equipment -Mechanical or plumbing fixtures, : 
and equipment shall be attached (or anchored) to the structure in acco'rdance with ' - -
Section 'R30t .2.2.3.8'. - · · 

. -

14~b4.~85- ~Lines - 37_and 38 -of Table R602.3(1) ofthe~- 2016 Edition of the 
. . . . . . I . 

California Residential Code are amended-to. read as follows.· 

Staples shall not be used on other wall sheathing as fasteners in table R602.3(1 ). 
' - ' 

. . . . . 

_14.04.290 - Fo-otnote "b" of Table -R602.3(2) of the ~ 2016 Edition of the _California 
Residential Code is amended to read as follows. _~ 

b.-Staples. shall_ have a minimum crown width of 7 /16~inch o_n diameter except as n9ted. 
Use of staples in roof, floor, •subfloor, and braced ·wall panels.-shall be prohibited iri · 
Seismic Design Category D-o, D1, or Dz. · 

36 
0000142278C031 



14.04.295 - F.iglire R602.1'0.6:.2 -of the ~-·2016 Edition of the California Residential 
Code is amended to read as follows. · · 

Minimum.·15/32"thick wood strt.ictural p'ahel sheathing on· one face shall be: required . . 
·Giavanized· box· nails shall· not-be used, portal frame withhold.downs at detached ... 
garage door openings shall be double po-rtal frame (two 'braced wall panels) type at both 
ends. Single portal frame shaU not be used. -Mi·ntmum ·width ·bf portal frame shalf: be: 24 
inches with 15/32" thick wood structur~l panel sheathing fastened to the fram~~ 

' . ·' . l , · . ' I , -· . ' , •. · , 
) ' 

14.04.305 Section R602.10.9.1 of the 2013 .Edition of the California Residential Code 
. . · ~ 

is. delete~ in its ~ri~irety. 

14.04.315- Section R902 .. 1.1.1 is .added to the 2G1-a 2016 edition of the California 

Resiqentia·l· Code. to ·read ·as ·f~l_i.(?ws:. . \ . . . · · 

All roofing ·material' ih the ver)t-high arid mbderate· fire: hazard .severity zone must be · 
class A. No woqd roof.p~yering m~tetial sha~i .. be. installed on- any structure locat_ed in the. 
very high, ~igh .~nd r11oderat~ fire ha~ard zones as ideritifi~d by·the Pasadena Fire 
Department. All other roof covering materials in other z.ones shall be.·classA or 8~. · . . 
Exception: In the moderate fire hazard zone; the fire code official may, upon a showing . 
of good cau·se and.nec~_ssity, .appro,ve _the use of fire-resistive .wo_od as part of Class A 
listed assemblies, and may require additional.mitigation a~. warranted, for the r~pair or 

· maintenance of e~_isting structure. · · ·· · · · · · 

14.04.400- Section AG10d~3.f'AV1oo.·a·~f is added tq tti·e 2o13 ed-Ition of the California 
Residential Code to··read :as follows . 

. Enclosure .(fence) required: In :addition to ~he requirements .in the California· Residential 
Code, a barrier/enclosure is required to isolate the pool or any other bodies of water . 
over 18 inches deep from neighboring properties arid public ways·. • · · · 

. . . 

Exception: When the swimming·pooforany other'bodies .o'f water over-.18 -inches·deep · 
·is fully enclosed around its pe~imeter by _an enclosLJ~~·persection :AG100.3 AV100.3 of 

, the California Residenti~l Code. · · · · · .· .. · · .· .. · · ... · · · · • · · · · ·· ·· : 

·.14.04.500 - Section 101.3 of the 2013 edition of the 20-16 Cafifornia GreeM .. Buildings·. · 
Standards Code is amended to read as. follows. · .-. ) · .. > .- · : 

Section 101.3 Scope~ The provisions• of this code shall ~pply:to the plan·ning, 
1

de~ig·n~ 
operatiqn, construction, use and PC.9.upancy of every n~wly .constructed building or . 

. structure, . additi9ns or' alter~tions .to ~X.iS~ing ·buildings: 1:-Jnless .Ot~erWiSe ihdicateq in· this 
code, throughout the·. Sta~e· of Callfornic:t · · · · · · · · " 

'I)'' 

It is not' the ·intent ttiafthis ·cod€fsubstltute or be ·identified as meeting the certification->· .. 
requi'rement of-any green· building program. · , · · .... 

·-,· 
• ' o I • ' ~ ' ' 

• , .. 

·37 
0000 142278C031 



14~04.501. _Section 301.1_A of the 2013 edition _of the California Green Buildings 
Standards Code is _amended. to read as follo'.r:s.: 

301 A .1 Additiqns and alterations~ The mandatory provisions of Chapter 4 shall be 
-applied to additio-ns or alterations, of e*isting residential buildings Code sections relevant 
Jo additions and alterations shall only apply to the ,portions of the building being added 
or altered. \Vitti in the scope of permitted \York. · 

14.04.502 - Section· 301.3 of the 2013 edition of the 2016 California Green Buildings . 
Standards Code is amended to. read as .follows . 

. ·Nonresidential additions and alterations. The provisions of individual sections of 
Chapter 5 apply to newly constructed buildings; bu_ilding additions and/or building_ 
.alterations (for occupancies within the authority of California Building Standards 
Commission). Code sections relevant to additions and-alterations sha]l only apply to the · 
portions· of the building .b~ing added or alt~red within the scope qf~he. permitted work. 

A· code sec;tion will be designated by a banner to indicate wti·ere the code section only 
applies to newly constructed buildings {N} or to :additi.ons and alterations {AA}. Wh~n the 
code ·section applies to both, no banner Will be ~sed. · · · · 

14.04.504 - _Section 307.1 ·and section 307.2 is added to the2013 edition of the 2016·. 
Californ-ia Green Build-ings ~tandards Code to read · as follows. · · ·. 

307.1 .Buildings required to. comply with Tier 1. include the following~ 
' ' • • t • • • ' • 

1. Municipal buildings of 5,000 square feet or more of new construction; 

2~ -Nonresidential buildings -with .25,000 square feet ·or more of new· construction, 

3. Tenant improvementS. of 25,000 square feet or more, _ · 

4. Mixed use .and multi-fami_ly residential quilding~ of four sto~ies~in. h~_ight or more. 

307.2 Buildings -required to comply .with Tier 2 includethefollowing: .· 

1. ·New MunicJpal puildings, _ . 
• • • • • : •j 

_2. Municipal building renovations of 15,000 squar~ feet or more, 

· _ 3. N_ew commercial type buildings of over 50,000 square feet or more .. 

· Note: \.\there there_ are practical difficulties involved. in complying with the threshold 
levels ofa Tier, the enforcing agency may grant modifications for individual cases. The · 
enforcing agency shall first find that a special individual reason makes the-strict letter of 
the. Tier impractical and that modification is in .conformance with the intent and purpose _· 
of the measure. The details of any action granting modification shall be· recorded and 
entered in the files of the enforcing agency. 

0000142278C031 

l 



14.04;506.:. Section·s·4.-l06:5-~1 through 4d06.5.4. ate ·added tothe·2013 editioA-ofthe· .. , · 
2016 California G·reen Buildings ;standards-Code.tO'~readas foHows~ ·- · · ·· : : ·' .:·.~· -~ 

·4 .. 106.5.1. Cooi_.R9of. Fpr new .. bu,ild~n,gs an.d._a.dd_i_tions.oralterations to existing. roof 
. fra-ming·, roofing tnatE)rlals m~st cdrl"fply with 'sections 4.f0(>.5~2--.~.·4.1 06:4 'anq table 
4.106.5. - - .. . . . __ ., ,_, . - . . ; .. 

•,": .. , - ",··,-, :, -' • • I ' 

4.1 06.5.2. ·cool ·Roof for Reductiori-of'Heat Island Effe.cL:Roofing materiai-shall comply 
with the-following::, · .! ·• .• _---> - • ·- · ·· · .:·: __ .-;-·_ •. : _ .. __ ;··-.-·> · .. ·-

4.1 06.5.3. :Solar:Ref,lectance.: R~~fing ~aterial shall have'a: minirn~·m 3~y~-ar.aged· solar 
reflectance equaiJo·,or greaterthan ,the values specified.-in .-~able-4._106.5. : .. ·· /.~. }.·· 

4.1 06.5.4. Thertllal. Emitta.nde. Robti,ng -~-~terl~ls sti~u· ha~~ a' Co~l; Roof Rating-Council .. 
(CRRC) initial or aged thermal emittance equal to or greater than those specified in· · 
Table 4.1 06.5·. ~-- ·,: : . .. [~:: · 

· ·solar reflectance. values sha:·ll be- t>ased on th·e.ag'ect ·reflectance -~alue at the .roofing . 
product or the equation in Section A4.1 06.5.1 if the CRRC certified aged solar · · 
reflectance are--not ·availqble. Certified th.er"la.l emittance u·sed in:the S.olar Reflectance .. 
lndex.Calculation:Worksheet(SRI:-WS)developed_ by~ the Energy Commission may be_ . 
either the initial value or the aged value listed by the CRRC. 

EXCEPTIONS:· · · · - ' . · ... : 

.:1:. . 

. 2. Root repraceme~nfwhen.ttie·ro6tare-a being repfaced is equal tO' or less than 
- :·: 5oo;ri·afthetotal'rootarea-;:or~· ::-.-. · · · -, ;._ · ·: ... · ·- · · · ·- · <-_ .. ' .. - ·- ·.- • 

' " • :, ' • • ' .~··:· .~ ' ' ~ - ' I • ' • • • • , 

3. Building-in-tegrated photovoltaic (BIPV). 

TABLE 4.106.5. 
. ~ . . '-, ... _ 

. _MINIMUM ·3-YEARAGED.SOLAR -
,_ :_REF.lt::CTANCE .:- . THERMAL EMITTANCE ROOF SLOPE. 

·: · .. ,· 

:S2:12 . :·. 0.65 . 0~75 .' .. 

. >2:12 . . ~ ' 0.23 0~75 .. 

. ~ ,-

14.04.508 ·· Sectiorf4.106.·6 ·4.A06.6.2.3 is added to the 2013 edition of the California · 

Green Buildings Standards Code to read as follo'AtS. 

39 
0000142278C031 



4 .1.06:6. Electric ~/ehicle (EV) Charging [N]. Ne'N residential buildings shall comply 'Nith 
the follov:ing requirements for theJuture. installation of electric vehicle supply.equipment 
(EVSE). - . - -- - . . . . . - , . - . -- - -

- - - ·-

4 .1 06~6.1. One and Tv10 Fam:lly DvJellings and ·Tov:nho·mes. Install a Usted race'IJay to 
accommodate a dedicated branch circuit The racevl-ay shall not be less than trade size 
1 (nominal1 inch inside diameter). The racev:ay shall be securely fastened at the main 
s~rvice or sub panel and shall termin~te: in close: proximity _tQ ~~e proposed location of _
the charging system into a listed cabinet, box or enclosure. Race\"Jays _are required to -
be continuous at enclosed or concealed areas and spaces. A race\\fay may terminate in 
an attic or other' approved location 'Nhen it can- be demonstrated that the area_ is -
accessible and no- removal of materials is~necessary to com-plete the final installation~ -
Sufficient conductor sizing and service capacit){ to install Level ~ EVSE shall be · 
pro'iided. · · - - - · - -- - · · - -

4.1 06.6.1.1. Labeling Requirement. l\ label stating "E'/ CAPA-BLE'i shall be, posted in a. 
conspicuous place at the service panel or subpanel and ne?<t to the racev~ay termination 
~- ·-·- -· . . .. 

4 ~1 06.6~2-. Multifamily .Dvtellings. At least 5 percent-of the total parkii1g spaces, but not · 
_less than one, shall be capable of supporting future electric vehicle supply equipment .-. · 
(EVSE). 

4.106.6.2.1. Sing.le Charging Space Required. V'/hen only a single c~argirig space:is 
required, install a listed race'Nay capable of accommodating a dedicated b.ranc~ circuit. 
Tho racev:ay shall not be less than trade size 1 (nominal 1 inch inside diameter). The 
race'Nay shall b~ secu,rely-fastened at the main f;jervice or subpan~_l and shall terminate 
in ·close proximity to the proposed location of the charging system fnto a listed cabinet, _ 
box or enclosure. Sufficient conductor sizing and·service ;capacity to install Level 2 
E'/SE shall be provided. - - . _ . , .-. _ 

4.106.6.2.2. Multiple Charging Spaces Required. 'IVhen multiple charging spaces are 
required~ plans shall include the location(s) and type of the EVSE, racev.tay method(s), 

-\Vi ring schematics and electdcal calculations to verify that the electrical system has -
sufficient capacity to simultaneously charge all the electrical vehicles at' all designated
E\/ charging spaces at their full rated amperage. Plan design shall be based upon Level 
2 EVSE at its maximum operating ampacity. Only. underground racev:ays and related 
underground equipment are required to be installed at the time of construction. 

4.106.6.2.3. Labeling Requirement./\ label stating "EV CAPABLE" shall be posted in a 
conspicuous place at the service panel or sub panel and the EV charging space.-

14.04.510 -Sections 4.202 - 4.202.1.1 are added to the 2013 edition of the 2016 
California Green Buildings Standards Code to read as follows. 

S.ection 4~~02 Renewable Energy. Sections 4.202.1 and 4.202.1.1 shall ap·ply to 
residential, multifamily, mixed use buildings. . .. 

40 
0000 142278C031 



4:202.1. ·s·pace for Future Electrical Solar System Installation [N]. ·Comply 'iJith SeGtion 
11 0.1 0 of. the California Energy Code. · 

4.202.1.1. Future ~~ccess for Electrical Solar System [N]. For ne'N·buildings or'.,•lhen. an-.. · 
e~<isting service i~ relocated. to nevw' construction area,. a. minimum of one inch ele.ctrical 

. conduit shall ,be provided from the electrical service equipment to an accessible location 
· in the attic or other location suitable for future connection to a solar system. The conduit 

shall be labeled as future access·f<J'r electricai solarsysb:~m. The. electrical panel shall 
be sibed~ to accomm·odate.the installation of a futu·re electricai solar system:,· · 

4.202.1 .. Space fore Future Electrical Solar System _Installation [NJ. Comply with 
Section 110.10 of the California Energy·code. 4.202.1.1. Future access-for -· 

, . 

solar system. 

E~ception: Bufldings not require.d to provide-a _solar zone per Section 110.1 o of the 
California -Energy Code. . · · · · , ' · · 

14.04:51.2 Section "5.106.5.3. is added to .the;2013 editidn ofthe California Green 
' ' . . 

Buildings Standards Code to read as follovw's,. 

5.106.5.3. EleGtrio Vehiole Chargi~g IN]. pj lecist5 percent ofthe total pcirking spaoes, . 
but not less than one, shall be capabl·e of supporting installation of future ·e.lectrio vehicle 
supply equipment (EVSE). · · · · · ·· 

14.04.514 Section 5.1 06.5.3.1 is added to the 2013 edition of the California Green . ' - . 

Buildings Standards Code to read as follo'J.<s .. 

5.106.5.·3.1. Single Charging Space. Requirements. VVhen·only a single._charg_in@ space 
is required, install a listed racevvay capable of accommodating a dedicated. branch: 
circuit. The race'Nay shall ·no{ be less thari trade size 1 inch. ·The·race\~w'ay shall be 
securely fastened at the main· service.or subpanel and shall terminate. in close pro:ximity 
to the· proposed location of the charging system ihto.:a'_.listed cabinet, bo:x or enclosure. 
Sufficient cond.ucto.r sizing: and service capacity to install Level 2 EVSE. shall b.e 
pro'Jided. .· · · ., · 

14.04.516- Section •AA.106.53 A4.106.5.3 of the 2013 edition of the 2016 California 
Green Building s Buildings Standards Code is deleted and Tables A4.1 06.5.1 (1 )_ 
through A4.106.5.1(4) of the 2013 .California Green Buildin-gs Standards Code are 
amended to read as follows. 

41 
·oooo142278C031 

\ 



A4.1 06.5.3 Solar Reflectance index alternative. Solar Reflectance index (SRI) equal to 
or greater than the values 

TABLE A4.1 06.5.1 (1)- -
TIER 1-LOW RISE RESIDENTIAL 

.·. 
MINIMUM 3-YEAR AGED 

ROOF SLOPE SOLAR .. 

REFLECTANCE 

S2:·12 0.68 

>2:12 ·.- 0.28 

--

TABLE A4.106.5.1 (2) 
TIER 2-LOW-RISE RESIDENTIAL 

MINIMUM 3-YEAR AGED' 
ROOF SLOPE SOLAR 

REFLECTANCE .-

S2:12 0.70 

>2:12 0.34 

TABLE A4.106.5.1(3) 
TIER 1 ~ HIGH-RISE RESIDENTIAL 

·BUILDINGS·; HOTELS, AND MOTELS 

MINIMUM 3-YEAR AGED.: 

ROOF SLOPE 
.. 

" , SOLAR 

I 
REFLECTANCE 

· S2:12 0.68 

42 
0000142278C031 

THERMAL 
EMITTANCE 

. -0.85. 
.. 

.0.85 
.. .. 

: 

THERMAL 
EMITTANCE 

_.· 

0.85 

0.85 

.THERMAL 
EMITTANCE-

- -

0.85 
', ~ ' 



>2:12 00.28 

TABLE A4.106.5.1(4) 
TIER 2 - HIGH-RISE RESIDENTIAL 
BUILDINGS, HOTELS, AND MOTELS 

MINIMUM 3-YEAR AGED 
ROOF SLOPE SOLAR 

REFLECTANCE 

S2:12 0;70 
/ 

>2:12 0.34 

I 
. 0~85. 

THERMAL 
EMITTANCE 

0.85 

0.85 

14.04.518 Section /\,4 .1 06.8.2 of tne 2013 edition of tne California Green Buildings 
· Standards Code is amended ·to read as follo'NS . 

\ 

. A4 .1 06.8.2. Multifamily D'Nellings. At least 10 percent of tne total parki-ng spaces, 
but not less tnan one, shall be capable of supporting future electric venicle supply 
equipment (EVSE). 

. . 

14.04.522 . Section ·,A,§~-1 06.5~a:.a oi tne 2013· edition of tne California Greeh Building _· ·:: 
Standards Code is amended to read as follo\\tS. -· 

A5.1 06.5.3.3 Tier 1. At least 7 percenrot the tota·l parking spaces, but n'ot ie·ss thah 
one, snail be capable of supporting installation of future el_ectric ve~icle supply _. : ~-
equipment (EVSE). · · · · - · · · 

14 ._.04 .52"4. ·:_sEiction ,A, 5.1 06.5.3:.'4 of the 2d1'3 'editiqn of 'tne .c~li.fomia G.FQeri' Buil~ing . . 
Standards Code is amended to read .as fcillov1s. · .. · ·· · · · · · ... _ · ·· · · 

. I . A5.fQ6.5.a.4. Jier 2. 'At' least 19 perc~nt, of tne 'tot~l parking space_s, but -~at i~ss 
tnan tv'.ro, .snail be capable otsupporting installation of future EVSE. ·. . - ... 

14.04.526 - Section AS, 1 06.11.2:3 oi the 2013 Sdition of the 2016 Galiforrlia GI'Elen 
Building. Standards Cods ~s- deleted ano ·Tables' A5.1 06.'11.2 .. 2 {BSC}; a~d ,A5.1 06~ 11.2.,3 

. of the 2013 editio.n.of the.C,aliforri!a Green Building· ~taridard~_-Cpde:are ary1e~de~ to' 
r~ad as follows. · · · · · · 

/ 
43 

0000142278C031 

I 



TABLE A5~ 1 06.11.2.2 [BSC] 
TIER 1 

---

MINIMUM 3-YEAR AGED 
ROOF SLOPE SOLAR 

REFLECTANCE 

<2:12 0.68 
. ' 

- --

>2:12 0.28 

--

TABLE A5.1 06.11.2.3 

MINIMUM 3-YEAR AGED 
. TIER 2 ROOF SLOPE . SOLAR 

I REFLECTANCE 

--

<2:12 '0.70' 
I 

>:2:12 -0.34 

--- ··--4--·, 

- ~ --

THERMAL EMITTANCE 

0.85 

0.85 

. -

THERMAL EMITTANCE 
\ 

-
- - --

0.85· 

0.85 

----

Section-4. Title 14, Chapter 14.28 of the Pasadena Municipal Code is amended as 
follows: 

\ 

A. By amending Se.ction 14..28.010 to read as follows: 

·14.28.01 o- California Fire Code, adopted. 

SRI 

SRI 

Except as is otherwise provided for in this chapter by specific provision, the minimum 
standards, provisions and requirements -for th:e safe construction and maintenance of 
property, facilities, conditions, materials, equipment, fire prevention and alarm- systems, 
and the general supervision thereof for the purpose· of combating _and control of fire and 
fire hazards arid ·abate merit of same, within the corporate limits of the city, ·shall be. in 
accordance with the ·provisions-and·in the manner prescribed by the California Fire 
Code,~ 2016 Edition ("California Fire Code") in its entirety, as-published by the -
lnternatfonal Code Council and including Appendix Chapter 4 and Appendices B .. 
through D, and I, all as compiled·, adopted, and subsequ-ently amended by the 
International Code Council, California State Fife· Marshal's Office, California Buildil1g 
-Standards Commission, or City of Pasadena. One copy of the above publications is on_ 

44 
0000142278C031 

I 



file .for public 'inspection 'and they are.adopted and incorporated herein as iffully·set 
forth in this chapter~ - · ' 

14.28.020 ·- Changes ·and::addition$ to. ~he. a~opte~ ·code. 
I. 

·' 

. 1. S;ecti6n.J01.1 of Chap~er · 1 . ofth~ 2016 Califoniia'Fire :Gode :is. amended to' read a·s .. . · 
follows: ·.: :· · · '. · · · · . · · · · · .· · · ·.. · · · · .. 

These ·regulations sh.all·be··known as .the Fire Code -df the City of: Pasade.na, herein 
referred to as •ithis code." ~-,-_, · · · ?•, 

2. Section 104 of Chapter 1 of the 2016 California Fire Code is amended by adding ·_..-: 
Section 10~.12,_ entitled "~ost Recovery," to read as foil~~~: 

Where· an emergency situation is caused or exacerbated by. a willful act,- a negligent act, 
or a violation of the Fire Code, Building Code, or any other applica.ble law, ordinance or 
regulation, the cost of _mitigating and securing any emergency that is within the 
responsibility of: the ·Fire·Chief is· a charg~ against the person. who caused the 

·emergency or who caused the circumstances leading to the creation of the emergency. 
Damages and expenses incurred by any public agency providing m·utual aid shall . 
corastitute a debt of such person ·and. shall be collectible· by .. the Fire Chief for· pro pet · · 
distribution in the same :· rnanneras ·in .the ~,ase of an obHgation under contract 
expressed or implied .. Expense~ .. as st~ted above shall includ~, _but riot be limited to; . 
equipment and ·personne.l committed and ~ny payments. r~quir~d by the public agency 
to outsid~ business firms requested by. the ·public agency to mitigate or secure ttie . .· 
emergency, monitgr remediation, a.nd _cl~_~n . up_. . '- . · . · · . · · · . : · : · . · ' . 

3. The exception in Section 105.6.27, item .1, of Chapter 1 of the 2016 California Fire 
·Code is ':amended to read as follows: ; ··· ··::. · · · · ~ · 

Exception: A permit is not required .for individual containers with a 20-gallon (45.5 L) . 
wat~rcapacity or less, or 40.gallons (75~7 L) cumulatively, serving ·occupancies in· · · 

· Group R-~. · · · · ., ; .. . . · · · · · · · · · · 

4. Section 1 05 of Chapter f of the 2016 ·California Fire Code is amended by changing . 
Section '105~7.4, entitled "Cryogenic Fluids," to read as· follows: · 

' • ! • : • , · • ~. • • ' • • ' ' ' ~ • 

. -. · .. 

A construction permit is required for installation-, alteration or closure of cryogenic fluid 
storage systems where the system capacity exceeds the amounts listed in Table 

· 105.6~10~ Maintenance performed i'n accordance. with this code. is not considered an : 
alteration and does· not require a permit: · : - · · · · · -

· 5. Section 108 of Chapter, 1 of the_ ~0_1,6 California Fire, Code is d~leted in its entir~ty . 
.. 

6. Section _109.4 of:Chapter 1·ofthe California Fire Code is amended to read as follov,tS: 
I 

J\11 sections in the _codes referenced in Section 14.28.010 herein pertaining to violations 
are amended in their entirety to read as follo\AJS: . 

45 
0000142278C031 



It shall be unla't"lful for any person, firm or corporation to ere?t, construct, enlarge; alter, 
repair, move, improve, remol1e, c;;onvert, or demolish, equip, use, occupy, or .maintain 
any building, occupancy, preni.ises, systqm or ~tructure in the City, or cause same to be 
done, contrary to or in violatio·n of any of the provisions of this chapter. l\ny person; firm, 
or corporation violating any ofthe provisions of this Ordinance, shall be deemed guilty 
of a misdemeanor, and each such per=Son shall be ·deemed guilty of a separate offense 
for each and every day or portion thereof during \Aihich any violation ·of any of the · 
provisions of this ()rdiriance is committed, continued,_ or permitted, and upon conviction 
of any such violation such persons shall be punished by a fine· of not more than one . 
thousand dollars ·($1 ,000) or by imprisonment for not more than one (1) year, or by both 
such fine ariq impriso.nment. 

In addition to the above penalty -provisions, violation of any of the provisions of this -
. chapter may be subject to the administrative proceedings- set forth in Chapter.1 ~25 of· 
this code.. . . 

' ' . 

Section 1.09.3 of: Chapter ·1 of the 2016 California Fire Code is amended to read as 
follows:· 

Violation penalties. Persons who violate any provision of this code or shall fail to . 
comply with any of the requirements thereof or who shall erect, install-, alter, 
·repair or do work in- violation of the approved construction documents or 
directive of the fire code official, or of a permit or cerfificate used under 
provisions of this code, shall be guilty of a misdemeanor and subjecfto the -
penal-ties specified in Chapter 1.24 of the Pasadena Municipal Code. 

7. Section 111.4 of Chapter 1 of the .2016 California Fire Code is a~ended to read :as 
follows: · · · · · · · · 

Any person who continues any work aft~r havin-g been served with a stop work o~der,. 
except such work as that pers·ori is directed to pertorm to remove a violation or :unsafe 
condition, shall be guilty of a misdemeanor and subject to the penalties specified in 
_Section 109.4 of this code. Chapter 1.24 of the Pasadena Municipal Code · 

8. Section 510 of the 2016 California Fire Code is amended l;>y adding Section 510-.1.1, 
entitled "Disruption of Radio Communications," to read as follows: 

' . ' . 

The int~ntional installation or use of materials, ·devices or other building design features · 
which disrupt or otherwise decreas~s the effe-ctiveness of radio communications shall . 
be prohibited .. 

9. Section 903 of the California Fire Code is amended by ·adding Section 903.1.2, 
· entitled "Minimum Fire Suppression Protection for Ne'.v Construction," to read as 
follovvs: 

46 
0000142278C031 

.J 



All ne'N construction shall be provided ''Nith an approved automatic fire suppression 
system throughout the building, v1ithout regard to the criteria listed in soction 903.2 et 
seEr.. 

. . . . 

Exception: The foiiO\Ving types of constrl:Jction may be exempt from this section v:hen .. 
approved by the fire code official: 

1. Garages, carports and similar struct~res provided no portion of the· structure is 
located more t~an '150 feet (4 5720 mm) from appro'~ed fire department access; 

2. Utility sheds, gazebos, and similar. structures of less than 1.20 square feet (11.15 m2~ 
provided no portion of the structure i.s located more than 1 ~0 feet (4 5720 mm) fror:n · 
approved fire department access·;. . ' 

3. Fences and open trellises~ and, 

4. Other similar structures as deemed appropriate by the fire code official. 

. Section 510.3 of the 2016 California Fire code, entitled "Emergency .responder . 
·.radio coverage in existing buildings," is amended by changing Item 2 and· adding 
Items 3 through 6 to read as follows: 

Existing occupancies shall comply with section 510.1 where one of the following · 
conditions exists: 

1. Wherever existi·ng wired communication system cannot- be repaired or is 
being replaced, or where not approved in accordance with Section. 510.1, 
Exception 1 -

. . 

2. Whenever the fire code official det~rmines that compliance is required for 
the protection of the health and safety of the public or emergency- responders. 

3. Whenever additions result in an additional level above or below grade, or a 
total increase of more than 1 000 square feet (92.9 m2

) or an increase of more 
than fifty percent (50%) in the total floor area including mezzanines and 
additional stories, whichever is less, regardless of ownership. Additions shall 
be cumulative with each application for building permit from January 1, 2008; . 

4. Whenever the value of alterations exceed fifty percent (50%) of the·. 
replacement value of the structure, excluding the value of property and 
contents. Alteration values shall be cumulative with each application for a 
building permit ,from January 1, 2008. Expenditures for maintenance and 

· repairs such as interior and exterio·r painting, carpeting, interior window 
coverings, drapes, movable partitions, surface re-roofing or plu.mbing, 
mechanical and electrical repairs shall not be considered when calculating the 
percentage of alterations; 

47 
0000142278C031 



. 5. Whenever there is an occupancy classification -change to a. more hazardous 
use, as determined by the fire code official; or, 

6. Whenever any existing Group R Division 1 occupancy is subdivided to 
condominium or any non-residential occupancy is converted, in part or whole, 
to a residential occupancy. 

10. ·Section 903 of the California Fire Code is amended by adding Section 903.1.3, 
entitled "Partial Automatic Fire Suppression Systems Prohibited," to read as follov.'s: 

. VVhe'never an automatic fire suppression system is installed for any portion of any 
buildi-ng or structure, an automatic fire suppression system shaiJ be instalied for the 
entire building or structure. · -

Chapter 6 of-the 2016 California Fire Code is amended by adding section 610 
entitled "Photovoltaic Systems", to read as follo_ws: 

The fire code official may adopt such fire and life. safety requirements as are 
necessary for the safe installation and operation of photovoltaic systems. Unless 
and until specific requirements are adopted, the current version of the California 
Departm~nt of Forestry and Fire Protection, Office of the State Fire Marshal's 
"Solar· Photovoltaic Installation Guidance" is adopted. · 

11. Section 903 of the California Fire Code is amended by adding a sentence af the 
end of Section 903.3.5, entitled "VVater supplies", to re.ad ,as follov:s: 

Hydraulic calculations shall include a 1 Q%, reduction from the source.·

Section 903 of the 2016 California Fire Code is amended by· adding- Section 
903 .. 1.2, entitled "Mini~um Fire Suppression Protection for New Constr~:~ction," to 
read as follows: 

All new construction· shall-be provided with an·approved automatic fire 
suppression system throughout the building, without regard to the crite~ia listed 
in section 903.2 et seq. 

Exception: The .following' types of construction may be exempt from this section 
·when approved by the fire code- official: 

\ 

1. Garages, carports and similar structures provided no portion of the 
structure is located more than 150 feet (45720 mm) from approved fire· 
department access;· 

48 
0000142278C031 



- ---- ---------------------------------------------

2 . . Utility sheds, gazebos, .and similar structures of less than '120 ·square feet 
. (11. 1'5 m2

) provided no portion of the structure is -located . more than 150-feet 
(45720 mm) from approved fire department access: 

. . :_). 

.... · .. 

3. Fences and open treUise~: and, 

4. Other similar structures as deemed appropriate by the fire code o·fficial. 

12. Section. 903.3.5~1- .2 ofthe California ·Fire Code, ·entitled "Residential · 
combination· services", is amended to read as foiiO¥/S: . 

. . . . ._. ·-- . . -

. Combination services are not aU?~iled for NF~,«\ 13R systems·. . 

Section 903 of the 2016 California Fi.re .. Code is amended by adding Section 
903.1.3:, entitled .. Existing Occupancies," to read as foilows: 

·.:__; 

Existing. occupancies·; .with the .exception of R-3.-1. and .R-4 occupancies,· shall 
comply with ~~ction 903.1'._2 where one-.of the ·following ·conditions exists:· . 

1. Whenever additions result in an additional level above or b~low grade, or a· 
- ·total increase of. more than.1-000 square feet (92.9 m2

) or an increase of more · 
.. •. \ . . . . . .. . . . . . . . . 

.. than fifty percent (50o/o) in .the total floor area including mezzanines and . 
. additional stories; whichever. is less, _regardless of o~ne·rship. Additio~s shall 
_be cumulative with each application-for building-permit from-January 1,: 2008 . . 
_ R-3 occupancies. shall not be required to comply with this condition solely due 
to th.e addition ·of an ~dditi.onallevel, unless one -of the criteria for an increase· 

.. of total floor area is-also exceeded; 

·· ·2. Whenever the ·value ~f alte-~ations exceed fifty perce:nt csoo/o) of the 
replacement value of the structure, exch.lci.i'ng the value of property and ; '. . · . 

. contents, as -determined by the B-uilding· Official. Alteration values shall be 
.cumulative with each application for a building. permit from January 1, 2008~ ~
Expenditures for maintenance and repairs such· as ·interior and exterior 
painting, carpeting, interior window. coverings, drapes, ·movable partitions, 
surface re-roofing or plumbing, _me_chanical and electrical repairs shall not be 

· · . considered when cal·culating the percentage of alterations: 

. 3. Whenever there is an occupancy classification change to a· m.ore hazardous 
-use, as determined by the fire code official: or, 

49 
0000142278C031 



_4 .. Whenever . ,any existing Group R Division 1 occupancy ·_ is subdivided to 
' condominium or any non-residential occupancy is converted, in part or whole, 
to a residential occupancy . - ' 

13. Section 907 of the California Fire Code is amenqed by changing the first · · 
paragraph of Section 907.2, entitled "'IVhen required· · ne'll buildings and · 
·structures," to read as foiiO'NS: 

For ne'..v construction ~f 10,000 !square. feet (929 m2.) or more, an approved 
automatic fire alarm system shall be installed in compliance '..Vith this code and 
NFPA 72. At a minimum, smoke detectors, or other listed and approved 
detection device_s, shall be installed in all electrical, mechanical, storage, 
conference or similar rooms. Listed and approved alarm notification appliances 
providing both~audible and visual notification shall be installed throughout the 

. building in compliance 'Nith this code _and NFPA !2. 
Section 903. of the 2016 California Fire Code is amended. ~y adding Section 
903.1.4, entitled "Partial Automatic Fire Suppression Systems P~ohibited," 

·to read as follows: 
- ' 

Whenever an automatic fire ·suppression system is installed for any portion 
of any building- or structure, an automatic fire suppression system s_hall be 
installed for the entire building or structure. · 

Finding: Topographic ·and climatic~Narrow ·and winding access roads to hillside 
areas, and hot, dry weather and seasonal winds result in increased-exposure to 
fire risk. Additionally, the increased use .of decreased property line setback · · · 
development increases the community risk from fire spread. The California Fire 
Code recognizes the benefits of fire·.sprinklers hi· requiring · instailation in new· 

·structures. Partial fire spri'nklers protect only limited areas of the structure and 
_ · provide less protection than complete systems .. This amendment. continues th~ 

existing prohibition of partial fire sprinkler systems in order to decrease the risk 
of conflagration within the community. 

' ' 

14. Section 908_ ofthe California Fire Code is. amended ·by·adding section 908.8, _entitled 
"Re_q~irem~nts", to ~ad as follo'IIS: . 

. PJI emergency alarm-control pa-nels shall be UL 201 7 ~rUb 864 Listed. All . 
· sensors shall be UL 2075 Listed. All Deteotion and Alarm ~ystems shall be 
·. po'Nered and supervised as required for fire alarm systems NFP.'\ 72. - . 
Secondary pov.<er.supplies shall be calculated for 24 hours equipment ·standby 

. time plus emergency standby duration calculated·for the longest modeled· 
releas.e .rate a·r 5 minutes, 'Nhiche'ier is the longest duration. 'lisual alarms shall 
be blue. 

50 
0000 142278C031 

. I 



I . 

Section 903 ·of the. 201·& California Fire.Code is amended .by-adding a ·sentence. at ' 
the end of Section 903.3.5, ·:entitled ''Water supplies'~ ,--to ·read as follows: · 

.:·:· ..• . · 

Hydraulic cal~ulations shall include a 1 Oo/o reduction -froin the source~ ·:'·_:· . . .. .. 

· .. . :: . . ··. : . ,. 
;: · . .. . ·, ... 

..·. ·· 
. -. . .. . . ' . - . - . . 

15. Section 11 03.2 of the Californi~ Fire. cod~, .entitled. "~mergency responder. radio. 
coverage in existing euildirigs, II i·s amended hy changing Item 2 and adding Items 3 
through 6 to read as follo\•.'s: 

. :: .. ·Existing occupancies.shaiLco.mply:\•.'ith section·51-0J 'Nhere .one ·of the foiiO'A'ing 
conditions exist:· . . . . ·· · · · . .. . :- -... · 

1. VVherever existing·v.'ire€fcoRimunication.system cannot.ee. repa.ired er is ;. 
being replaced,·.Qr-iNhere notapproved·ln ·accordance with Section 5tOA, 
Exception 1. 

' . . ·• •. • ':I .: • • . . • . . . .• . - · :. l .-. • ..:·_i· ·' -~ \ ·, --~~ . . 

.. i · . 2·. ·VVhene'ier·the fire code.· official determines that compliance is .required ·for the 
protection ofthe health arid .. safety.of the ·public or emergency responders. 

· .·. - . .. -... _ .. 

:3. ·V'lhQnever additions tesJi.t i~.-:~n addi.tionalle.ve·i aeo:.le or. eel~)i.' grade, or a 
. / total inc~ease of mor~ than 1090. s_quare feet (92.9 m~) .or an· inq~ease of more 

than.fifty percent-.(90%) ,in the total _floor area· incl.udif'1g· mozzanines an.d 
additional stories, 'l.'hichever is less, regardless. pf.o~Jnership. Additio~s shall ee 
cumulative 'IJith each application for building permit from January 1, 2008; 

· .. ·· '· ' / 

4. 'flhenev~r_the.'la_lue of a_lte~tio11~ exqeed·:-fifty-percent (50,~) of the . . 
· .. replacement 'talue of the structure, excludi_ng .the value of property ·and 

contents. Alter~tion.\talues ~t"l~ltbe c~niulative 'Ni_th each ._~pp.licatio~ 'tor a 
·.,. building -permit tro.m ~.anuacy._1, 2poa. ExpendituFQs .. for m~intenance .. a.nd repairs 

.. . · -: such. as interior and.~xterior . pa.int_ing, _ ~arpeting, in-terior 'NirJdO'll cqverings, 
. drapes~ movable p~rtitions~ , ~u~pe re ro.ofing or p.lumeing, mechanical and 
electrica·l repairs shall not be .conside.re.d_v .. hen. calculating· the percentage of 
alterations; - · · · · · · · · · .. 

. : " : 5. VVheneve'r th·e~ ,is an occup~A9Y classification chaf)g~ ·t~-- a-more ~azardous . 
use, as determined by the fire code official; or, 

.. 6. V\iheneverany ~xisti.ng_Gro,~p R. Divj§ion _1 oc.cL:Jpancy is subdi.vided to 
condominium or any non residential occupancY. is co.nverted, · in.,pa_rt _qr: 'lihole, to 

·.a res-idential oc9upancy. 

Section 903. of th~ .2016. California .Fire Code is amended ·by' adding a'sentence at' 
the end of Section 903.3.5.1- .2~ entitled ''.Residentiai ·.c()mbination .services",_to 
read as follows: 

' .~ . 

Combinatio.n servicesare n"ot ailowed for NFPA-13R systems .. 

51 
0000142278C031 



Finding:· Geologic~ Pasadena is located within a seismically active zone and is 
. near several active fault lines. Residential domestic water supplies -are generally 

not as seismically resilient as. fire sprinkler systems .. For example, In the event a 
· porcelain fixture broke in ·an earthquake~ a fire suppression.system using a - · 
. combination water supply could be compromised, whereas a fire sprinkler

system with a dedicated supply could still be functional. This amendment 
increases the-s-urviv-ability· of fire sprinkler systems.·: 

16. Section 1103.5 of the California Fire Code. is ame-nded by adding Section 1103.5.3, 
entitled "Exi~ting ·occupancies," to read as follo'Ns:· 

Existing occupancies, with the exception of R 3.1 and R 4 ·occupancies, shall 
: comply ll:ith section 903.1 ~2 'Nhere one of the follov:ing conditions exists: 

1. 'JVhenever additions result in an additional level above or belovigrade, or a 
. total increase of more than 1000 square ·feet (92.9 m2

) or ari increase of more 
·than fifty percent (50%) in the total floor area· including mezzanines and 
additional stories, 'l:hichever is less, regardless of ov:nership. Additions shall · 
be cumulative v:ith each application for building permit from January 1 I 2008. R 
3 occupancies shall not be required to comply· \Vith this condition solely due to 
the- addition, of an additional level, unl~ss one·of the criteria for an increase of 
total floor area is also· exceeded; . 

2. V'lhenever the value of alterations exceed fifty percent (50°/o) of the 
replacement \(alue of the structure, ·excluding the value of property _and 
cqnte~ts, as dete-rmined by the· Building Official. Alteration values shall be 
cLimiJiati'ie: 'llith each application for a building permit from January 1' '2008. -. 

· ·· Expenditures for maintenance· and repairs such as interior and exterior painting, · 
.. ·carpeting, interior '11AlindO'IJ COVeringS, drapeS, mQ\table partitiOiiS, SUrface Fe 

:· roofing or plumbing, mechanical and electrical repairs shall not be considered 
'Nhen calculating the percentage· of alterations; 

. -

3. VVhenever there is an occupancy classification change to a more hazardous 
us·e, as determined by the fire code official; ·or, 

4. VVhenever any existing Group R Division 1 occupancy is subdivided to 
. co'ndominiuril or,any non residential occupancy is converted, _in part or 'Nhole, to 
- a residential occupancy.- -

Section 907 of the 2016 California Fire Code is amended by changing the first 
. paragraph of Section 907.2, entitled "When. required-new buildings and -
structures,.-. to read as follows: 

For new construction of 10,000 square feet (929 m2l or more, an approved 
automatic fire alarm system shall be instal-led in compliance with this code and 

52 
0000 142278C031 



) 

NFPA ·72. At a ·minimum, smoke detectors. or-.other31h;ted and approved detection 
devices, shall be- installed in all electrical.· mechanical, storage; · conference or 
similar ro~ms. Listed and approved alarm_ notification appli~nces providing both 
audible and visual notification shall be installed throughout the building in 
compliance with this c.ode and· NFPA 72~ · 

' . ·: .. ,· . ' ~ 

. • • I , --

17. Section 11 03_ of. tt1~.- CalifOrnia ·Fire Code is ·amended by adding Section 11 03_.7.0.1 ~ 
en~itled "-Existing Occupancies_;''''to read as_ {ol!o~Ns: · .·_·.' . . . . _·_ .. ' . . - . ~. . . . . ' . 

· .: . : · .' 

Existing occupancies ~hall comply '•4JitM section ._997.2_ vJhere one of~he following 
conditions exists: · · · · 

1. VVheneve·r add-itions result -.in-afl additional level above or belov.~ grade, . or_ a 
total increase of more than 1000 square feet (92.9 m2

) or an increase of ·more 
t~an fifty percent (50~~) in the ·total floor a~a including me:zZanlnes and 

--_ additional~tories,__-,Nhichever- ·is . less, regardless qf ovlnersh_ip.l\dditions shall -be · 
'cumulative with 'Sach a'pplicati()n fOr buildirl-g perm:itfroni January 1' 2~08; I 

2. 'JVhenever the V[llue of alterations exce~d fifty percent (50%) of the 
replacement value of the structure, excluding. the value of property and . 

_contents, · as determined by the Building Official. Alteration values shall be 
cumulativ-e '•4/ith each application for a· building permit from January 1, 2008 . 

. _· . .J;xpenditures for ~~intenance and· repairs such as -~n~erior and exterior pa.inting, 
·carpeting, interior '.vindo'.v coveri'ngs,· dr~pes·, movable partitions, surface re 
roofing or plumbing, mechanical and electrical repairs shall not be considered 

- . \ 4Jhen calculating th~ percentage· of alterations; · 
. '.,· . .. ·. . . '· · . . . ' .. 

. 3 .. VVhenever..the~ - ~s a11 e.pcupaQCY classification chang(3 to . a more nazardous 
.use, as determined by the fi~ cod_e Qffici~l;: or·,_-. . _. 

4. VVhenever any existing Group R Division 1 occupancy is subdivided to 
condominium' or any non re~idential occvpancy is .c_onverted, in. part or 'IJhol~, to 
a residential occupancy. · - · .. , . , . --

9~ :VVhere required by Chap.ter 11. 

Section 907-of the 2016 :California_ Fire. Code is:·amended by changing Section . · 
-907.3, entitled "Existing Occupancies," to read as follows: 

Existing occupancies shall ~o~pl\t ~ith s-ection: 907.1.5 where C>:~e of tile·. 
following conditioris.exists: . . - .. . . 

1. Whenever additions result in an additional .level..above or below grade~ or a 
total increase of-more. than .-1000 sguare.feet (92.'9 .m2

) or an increase of more :··. 
than fifty percent (50%) in ttie total floor area' including mezzanines and 

53 
0000142278C031 



-------- --(- -

additional stories, whichever is less, regardless of ownership. Additions shall 
be cumulative with each application for building permit from January 1, 2~08; 

2; Whenever the value of alterations exceed fifty percent (50%) of the 
replacement value of the stru'cture, excluding the value of property and .. 
contents, as determined by the Building Official. Alteration values shall be 
cumulative with each application for a building permit from January 1, 2008. 
Expenditures for maintenance and repairs such as interior and exterior 
painting, carpeting, interior window coverings, drapes, ·movable. partitions, 
surface re-roofing or plumbing, mechanical and electrical repairs' shall not be 
considered when calculating the percentage of alterations: . 

3. Whenever there is an occupancy classification change to a more hazardous 
use, as determined by the fire code official; or,_ 

· 4. Whenever any existing Group R Division 1 occupancy is subdivided to 
condomi.nium o'r any non-residential · occupancy is converted, in part or whole, 
to a residential occupancy . .. 

5. Where required by.Chapter 46. 

18. Section 4901 of the California Fire Code is amended by adding Section 4901.1.1, 
entitled ~~Referenced standard, 11 to read as follovts: · 

' . 

The International VVildland Urban.lnterface Code, 201·2 edition, is adopted as a 
referenced standard for the enforcement of this chapter and other related 
sections of the Fire Code. 'Nhere conflicts occur bet\\'een the provisions of 
adopted codes and the referenced standard,_ the provisions ofadopted codes 
shall · apply. 

Section 908 of the 2016 California Fire-Code is amended by adding section 908.7, 
entitled "Requirements", to read as follows: 

All emergency alarm control panels shall be UL 2017 or UL 864 Listed. All 
sensors shall be UL 2075 Listed. All Detection and Alarm systems shall be · 
powered and supervised as required for fire alarm·systems NF~A 72. Secondary 
power supplies shall be calculated for 24~hours equipment standby time plus 
emergen-cy standby duration calculated for the longest modeled release rate or 5-
minutes, whichever· is the longest duration. Visual alarms shall be blue. 

19. Section 4905 .of the c ·alifornia ·Fire Code is amended by adding Section 4905.2.1 
entitled nVVood Roof Covering ·Prohibited, 11 to read as follo'NS: 

54 
0000 142278C031 



· No 'IIOod roof covering material shall be ·installed on any·structure located in the 
· Extreme Hazard, _High, Hazard;. or Moderate Hazard Fire ~severity-Zones· as · ·: 

identified by the _Pasadena . Fire Department. · 
, . . ~ ' . . - - . . 
Section ·.1 008.1.10 of. the 2016 California . Fire Code is amended by deleting the .. 
exception. · · ~ · 

20. Section 4906.2 is amended by changing lt_em 2 to read as fQIIov:s: 

Land designated as Moderate, High and Very ·High Fi~ Hazard Severity Zone 
lJY cities and other local agencies. · . __ · 

. Section 2403.2 of the 2016 California Fire Code is amended to read as follows: 

Tents and membrane structures having.an area in ·excess of 1-00 square feet (9.5· 
m2

) shall not be erected, operated ·or ·maintained for any purpose without first 
obtaining· a permit and approval from the fire code official. . 

·Exceptions: 

1. Tents used exclusively for recreational camping purposes .. 

I . 

21. ·.section~ 2701 of the 2016 California Fire Code is amended by adding~ Section 
5001 ~6.1.12701 ~6.1.1; · entitled'"Temporary Facility Closure," to read ·a~ fpllows:· .- · ·. 

• - • -,_' - 1 • • -·, ., ' • 

Unless otherwise specified, a temporary.facility closure shall last not mp.r~ than 180 
calendar days. 'fhe fire code official may authorize one .180 calendar day eXtensi,ort 

22. Sectioh.aoo3 2703 of the 2016 California Fire Co.de is &mended by adc:Ung_Section. 
5003.2.9.3,2703~2.·9.3 entitled "Minimum lesting," to rea~ as follows: . ·. . . . . 

At a minimum, all. tanks, primary storag~, secondary.contai,nment, monitoring systems, . . 
release prevention and .' mitigation systems,. and other'safety 'e·quiprilent or systems 'for ·:. 
the storage, use or handling of any hazardous material shall be tested for proper- · · · . 
functiol'1 as described by m~rJufa~ture(s or des·ig_n specifiqation, whichever is mo~e. , . · (: 
stringent~- prior to ~he ~introduction of a hazardous ·mat~ rial. 
. . 

· . {23. The first paragraph of Section 5704.2·:·1.4 3404:2.7.4 ofth·e~-2016 C~liforni~ Fire 
Code is· amendeq to read as follows: , · · . . - · . · . . . . .. _. . .. . . 

Stationary, above-ground tanks shaU· be equipped with additional venting·that will relieve 
excessive interpal pressure caused by exp9sure to Jires .. ·Emergency venting devices 
shall be. listed and -approved ... Emergency vents:for:Ciass I,. II and IIA liquids .shall· 
not discharge inside ·buildings·. T~is.re.quirement shall also apply to eaGh . . 
compartment of a compartmentaliz~<;t tank, th~ interstitial space. (annulus) of a . . . 
secondary containment-type tank and· th~ endosecj space of t~nl<s of closed-top dike ... 
construction~ .. Emergency venting devices shall be listed and approved. Emergency 

'55 
0000142278C031 



vents for Class ·1,.11 and lilA liquids shall n_ot discharge inside buildings. Additionally, this 
requirement shall apply to spaces or enclosed volumes, such as those intended for 

· insulation, membranes or weather shields that can contain liquid because ·of a leak from 
· the primary vessel or can inhibit venting during fire exposure. The insulation, membrane 
. -or weather shield shall not interfere with emergency venting. The· venting shall be 

installed and maintained in accordance with Section 22.7 of NFPA 30. 

24. Section 5704.2~7.5.8'3404.2.7.5.8 of the 2016 California Fire Code is amended, by 
deleting the exception. 

25. Section 5704.2.8.14 3404.2.8.14 of the 2016 California Fire Code is amended to 
read as follows: 

Emergency vents shall be vapor tight and shall not be allowed to discharge inside the 
vault. Long-bolt manhole covers shall not be allowed for this purpose. . . 

·-
26. Section 5704.2.9.6.1 3404.2.9.6.1 of the 2016 California Fire Code is amended to 
read as follows: 

Storage·of Class I and II liquids in above~ground storage tanks outside of buildings is 
prohibited within the City of Pas~dena. 

27. Section 5706.2.4.4 3406.2.4.4 of the 2016 California Fire Code is amended to read 
as follows: 

. . . I . . . . . . 

T~e storage of Class l'and ll.liquids in above-ground storage tanks outside· of buildings. 
is p-rohibited within the City of Pasadena. · · · 

. . 

28. Section .58Q6.2 3so6.2 of the 2016 California Fire· Code is amended to read as. / 
follows: 

Storage of flammable c·ry_ogenic fluids in stationary containers outsid~ of b-uildings is 
prohibited within the City of Pasadena. · · · · · · 

29. Section 6101.3 3801.3 of the 2016 California Fire Code is amended to read.as. 
follows;,· . · 

Where a single container is more than 20 gallons ·(75. 7 L) in-water capacity;. or the · ' · 
aggregate water capacity of LP-gas- containers is more than 40 gallons (151 L), the 
·installer shall submit construction documents for such installation. 

') ·:-

30.· Section &1-Q4 3801 of the 2016 California Fire Code is amended by adding Section· 
6101.4 3801.4, entitled "Minimum Testing,"·to read as follows: '-.._/ 

At a :m·inimum, all tanks·;· primary storage, secondary containment, monit~ring systems, . 
release prevention and mitigation·.systems, and other safety equipment or systems for .. 
the storage, use or handling of any hazardous material shall be· tested for proper. 
function as described by manufacturer's or design s·pecification, whichever is more 
stringent, prior to the ·introdu-ction of a hazardous material. 

56 
0000142278C031 · 



31. Section 6104.2 3804.2 of the· 2016 California Fire C'ode is amended to read as 
follows: 

' . ... 

Within the City of Pasadena, the aggregate capacity of any one installation s·hall .riot 
exceed a w~ter c~pacity of 2,000 gallons (7570 L). 

32. Appendix A of the California Fi~ Code is deleted in its entirety ... ,. 

· Section 3804~2 of the .2016 California ·Fire Code is amended by changing the first 
paragraph to read as .follows: . 

An approved emergency voice/alarm comuunication .system shall be ·provided in 
every existing high-rise building which exceeds 75 feet (22860 mml in· height 
·measure in the manner set foith in Section 403 of the California Building Code. . · 
Such system shall provide commu·nication from :a location available to and 
desig.nated by the· fire code o~icial to not less t~an all public· areas. · 

. . . ' . . . . . . . 

33. Exception 1 in Section B1 05.2 of Appendix B of the California Fire Code is amended 
to 'read as follov:s:· · · · · · · · · 

1. /\ reduction in required fire flo)N of up to 50 percent, as approved, is allo'Ned 'Nhen the 
building is provided v:ith ·an.approved automatic sprinkler system installed in . . · .· ·· 

, . . .. . I 

accordance- \\'ith Section 903.3-;1..1 or 903.3.1.2. The resulting fire flo\\' shall riot ·be less 
than 1 ,5oo· gallons per hour (5678 b/min) for the .prescribed duration as specified in 
Table 8105.1. 

Section 4901 of the 2016 California Fire Code is amended by adding Section·· 
4901.1.1, entitled "Referenced Standard," to read as follows: 

The International Wildland-Urban Interface Code, 2009 edition is adopted as a 
referenced standard for the enforcement of this chapter and other related · 
sections of the . Fire Code. Where conflicts occur between the provisions of 
adopted codes and the referenced standard the provisions of the adopted codes 
shall apply. 

34. Section D1 03.6 of Appendix D of the California Fire Code is am.ended to read as · 
foiiO\\'S: 

VVhere re:quired by th~ fire cope official, fire . apparatus acces~ roads shall be . marked 
'Nith permanent NO PARKING FIRE .bANE si.gns· complying 'IJith the. current · · · · .. 
specifications mairltained by the Pasadena Department qf Public VVqrks .. . · · 

Section 4905.2.1 .of the 2016· California Fire Code is amended by adding Section ... 
491 0.1.1.1, entitled "Wood Roof Covering Prohibited," to read as follows: 

. . . ' . 

No wood roof covering material shall be installed on any structure located in ·the·· 
Extreme ·Hazard, High Hazard or Moderate Hazard Fire Severity Zones as 
identified by the Pasadena Fire Department. 

57 
0000142278C031 



35. Appendix J is deleted in its entirety.· · 

Section 4906.2 of the 2016 California Fire Code is amended by changing item 2 to 
read as follows: · 

Land designated as Moderate,. High and Very .High Fire ·Hazard Severity Zone by 
cities and other local agencies. 

36. Appendix A of the 2016 California Fire Code is deleted in its entire~y. 
I 

37 .Exception 1 in Section 8105.2 of Appendix 8 of the 2016 California Fire Code 
is amended to read as follows: 

1. A reduction in required fire-flow of up to 50 percent, as approved, is allowed · 
when the building is provided with an approved automatic sprinkler system 
installed in accordance with Section 903.3. 1'.1 or 903.3.1.2. The resulting fire-flow 
shall not be less than 1,500 gallons per hour (5678 Urn in) for the prescribed· 
duration as specified in Table 8105.1. Table 8105.2 is amended by replacing 
"25o/o" with "50°/o" wherever "25o/o." appears in the Table. · 

38. Section 0103.6 of Appendix D of the 2016 California Fire Code is· amended to 
read as follows: 

Where required by the fire code official, fire apparatu's access roads shall be 
marked with permanent NO PARKING-FIRE LANE signs complying with the 
current specifications maintained by the Pasadena Department of Public Works. 

39. Appendices. J through M of the 2016 California Fire Code are deleted in their · 
entirety. 

B. By amending Section 14.28.040 to read a~ follows: 

14.28.040 - Board of appeals. 

All sections in the respective 2016 codes pertaining to the board of appeals are hereby 
amended in their entirety to read as follows: 

In order to hear and decide appeals or orders and determine the suitability of alternate 
materials and methods of construction and to provide for reasonable interpretations of 
the provisions of these codes, there shall be and there is hereby created a board of 
appeals, composed of the mayor and the city council. The city clerk shall be the 
secretary to the board. The board may adopt reasonable rules and regulations for 
conducting its investigations and shall renqer all its decisions and findings on contested 
matters·,· in writing to. the building official, with a duplicate copy thereof to any appellant. 
or contestant affected by any such decision of findings, and may recommend to the city 
council such new lkgislation, if any, as is consistent therewith. . . · 

58 
0000 142278C031 \ 



c 
The city co~,ncil may prescribe by resolution, to employ ~t the cost and exp~nse of the 
city, such qualified individuals as the board, in its discretion, may deem· reason~bly 
necessary in order to assist it in its in'vestigations and in making its findings and 
decisions. 

·SECTION 5. This ordinance shall take effect 30 days after its publication. 

Signed and approved this ___ day of----~ 2016 

Terry Tornek 

Mayor of the City of Pasadena 

I HEREBY CERTIFY that the foregoing ordinance was adopted by the City Council of . 
the City of Pasadena at its meeting held this _ _ day of , 2016, by the following 
vote: 

Ayes . 

Noes 

Absent 

Abstain 

Date Published: · 

F ank L. Rhemrev 
ssistant City Attorney 

0000142278C031 
59 

Mark Jomsky, CMC 
City Clerk 


