
Agenda Report 

TO: CITY COUNCIL DATE: OCTOBER 17,2005 

FROM: CITY MANAGER 

SUBJECT: CALL FOR REVIEW OF CONDITIONAL USE PERMIT #4419, 
1355 LINCOLN AVENUE 

RECOMMENDATION: 

It is recommended that the City Council: 

1. Acknowledge that this action is categorically exempt from CEQA; and 

2. Disapprove the Conditional Use Permit applications for Transportation Dispatch 
Facility (vehicle towing) and Vehicle Storage. 

EXECUTIVE SUMMARY: 

The applicant is requesting a Conditional Use Permit approval to allow vehicle towing 
and vehicle storage at 1335 Lincoln Avenue in conjunction with an existing vehicle 
repair business (Paul's Auto). This case has been active for two years during which the 
applicant knowingly operated the business without city approval, failed to pay citations 
issued by the city, and did not implement measures to respond to neighborhood 
concerns. 

Recently the applications were disapproved by the Zoning Hearing Officer due to 
negative impacts on the adjacent residential neighborhood. On appeal, the applications 
were approved by the Board of Zoning Appeals who found that the neighborhood's 
concerns could be mitigated with a series of conditions (Attachments B and C) such as 
painting and fencing. 

The community concerns raised at the public hearing in 2003 and again with the Zoning 
Hearing Officer in 2005 include: I) truck traffic travels through the adjacent residential 
neighborhood; and 2) vehicle repair and storage on the s~te is unscreened from public 
view. At the time that these issues were initially raised two years ago, the staff report 
included several conditions of approval to mitigate the negative impacts. The conditions 
included new walls to screen vehicles, paint, and landscaping. Although the application 
was withdrawn, the applicant continued to operate the business and could have 
implemented the recommendations in an effort to be a good neighbor. During the last 
two years however, only a hand-full of the improvements, such as painting the buildings 
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(partially done), removing barbed wire (partially done), and new 'slurry seal' in the 
parking lot, have been implemented. 

The approval decision was called for review by the City Council on September 22, 2005. 
Staff continues to recommend disapproval of both applications. 

BACKGROUND: 

The applicant first submitted for a Conditional Use Permit in 2003 for Vehicle Storage 
(see Attachment E for chronology). The Zoning Hearing Officer approved the 
application on November 19, 2003. Several neighbors opposed the application and 
appealed the decision. Upon informing the applicant's representative of the appeal, 
staff was informed that the applicant had chosen to withdraw the application. 

However, the applicant proceeded to operate the towing service anyway, without the 
required Conditional Use Permit. Code Enforcement staff cited the applicant for not 
obtaining the Conditional Use Permit prior to opening. The Code Enforcement 
Commission found that there were grounds to require the cessation of the towing 
business, but the applicant appealed that decision, pending the submission and hearing 
of the current Conditional Use Permit application. 

Per the City's rules on appeals, the applicant has been allowed to continue the towing 
operation in the meantime. 

ANALYSIS: 

Cmditional Use Permit - Tran-atch Facility. 

The applicant has a contract with the American Automobile Association (AAA) to 
dispatch tow trucks. These tow trucks spend the majority of the day in the field and are 
only on-site if a vehicle they are towing is to be repaired on site, or if the vehicle does 
not have a specific location to be towed to and therefore must be kept at the site until it 
can be transferred. At night, the drivers take the tow trucks to their respective 
residences. The vehicles are dispatched from an office that has one desk and one 
computer. The computer receives the vehicle information from AAA and then a driver is 
dispatched. 

The site is in an area developed with commercial and light industrial uses along Lincoln 
Avenue and single-family uses immediately to the west. The commercial and industrial 
uses in the area include building material and service uses and restricted industrial 
uses. The zoning district designation, CG-1, is similar to the General Commercial 
zoning designation, but includes addition land use regulations relating to large trucks 
(defined by the Zoning Code as weighing 10,000 pounds or more, unladen), intended to 
buffer the single-family residential areas from the commercial activity along Lincoln 
Avenue. These land use regulations restrict the operation of such large trucks to 
between 6 A.M. and 7 P.M. 

However, based on the past operations on the subject site, the proposed operation 
would have a negative impact on the surrounding neighborhood. For example, photos 
submitted to staff show tow trucks parked on residential streets and vehicles kept 
outside of the facility adjacent to public streets. Additional concerns raised by residents 
include trucks exiting the site on Washington Boulevard, turning left, and traveling 
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through the residential neighborhood. Although the applicant has known about this 
concern of the neighbors, residents have testified that truck drivers continue to travel 
through the neighborhood. 

The November 2003 staff report recommended several conditions to help improve the 
look and operation of the site. As noted above, the applicant withdrew this application 
and began operating the vehicle dispatch operation. However, in the time since the 
business opened, the site has not been significantly improved. Essentially, the 
applicant has known of several maintenance issues the City had recommended to 
improve the site (new walls, new painting, landscaping, etc.) but as of this point very 
little has been done. 

Staff has received a variety of information from the applicant regarding the position that 
both the vehicle towing and vehicle storage are legal, non-conforming uses. Staff 
acknowledges that towing was a part of the business up until 1995, as stated by the 
previous owner, Bob Grossman in his declaration (submitted to the Board of Zoning 
Appeals). As a result, vehicles were towed by other towing companies to the site, 
presumably for repair. However, records do not show that the Paul's Auto continued to 
provide a towing service such that tow trucks were dispatched from the site, or that 
Paul's Auto itself provided a towing service. Therefore, it is staff's position that the 
towing operation at the site was discontinued in 1995 (per Mr. Grossman's declaration) 
and therefore cannot be re-established without compliance with the City's Zoning Code, 
specifically, approval of a Conditional Use Permit. 

The applicant's representative has said that at the recent Board of Zoning Appeals 
hearing, the Board determined that the use was legal, non-conforming. However, staff 
has reviewed the audio tapes from the hearing and confirmed that while the discussion 
on this topic did occur, no motion was made to find the towing service use a legal, non- 
conforming. If such use were a legal, nonconforming use, there would be no need for 
the Board of Zoning Appeals to approve the use permit for the towing service. 

Conditional Use Permit - Vehicle Storaqe. 

According to the applicant, vehicles are towed to the site because they either need 
repair; or they are stored temporarily until the owners find an alternative location. In 
order to keep the vehicles on-site, or stored, a Conditional Use Permit must be 
obtained. 

The area proposed for vehicle storage is the rear of the property, adjacent to 
Washington Boulevard. This rear area is gated and fenced with dilapidated materials. 
Because of the deteriorated condition of the fencing, vehicles are not adequately 
screened from public view and a negative appearance is the result. Even so, photos 
submitted to staff at prior hearings show vehicles not being stored in the rear of the 
property, but instead being kept outside of the fences next to the sidewalk. The 
applicant has stated that these are isolated cases; however documentation from the 
neighbors shows that these incidents occurred over a period of several months when 
the applicant was aware of the neighborhood's concern. 
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ENVIRONMENTAL DETERMINATION: 

This project has been determined to be exempt from environmental review pursuant to 
the guidelines of the California Environmental Quality Act (Public Resources Code 
§21080(b)(9); Administrative Code, Title 14, Chapter 3, Class I §I 5301, Existing 
Facilities). 

FISCAL IMPACT: 

The disapproval of this project is not expected to have a financial impact as no 
additional reviews will be necessary. 

Respectfully submit ed, 

g& 
City ~ana'ger 

Associate Planner 

Approved by: 

~ l a n n i u a n d  Development Department 

Attachments: 

A. Specific Findings for Conditional Use Permit #419 
B. Board of Zoning Appeals Specific Findings for Conditional Use Permit #4419 
C. Board of Zoning Appeals Conditions Of Approval for Conditional Use Permit #4419 
D. Department of Public Works Conditions Of Approval for Conditional Use Permit 

#44 1 9 
E. Chronology 
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